
Additional Information 

July 22,2009
 
Work Session
 

Item #5 



2006 IBC Adoption 

•	 The 2006 International Energy Conservation Code will be ofgreat benefit, if 
approved for any future Federal Energy Grants, or Recovery Act Grants. 

•	 The State Legislature is considering a 5-year moratorium on the adoption ofany 
new building codes by municipalities. 

•	 Sedona, Clarkdale, and Yavapai County are on the 2006 and Cottonwood is in the 
process of adopting the 2006 codes. This will enable better cooperation between 
the Town, Yavapai County and other municipalities. It will simplify construction 
for all builders in the Verde Valley being under the same common Code system. 

•	 The 2006 code is the 3rd generation ofthe I codes and is easier to use and 
understand for contractors and is more user-friendly for the home owner to use. 

•	 Yavapai County and to the best ofmy knowledge other municipalities will skip 
the 2009 codes and it will not be necessary to re-visit this issue until 2013. 

•	 The cost is minimal, technical books only. The technical books will be available 
to the public at the Community Development Dept and I believe a copy will also 
be available at the Public Library and they are also available on-line for a fee. 

•	 Yavapai County and the Town of Camp Verde are considering an IGA between 
their Building Dept and OUTS. To provide inspection coverage for each other 
when necessary; For informal 'advice and consult' services from Jack Judd, Chief 
Building Official in the absence of a certified Building Official for the Town of 
Camp Verde; Possible formation of a Regional Board of Appeals for the Verde 
Valley, enabling a greater pool for qualified individuals to serve on this Board; 
For Town Building Staff to be able to shadow County Plans Examiners learn their 
system and incorporate applicable portions of the same into the Town system. All 
this would be greatly facilitated with a common Code reference, for assistance in 
Plan Review for any large commercial projects that may come to Camp Verde at 
minimal cost to the Town. 

•	 Each Code has it's own Administration Section and by deleting those from 
adoption and creating a common Administration Section it alleviates any possible 
confusion in the interpretation and implementation of the codes. 

•	 It is very common for each municipality and region to make amendments to the 
code to reflect their unique geographical and climate conditions. The technical 
amendments proposed are minimum. They were copied from the Yavapai County 
Resolution by former Building Official Rick Feldman, and copied from Mr. 
Feldman's draft Resolution by consultant Bert Stone into our Resolution. They fit 
into our specific region and many are designed to be more accommodating to 
small business owners. 

•	 May improve the Town's BCEGS insurance rating, and lower certain insurance 
costs for the Town. 

Community Development Staff 



Ie.\' r::.wYOtW~ ....

C13~Ol/stY~ ~y_ ihop~1J

AGENDA

SPECIALIWORK SESSION
MAYOR and COMMON COUNCIL

of the
TOWN OF CAMP VERDE

COUNCIL CHAMBERS
473 S. Main Street, Ste. 106
Wednesday, JULY 22, 2009

6:30 p.m.

1. Call to Order

2. Roll Call

3. Pledge of Allegiance

4. Discussion, consideration and possible direction to staff concerning negotiations on the terms of aproposed
Intergovernmental Agreement with the Camp Verde Fire District to provide Fire Safety Code reviews for
commercial and/or residential buildings. Note: Council may vote to go into executive session pursuant to ARS §38­
431.02(A)(4) for discussion or consultation with designated representatives in order to consider Council's position and instruct its
representatives regarding negotiations on the intergovernmental agreement and ARS §38-431.02(A)(3) for discussion or
consultation with the attorney for legal advice. (Staff Resource: Michael Jenkins)

5. Discussion of the following, which may also include direction staff:
• Elements involved in adopting the 2006 International Code Council Codes and related Public Codes, the

Technical Code Amendments and Administrative Building Code and how these provisions will be utilized,
if adopted, to regulate construction activity within the Town limits. (Staff Resource: Michael Jenkins)

6. Adjournment

Posted by: djlMc...... ~.J!/k? DatelTime: '7-/'/ ..() 7' g: ( fr a.. /)",
Note: Pursuant to AR.S. §38-431.03.A.3, the Council may vote to go into Executive Session for purposes ofconsultation for legal advice with the Town Attorney
on any matter listed on the Agenda, or discussion ofrecords exempt by law from public inspection associated with an agenda item.

The Town ofCamp Verde Council Chambers is accessible to the handicapped. Those with special accessibility or accommodation needs, such as large typeface
print, may request these at the Office of the Town Clerk.



TOWN OF CAMP VERDE
Agenda Action Form

Meeting Date: July 22, 2009
D Consent Agenda ~ Regular Business

Reference Document: NA

M~eting Type: Special Session

Agenda Title (be exact): Discussion, consideration and possible direction to staff concerning negotiations on the terms of a
proposed Intergovernmental Agreement with the Camp Verde Fire District to provide Fire Safety Code reviews and
inspections for Commercial and I or Residential bUildings.

Purpose and Background Information: The Town and the Fire District currently have an Intergovernmental agreement in
place. Over the past year it has been realized that the agreement needed to be broadened to accommodate additional
services needed by the Town from the Fire District. Those additional services will be discussed and brought forward to the
Council at a later date. It is staffs request, at this time, to receive legal council and direction from the Council on negotiating
the terms of the Intergovernmental Agreement.

Recommendation (Suggested Motion): NA
1. Staff Direction.

2. Finance Review: D Budgeted D Unbudgeted ~ N/A

Finance Director Comments/Fund: N/A

Attorney Review: ~Yes DNo DN/A

Attorney Comments: Forth comming

Submitting Department: Community Development Department

Contact Person: Michael Jenkins
Action Report prepared by: Michael Jenkins

vjones
Back to Top



TOWN OF CAMP VERDE
Agenda Action Form

Meeting Date: July 22, 2009
D Consent Agenda [8] Regular Business

Meeting Type: Work Session

Reference Documents: Draft Ordinance 2009-A359, Draft Ordinance 2009-A361, Draft Resolution 2009-767 and Draft
Resolution 2009-769. Draft Technical Code Amendments and Draft Administrative BUilding Code.

Agenda Title (be exact):
Discussion of the Mayor and Common Council ofthe Town Camp Verde, Yavapai County, Arizona regarding the elements
involved in adopting the 2006 International Code Council Codes and Related Public Codes, the Technical Code Amendments
and Administrative Building Code and how these provisions will be utilized, if adopted, to regulate construction activity within
the Town of Camp Verde limits.

Purpose and Background Information:
During the Regular Session of May 27, 2009, Council requested four (4) items concerning the proposed adoption of the 2006
International Code Council Codes (Codes) and Amendments, be pulled for discussion ata future work session. In our prior haste to
move forward with the adoption of the Codes, staff failed to appreciate Council's desire to obtain amore thorough understanding of the
elements involved with this adoption. With that said, staff would like to apologize for our disregard and provide to Council, a
comprehensive analysis regarding all aspects of the Codes adoption lilnd answer any questions that you may have.

After recommendation from our Building Consultant, Stantec, and through staffs research 9f what Codes other cities/towns/counties
currently have adopted, it was found that the Town of Camp Verde is one of few still using the 2003 International Code Council Codes
and Related Public Codes (Codes). Adopting the 2006 Codes along with the Technical Code Amendments and the Administrative
Building Code will enable the Town of Camp Verde to simplify the utilization and administration of the more current Code requirements
to regulate construction activity.

The Technical Code Amendments were created and are used in conjunction with the adopted 2006 ICC Codes. Portions ofeach 2006
ICC Code are extracted and modified to fit our Community's special circumstances. In most cases, when government entities are
adopting new Building Codes, amending the codes to fit an individual community's needs, is common practice.

The Administrative BUilding Code was created as an advantage, allowing staff to utilize one tool in which to administer the Codes. The
majority of our current Codes have administrative guidelines, which are all similar in nature, but not all read the same different. By
combining the administrative provisions of each code into one document, simplifies the process of permitting and enforcement. The
Administrative BUilding Code would be one encompassing code that addresses common issues, including, permit validity and permit
extensions, and enforcement in regard to illegal building activity and dangerous buildings. In addition, the Administrative Building
Code's inclusion in the Town Code, will provide easy accessibility by the pUblic through our website, as currently, the Codes can only
be viewed through the Code Books available in the Building Department office and at the Town's Library.

Additional items include, 1.) Remaining with the currently adopted 2003 International Fire Code in conjunction with the Camp Verde
Fire District through our Intergovernmental Agreement (IGA); 2.) Removing the 2003 International Property Maintenance Code and
using the 2006 International Codes and Related Codes, Technical Amendments and the Administrative Building Code, to envelop
these requirements; 3.) Adopting the 2006 International Existing Building Code to administer requirements in regard to existing
buildings, that are not covered under the current Codes; 4.) Adopting the 2006 International Energy Conservation Code, giving the
Town of Camp Verde aguide to administer provisions for current innovations in the field of energy conservation.



Recommendation (Suggested Motion):
1. Move to direct staff to prepare Ordinances and/or Resolutions for consideration at afuture Council Session, in adopting

the 2006 International Code Council Codes and Related Public Codes, the Technical Code Amendments and the
Administrative Building Code.

Finance Review:D Budgeted D Unbudgeted ~ N/A

Finance Director Comments/Fund: N/A

Attorney Review:

Attorney Comments: N/A

DYes DNo ~N/A

Submitting Department: Building Department

Contact Person: Becky Oium

Action Report prepared by: B. Oium

vjones
Back to Top



DRAFT ORD 2009 A359
JULY 22, 2009

ORDINANCE 2009-A359

AN ORDINANCE OF THE MAYOR AND COMMON COUNCIL OF THE TOWN OF CAMP
VERDE, YAVAPAI COUNTY, ARIZONA, ADOPTING BY REFERENCE THE 2006

INTERNATIONAL CODE COUNCIL CODES, (ICC), AND RELATED PUBLIC CODES,
AND THE "TOWN OF CAMP VERDE TECHNICAL CODE AMENDMENTS", AMENDING
TOWN CODE CHAPTER 7 - BUILDING, ARTICLE 7-1, AND ADDING SECTION 7-1­

100, ESTABLISHING FEE SCHEDULES, AND PROSCRIBING PENALTIES FOR
VIOLATIONS THEREOF.

WHEREAS, the Town Council adopted Ordinance 2004-A274 on March 3, 2004, Chapter 7 ­
Building, Article 7-1, Adoption of the 2003 International Code Council Codes, (ICC) and
Related Public Code To es .. in nd proscribing
penalties·for violatio ',!i>f,

;1
WHEREAS, the To o:wll ... . nding Ordinance 2004-
A274, adopting by r th'~2003 "tt natio I lumbing C e, (IPC), and 2003
International Building Code Appendix J - Grading, establishing fee schedules, and
proscribing penalties for violations thereof, and

WHEREAS, it is in the best interest of the Town council and staff in preserving the public
health safety and welfare, to replace the currently established 2003 International Code
Council Codes, (ICC), and Related Public Codes, with the 2006 International Code Council
Codes, (ICC), and Related ,PUblic Codes, and

WHEREAS, it is in the best interest of the Town council and staff in preserving the public
health safety and welfare, to adopt the "Town of Camp Verde Technical Code Amendments
Chapter 7 - Building, Article 7-1, Adding Section 7-1-100, of the Town of Camp Verde
Code", three copies of which are on file in the office of Community Development, which
document was made public record by Resolution No. 2009-767, and

WHEREAS, the International Code Council Codes and related codes as set forth in this
ordinance, together with all future amendments, revisions, and modifications as issued by
the respective publishing agencies, upon adoption of this ordinance, shall be kept on file
with the Town Clerk, and the Building Department,

NOW THEREFORE, THE MAYOR AND COMMON COUNCIL OF THE TOWN OF
CAMP VERDE RESOLVE TO ADOPT BY REFERENCE AND CHANGE THE TOWN CODE
AS FOLLOWS:



ORD 2007 A359
MAY 23 2007

Section 1. Chapter 7 - Building, Article 7-1, Adoption of the 2003 International Code
Council Codes (ICC), and related public codes of the Town Code is amended to read:

CHAPTER 7
BUILDING
Article 7-1

ADOPTION OF THE~ 2006 INTERNATIONAL CODE COUNCIL CODES, (ICC)
AND RELATED PUBLIC CODES

PURSUANT TO ARS §9-802 (AS AMENDED), THE TOWN HEREBY ADOPTS FOR
APPLICATION AND ENFORCEMENT FOR ALL CONSTRUCTION WITHIN TOWN LIMITS THE
FOLLOWING CODES HERETOFORE IN EXISTENCE, TOGETHER WITH ALL FUTURE
AMENDMENTS, REVISIONS, AND MODIFICATIONS AS ISSUED BY THE RESPECTIVE
PUBLISHING AGENCIES.

1. ~ 2006 INTERNATIONAL CODE COUNCIL CODES, PUBLISHED BY THE
INTERNATIONAL CODE COUNCIL INCORPORATED,~ 2006 EDmON.

2. 2003 INTERNATIONAL CODE COUNCIL CODE STANDARDS, PUBLISHED BY THE
INTERNATIONAL CODE COUNCIL INCORPORATED, (ICC), 2003

3.

4. ~20061
CODE COUN

,f PUBLIS BY THE INTERNATIONAL
"' 2006 ED ON.

5. ~ 2006 INTERNATIONAL MECHANICAL CODE, PUBLISHED BY THE
INTERNATIONAL CODE COUNCIL INCORPORATED, (ICC),~ 2006 EDmON.

6. 2003 INTERNATIONAL PROPERTY ~4AINTENANCE CODE, PUBLISHED BY THE
INTERNATIONAL CODE COUNCIL INCORPORATED, (ICC), 2003 EDmON.

7. 2006 INTERNATIONAL PLUMBING CODE, PUBLISHED BY THE INTERNATIONAL
CODE COUNCIL INCORPORATED, (ICC), 2006 EDmON.

8. 2003 INTERNATIONAL PRIVATE SEWAGE DISPOSAL CODE, PUBLISHED BY THE
INTERNATIONAL CODE COUNCIL INCORPORATED, (ICC), 2003 EDmON.

9. ~ 2005 NATIONAL ELECTRICAL CODE, PUBLISHED BY THE NATIONAL FIRE
PROTECTION ASSOCIATION,~ 2005 EDmON.

10.~ 2006 INTERNATIONAL RESIDENTIAL CODE, PUBLISHED BY THE
INTERNATIONAL CODE COUNCIL INCORPORATED, (ICC),~ 200G EDmON.

11. NATIONAL FIRE PROTECTION ASSOCIATION STANDARDS, PUBLISHED BY THE
NATIONAL FIRE PROTECTION ASSOCIATION, 2002 EDmON.

20F5



ORO 2007 A359
MAY 23 2007

12. 2003 INTERNATIONAL BUILDING CODE AST~4 REFERENCED STANDARDS,
PUBLISHED BY THE A~4ERlCAN SOCIETY FOR TESTING & ~4ATERIALS, 2003
EDmON.

13. 2003 INTERNATIONAL PLU~4BING CODE, PUBLISHED BY THE INTERNATIONAL
CODE COUNCIL INCORPORATED, (ICC), 2003 EDmON.

14. 2003 INTERNATIONAL BUILDING CODE, APPENDIX J GRADING, PUBLISHED BY
THE INTERNATIONAL CODE COUNCIL INCORPORATED, (ICC), 2003 EDmON.

15. AND A~4ENm4ENTS 2006 EXISTING BUILDING CODE, PUBLISHED BY THE
INTERNATIONAL CODE COUNCIL INCORPORATED, CICC), 2006 EDmON.

16. 2006 INTERNATIONAL ENERGY CONSERVATION CODE, PUBLISHED BY
THE INTERNATIONAL CODE COUNCIL INCORPORATED, (ICC), 2006
EDmON.

17. AND AMENDMENTS

THE EFFEcnVE DATE OF THE ORDINANCE SHALL BE APRIL 2,2001 SEPTEMBER 1,
2009, AFTER WHICH ALL NEW CONSTRUcnON AND WORK IN PROGRESS SHALL MEET
THE STANDARDS SET FORTH IN THE ICC AND THE ABOVE-RELATED CODES.

THE TOWN COUNCI !~'~I~~ON AND

~~~~~~~~~"il'll:,Uf RECOMMENDATION OF

AT LEAST THREE (3) COPIES OF THE ICC AND THE ABOVE CODES, AND ANY FUTURE
AMENDMENTS OR REVISIONS, SHALL BE KEPT ON FILE IN THE COMMUNITY
DEVELOPMENT DEPARTMENT. ALL COPIES SHALL BE READILY AVAILABLE FOR
INSPEcnON, INCLUDING ANY SUPPLEMENTARY PAMPHLETS OR EXPLANATORY
BOOKLETS FOR DISTRIBUTION TO THE PUBLIC.

IT SHALL BE UNLAWFUL FOR ANY PERSON, FIRM, OR CORPORATION TO ERECT,
CONSTRUCT, ENLARGE, ALTER, REPAIR, MOVE, IMPROVE, REMOVE, CONVERT OR
DEMOLISH, EQUIP, USE, OCCUpy OR MAINTAIN ANY BUILDING OR STRUCTURE OR CAUSE
OR PERMIT THE SAME TO BE DONE IN VIOLATION OF ANY STANDARD OR PROVISION OF
THE t:ffiC ICC AND ABOVE RELATED CODES, INCLUDING THEIR SUBSEQUENT REVISIONS
AND MODIFICATIONS. VIOLATIONS FOR A FIRST OFFENSE, PER SITE.oR PER PERSON,
SHALL BE A PETrY OFFENSE AND FOR ANY SECOND OR SUBSEQUENT OFFENSE
COMMmED WITHIN TWELVE (12) MONTHS OF ANY PRIOR CITATION OR CONVIcnON, A
CLASS 2 MISDEMEANOR.

IN ADDmON TO THE CRIMINAL PENALTIES, THE COURT, UPON CONVlcnON, MAY
ORDER ABATEMENT OR REMOVAL OF THE CONSTRUcnON, AND ISSUE APPROPRIATE
INJUNcnVE RELIEF. THE DIRECTOR OF CO~4~4UNITY DEVELOP~4ENT BUILDING
OFFICIAL SHALL ISSUE NO FINAL CERTIFICATE OF OCCUPANCY UNTIL THE
CONSTRUcnON OR AcnON DESCRIBED IN THIS PARAGRAPH HAS BEEN INSPECTED AND
SHOWN TO MEET ALL ICC AND RELATED CODE REQUIREMENTS, AND ALL FEES TO THE
TOWN PAID.

30F5



ORD 2007 A359
MAY 23 2007

THE €HlEF BUILDING OFFICIAL, AS DEFINED IN ARTICLE SECTION ~£ZEZ(r~, SHALL
BE THE ADMINISTRATIVE AUTHORITY DULY APPOINTED TO ENFORCE THESE CODES.

ANY PERSON FOUND GUILTY OF VIOLATING ANY PROVISION OF THIS ORDINANCE SHALL
BE GUILTY OF A CLASS 2 MISDEMEANOR. EACH DAY THAT A VIOLATION CONTINUES
SHALL BE A SEPARATE OFFENSE AND PUNISHABLE AS A SEPARATE OFFENSE.

THE EFFECTIVE DATE OF THE ORDINANCE SHALL BE APRIL 2, 2001 SEPTEMBER 1,
2009, AFTER WHICH ALL NEW CONSTRUCTION AND WORK IN PROGRESS SHALL MEET
THE STANDARDS SET FORTH IN THE ICC AND THE ABOVE-RELATED CODES.

THE TOWN COUNCIL SHALL ADOPT FEE SCHEDULES FOR INSPECTION AND
CERTIFICATION UNDER THE CODES FROM TIME TO TIME, UPON RECOMMENDATION
OF THE COMMUNITY DEVELOPMENT DIRECTOR.

AT LEAST THREE (3) COPIES OF THE ICC AND THE ABOVE CODES, AND ANY FUTURE
AMENDMENTS OR REVISIONS, SHALL BE KEPT ON FILE IN THE COMMUNITY
DEVELOPMENT DEPARTMENT. ALL COPIES SHALL BE READILY AVAILABLE FOR
INSPECTION, INCLUDING ANY SUPPLEMENTARY PAMPHLETS OR EXPLANATORY
BOOKLETS FOR DISTRIBUTION TO THE PUBLIC.

IT SHALL BE UNLAj; ~;'~R ON TO ERECT,
CONSTRUCT, ENLA ',,~, !If VE, <,"MOVE, CONVERT OR
DEMOLISH, EQUIP,WSE',;Jf. ,iWI Y BUILDl!~G OR STRUCTURE OR
CAUSE OR PERMITml=l~KME;' 0 B EI LATION Olfr ANY STANDARD OR
PROVISION OF THE tIB€ ICC AND ABOVE RELATED CODES, INCLUDING THEIR
SUBSEQUENT REVISIONS AND MODIFICATIONS. VIOLATIONS FOR A FIRST OFFENSE,
PER SITE OR PER PERSON, SHALL BE A PETTY OFFENSE AND FOR ANY SECOND OR
SUBSEQUENT OFFENSE COMMffiED WITHIN TWELVE (12) MONTHS OF ANY PRIOR
CITATION OR CONVICTION, A CLASS 2 MISDEMEANOR.

IN ADDmON TO THE CRIMINAL PENALTIES, THE COURT, UPON CONVICTION, MAY
ORDER ABATEMENT OR REMOVAL OF THE CONSTRUCTION, AND ISSUE APPROPRIATE
INJUNCTIVE RELIEF. THE DIRECTOR OF COMMUNITY DEVELOPMENT SHALL ISSUE NO
FINAL CERTIFICATE OF OCCUPANCY UNTIL THE CONSTRUCTION OR ACTION
DESCRIBED IN THIS PARAGRAPH HAS BEEN INSPECTED AND SHOWN TO MEET ALL
ICC AND RELATED CODE REQUIREMENTS, AND ALL FEES TO THE TOWN PAID.

THE BUILDING OFFICIAL, AS DEFINED IN ARTICLE 7-4, SHALL BE THE
ADMINISTRATIVE AUTHORITY DULY APPOINTED TO ENFORCE THESE CODES.

Section 2. That certain document known as "Town of Camp Verde Technical Code
Amendments", three copies of which are on file in the office of the town clerk, which
document was made public record by Resolution No. 2009-767 of the Town of Camp Verde,
Arizona, is hereby referred to, adopted and made part hereof as if fully set out in this
ordinance

40F5



ORD 2007 A359
MAY 23 2007

Section 3. All ordinances or parts of ordinances, including Ordinance 2004-A274 and
Ordinance 2007-A341, adopted by the Town of Camp Verde in conflict with the provisions of
this ordinance or any part of the code adopted herein by reference are hereby repealed,
effective as of the day this ordinance is effective.

Section 4. Where applicable, any person found guilty of violating any provision of this
ordinance shall be guilty of a Class 2 misdemeanor. Each day that a violation continues
shall be a separate offense punishable as a separate offense.

Section 5. Following completion of publication and any posting as required by law, this
ordinance will become effective September 1, 2009.

PASSED AND APPROVED by a majority vote of the Town Council of Camp
Verde, Arizona, this __ day of 2009.

Date: _
Bob Burnside, Mayor

Approved as to Form:

Attest:

Deborah Barqgnj~l@1

Effective _

Publish ---_&_---

Posted by _ Date/Time: _

50F5



DRAFT RESOLUTION 2009 767
JULY 22, 2009

RESOLUTION NO. 2009-767

A RESOLUTION OF THE MAYOR AND COUNCIL OF THE TOWN OF CAMP VERDE,
ARIZONA, DECLARING AS A PUBLIC RECORD THAT CERTAIN DOCUMENT FILED WITH
THE TOWN CLERK AND ENTITLED "TOWN OF CAMP VERDE TECHNICAL CODE
AMENDMENTS CHAPTER 7 - BUILDING, ARTICLE 7-1, SECTION 7-1-100 OF THE TOWN
OF CAMP VERDE CODE" OF THE TOWN OF CAMP VERDE, ARIZONA.

THAT certain document entitled "TOWN OF CAMP VERDE TECHNICAL CODE
AMENDMENTS CHAPTER 7 - BUILDING, ARTICLE 7-1, SECTION 7-1-100 OF THE TOWN
OF CAMP VERDE CODE" OF THE TOWN OF CAMP VERDE, ARIZONA, three copies of
which are on file in the office of Community Development, is hereby declared to be a public
record, and said copies are ordered to remain on file for distribution to the public.

PASSED AND ADOPTED BY THE Mayor and Council of the Town of Camp Verde,
Arizona, this day of ,2009.

\1

ATTEST:

Town Clerk

APPROVED AS TO FORM:

Town Attorney

1



RESOLUTION 2009 767
MAY 27, 2009

CHAPTER 7
BUILDING
Article 7":1

ADOPTION OF THE 2006 INTERNATIONAL CODE COUNCIL CODES, (ICC)
AND RELATED PUBLIC CODES

SECTION 7-1-100 TOWN OF CAMP VERDE TECHNICAL CODE AMENDMENTS

THE ABOVE LISTED DOCUMENTS ARE HEREBY AMENDED FOR THE INCORPORATED
AREAS OF THE TOWN OF CAMP VERDE.

INTERNATIONAL BUILDING CODE, 2006 EDITION, ADOPTED BY REFERENCE

THE INTERNATIONAL BUILDING CODE, 2006 EDITION, INCLUDING APPENDIX J AND
HEREBY REFERRED TO, ADOPTED, AND MADE A PART HERE OF AS SET FORTH
HEREIN, EXCEPTING SUCH PORTIONS AS ARE HEREINAFTER DELETED, MODIFIED OR
AMENDED.

CHAPTER 1 ADMINISTRATION. IS DELETED IN IT'S ENTIRETY AND REPLACED WITH

THE REQUIREMENTS Ff~.wTl;;' T ~ C NifNJ•.J.,•..•. iTRATIVE BUIL~ING
CODE AS ADOPTED A FR 'g; • ..

J . I
SECTION 3109.3 - PU "~l,'>NvIM .It,O~.% NDED BllITHE DELETION OF
FOUR FEET (1290 MM) AND THE INSERTION OF FIVE FEET (1613 MM).

SECTION 3109.4.1 - BARRIERS HEIGHT AND CLEARANCES IS AMENDED BY THE
DELETION OF FORTY-EIGHT INCHES (1219 MM) AND THE INSERTION OF SIXTY INCHES
(1530 MM).

SECTION 3109.4.1.7 GATES IS AMENDED BY REVISION OF THE LAST SENTENCE TO
READ AS FOLLOWS:

3109.4.1.7 - GATES. WHERE THE RELEASE MECHANISM OF THE SELF-LATCHING
DEVICE IS LOCATED LESS THAN FIFTY-FOUR INCHES (1372 MM) FROM THE BOTTOM
OF THE GATE, THE RELEASE MECHANISM SHALL BE LOCATED ON THE POOL SIDE
OF THE GATE AT LEAST FIVE INCHES (127 MM) BELOW THE TOP OF THE GATE, AND
THE GATE AND BARRIER SHALL HAVE OPENINGS NOT GREATER THAN 0.5 INCH (12.7
MM) WITHIN EIGHTEEN INCHES (457 MM) OF THE RELEASE MECHANISM.

SECTION 3109.4.1.8 DWELLING WALL AS A BARRIER IS HEREBY AMENDED BY THE
ADDITION OF #4 TO READ AS FOLLOWS:

4. EMERGENCY ESCAPE AND RESCUE WINDOWS FOR SLEEPING ROOMS WHICH
FACE WITHIN A SWIMMING POOL ENCLOSURE SHALL BE EQUIPPED WITH A
LATCHING DEVICE LOCATED FIFTY-FOUR INCHES (1372 MM) ABOVE THE FLOOR. ALL
OTHER OPERABLE DWELLING UNIT WINDOWS FACING WITHIN THE SWIMMING POOL
ENCLOSURE SHALL BE EQUIPPED WITH SCREWED-IN-PLACE WIRE MESH SCREEN, A
KEYED LOCK THAT PREVENTS OPENING THE WINDOW MORE THAN FOUR INCHES

2



DRAFT RESOLUTION 2009 767
JULY 22, 2009

(102 MM), OR A LATCHING DEVICE LOCATED NOT LESS THAN FIFTY-FOUR INCHES
(1372 MM) ABOVE THE FLOOR.

SECTION 3401.3 - COMPLIANCE WITH OTHER CODES IS AMENDED BY DELETION OF
INTERNATIONAL PRIVATE SEWAGE DISPOSAL CODE, AND ICC ELECTRIC CODE.

INTERNATIONAL FUEL GAS CODE, 2006 EDITION, ADOPTED BY REFERENCE

THE INTERNATIONAL FUEL GAS CODE, 2006 EDITION, INCLUDING APPENDIXES A, B, C
AND D, AND HEREBY REFERRED TO, ADOPTED, AND MADE A PART HERE OF AS SET
FORTH HEREIN, EXCEPTING SUCH PORTIONS AS ARE HEREINAFTER DELETED,
MODIFIED OR AMENDED.

CHAPTER 1 ADMINISTRATION. IS DELETED IN IT'S ENTIRETY AND REPLACED WITH
THE REQUIREMENTS OF THE TOWN OF CAMP VERDE ADMINISTRATIVE BUILDING
CODE AS ADOPTED AND FROM TIME TO TIME AMENDED.

SECTION 404.9 - MINIMUM BURIAL DEPTH IS AMENDED BY ADDING THE FOLLOWING
SENTENCE TO THE END OF THE SECTION TO READ AS FOLLOWS:

404.9 - MINIMUM BUR D B~M'8'I';'~§l PIPING SHALL BE
:~jr!l

ELECTRICALLY ISOL H SYS!"jEM WITH LISTED OR

t:6HR~V(~~~~0~t;~~ E~tlc PI~J~~f~~LM~~I~N~~:~~ED
WITH A YELLOW 18 AWG TRACER WIRE TERMINATING 12 INCHES (305 MM) ABOVE
GRADE AT EACH END.

SECTION 409.1.3 - GAS PIPING INSTALLATIONS, SHUTOFF VALVES, ACCESS TO
SHUTOFF VALVES IS HEREBY AMENDED BY ADDING A SECOND SENTENCE TO READ
AS FOLLOWS:

409.1.3 - GAS PIPING INSTALLATIONS, SHUTOFF VALVES, ACCESS TO SHUTOFF
VALVES. ALL BUILDINGS SHALL BE PROVIDED WITH A SHUTOFF VALVE LOCATED AT
THE BUILDING ON THE DOWNSTREAM SIDE OF THE GAS METER.

INTERNATIONAL MECHANICAL CODE, 2006 EDITION, ADOPTED BY REFERENCE

THE INTERNATIONAL MECHANICAL CODE, 2006 EDITION, INCLUDING APPENDIX A
AND HEREBY REFERRED TO, ADOPTED, AND MADE A PART HERE OF AS SET FORTH
HEREIN, EXCEPTING SUCH PORTIONS AS ARE HEREINAFTER DELETED, MODIFIED OR
AMENDED.

CHAPTER 1 ADMINISTRATION. IS DELETED IN IT'S ENTIRETY AND REPLACED WITH
THE REQUIREMENTS OF THE TOWN OF CAMP VERDE ADMINISTRATIVE BUILDING
CODE AS ADOPTED AND FROM TIME TO TIME AMENDED.

INTERNATIONAL PLUMBING CODE, 2006 EDITION, ADOPTED BY REFERENCE

THE INTERNATIONAL PLUMBING CODE, 2006 EDITION, INCLUDING APPENDIXES B, D,

3



RESOLUTION2009767
MAY 27, 2009

F AND G, AND HEREBY REFERRED TO, ADOPTED, AND MADE A PART HERE OF AS
SET FORTH HEREIN, EXCEPTING SUCH PORTIONS AS ARE HEREINAFTER DELETED,
MODIFIED OR AMENDED.

CHAPTER 1 ADMINISTRATION. IS DELETED IN IT'S ENTIRETY AND REPLACED WITH
THE REQUIREMENTS OF THE TOWN OF CAMP VERDE ADMINISTRATIVE BUILDING
CODE AS ADOPTED AND FROM TIME TO TIME AMENDED.

SECTION 305.6.1 - SEWER DEPTH IS HEREBY AMENDED TO READ AS FOLLOWS:

305.6.1 - SEWERDEPTH. BUILDING SEWERS THAT CONNECT TO PRIVATE SEWAGE
DISPOSAL SYSTEMS SHALL BE A MINIMUM OF TWELVE INCHES (305 MM) BELOW
FINISHED GRADE AT THE POINT OF SEPTIC TANK CONNECTION. ALL NONMETALLIC
BUILDING SEWERS SHALL BE INSTALLED WITH A GREEN 18 AWG TRACER WIRE
TERMINATING 12 INCHES (305 MM) ABOVE GRADE AT EACH END.

CHAPTER 4 FIXTURES, FAUCETS AND FIXTURE FITTINGS

SECTION 403 - MINIMUM PLUMBING FACILITIES

TABLE 403.1- MINIMUM NUMBER OF REQUIRED PLUMBING FIXTURES IS HEREBY
AMENDED BY ADDITIQ 0 "E" 1 LOWS:

TABLE 403:
o

1-MINIMU
E. WATER ~ OL S

SUBSTITIIbrz:E 0 FO INS IN A, '8 AND M OCCUPANCIES
WITH TWENTY-FIVE (25) OR FEWER OCCUPANTS.

SECTION 504.6 - REQUIREMENTS FOR DISCHARGE PIPE, ITEM #5 IS AMENDED TO
READ AS FOLLOWS:

504.6 - REQUIREMENTS FOR DISCHARGE PIPE.
5. DISCHARGE TO THE FLOOR, TO AN INDIRECT WASTE RECEPTOR OR TO THE
OUTDOORS. WHERE DISCHARGING TO THE OUTDOORS, DISCHARGE PIPING SHALL
BE NO LESS THAN SIX INCHES (152 MM) AND NO GREATER THAN TWENTY-FOUR
INCHES (610 MM) FROM GRADE.

SECTION 603 - WATER SERVICE PIPE INSTALLATION IS HEREBY AMENDED AS A NEW
SECTION TO READ AS FOLLOWS:

603.1- WATER SERVICE PIPE INSTALLATION. THE INSTALLATION OF THE WATER
SERVICE PIPE SHALL COMPLY WITH SECTION 603.1.1.

603.1.1- BURIAL DEPTH. THE WATER SERVICE PIPE SHALL BE BURIED A MINIMUM OF
EIGHTEEN INCHES (457 MM) BELOW THE FINISH GRADE. ALL NONMETALLIC SERVICE
PIPING SHALL BE INSTALLED WITH A BLUE 18 AWG TRACER WIRE TERMINATING 12
INCHES (305 MM) ABOVE GRADE AT EACH END.

SECTION 715.1 - SANITARY DRAINAGE; BACKWATER VALVES; SEWAGE BACKFLOW
IS AMENDED TO READ AS FOLLOWS:

4



DRAFT RESOLUTION 2009 767
JULY 22, 2009

715.1 - SANITARY DRAINAGE; BACKWATER VALVES; SEWAGE BACKFLOW. AN
APPROVED BACKWATER VALVE SHALL PROTECT ALL STRUCTURES CONNECTED TO
A PUBLIC SEWER SYSTEM.

SECTION 904.1- ROOF EXTENSION IS AMENDED BY THE INSERTION OF TWELVE
INCHES (12").

NATIONAL ELECTRICAL CODE, 2005 EDITION, ADOPTED BY REFERENCE

THE NATIONAL ELECTRICAL CODE, 2005 EDITION, AND HEREBY REFERRED TO,
ADOPTED, AND MADE A PART HERE OF AS SET FORTH HEREIN, EXCEPTING SUCH
PORTIONS AS ARE HEREINAFTER DELETED, MODIFIED OR AMENDED.

ARTICLE 90-1 (E) - ADMINISTRATION AND ENFORCEMENT IS HEREBY ADDED AS A
SUB PARAGRAPH TO R.EAD AS FOLLOWS:

ARTICLE 90-1 (E) - ADMINISTRATION AND ENFORCEMENT - FOR THE PURPOSE OF
ADMINISTRATION AND ENFORCEMENT OF THE REQUIREMENTS OF THIS CODE AND
AMENDMENTS THERETO, THE PROVISIONS OF THE TOWN OF CAMP VERDE
ADMINISTRATIVE BUI G CO S ADOP D BY SEPA RDINANCE, AND AS
MAY BE AMENDED FR;jj)l~E , S

ARTICLE 210.8 GROU t-tT
PERSONNEL IS HERE r~"1TAMEN 0=

(7) CONVENIENCE RECEPTACLES LOCATED WITHIN SIX FEET (1.8 M) OF ANY SINK,
WASHBASIN, TUB OR SHOWER.

INTERNATIONAL RESIDENTIAL CODE, 2006 EDITION, ADOPTED BY REFERENCE

THE INTERNATIONAL RESIDENTIAL CODE, 2006 EDITION, INCLUDING APPENDIXES A,
B, C, G, H, J, AND Q, AND HEREBY REFERRED TO, ADOPTED, AND MADE A PART
HERE OF AS SET FORTH HEREIN, EXCEPTING SUCH PORTIONS AS ARE HEREINAFTER
DELETED, MODIFIED OR AMENDED.

CHAPTER 1 ADMINISTRATION. IS DELETED IN IT'S ENTIRETY AND REPLACED WITH
THE REQUIREMENTS OF THE TOWN OF CAMP VERDE ADMINISTRATIVE BUILDING
CODE AS ADOPTED AND FROM TIME TO TIME AMENDED.

SECTION R301 - DESIGN CRITERIA

TABLE R301.2 (1)

CLIMATIC AND GEOGRAPHIC DESIGN CRITERIA

I ROOF I WIND I SEISMIC '_---=::.SU=B=JE=C::.::T:..:;T.=O.=D=AMA=G=E::...::F:..:::;R=OM::.::::...-_' WINTER I ICE BARRIER I

5



RESOLUTION 2009 767
MAY 27, 2009

WEATHERING FROST TERMITE
LINE

DEPTH
12

20 90 MPH INCHES
EXPOSURE C MODERATE (305 MODERATE 20° NO

C MM) TO HEAVY

FLOOD HAZARDS AIR FREEZING INDEX MEAN ANNUAL TEMP

REFER TO FLOOD PLAIN 194 53°
UNIT

TABLE R301.51S AMENDED BY DELETION OF DESIGN LOAD 20 IN ATTICS WITH
STORAGE AND 30 IN SLEEPING ROOMS AND REPLACE WITH 40 IN BOTH AREAS.

USE
ATTICS WITH STORAGE D,E

SLEEPING ROO

SECTION R309 - GA

LIVE LOAD
40
40

SECTION R309.1 - OPENING PROTECTION IS AMENDED BY THE ADDITION OF THE
SENTENCE TO READ AS FOLLOWS:

R309.1 - OPENING PROTECTION. DOORS PROVIDING PROTECTION SHALL BE
MAINTAINED SELF-CLOSING AND SELF-LATCHING.

SECTION R403.1.1 - MINIMUM SIZE IS HEREBY AMENDED BY ADDITION OF THE
FOLLOWING SECTION TO READ AS FOLLOWS:

R403.1.1 - MINIMUM SIZE. CONTINUOUS SPREAD CONCRETE FOOTINGS SHALL BE
REINFORCED WITH AT LEAST ONE NO.4 HORIZONTAL REINFORCEMENT BAR
LOCATED THREE INCHES (76 MM) FROM THE BOTTOM OF THE FOOTING. MONOLITHIC
INTERIOR AND EXTERIOR CONCRETE FOOTINGS SHALL BE REINFORCED WITH AT
LEAST ONE NO.4 HORIZONTAL BAR LOCATED THREE INCHES (76 MM) FROM THE
BOTTOM OF THE FOOTING AND ONE NO.4 BAR LOCATED THREE INCHES (76 MM)
FROM THE TOP OF THE SLAB. PIER AND COLUMN FOOTINGS SHALL BE REINFORCED
WITH ONE.NO. 4 HORIZONTAL BAR SPACED NO MORE THAN TWELVE INCHES (305
MM) IN EACH DIRECTION AND LOCATED THREE INCHES (76 MM) FROM THE BOTTOM
OF THE FOOTING.

SECTION R403.1.3.1- FOUNDATIONS AND STEM WALLS IS HEREBY DELETED IN ITS
ENTIRETY AND REVISED TO READ AS FOLLOWS:

R403.1.3.1- FOUNDATIONS AND STEM WALLS. FOUNDATIONS AND STEM WALLS

6



DRAFT RESOLUTION 2009 767
JULY 22, 2009

SHALL BE PROVIDED WITH THE FOLLOWING STEEL REINFORCEMENT, UNLESS AN
ENGINEERED DESIGN IS PROVIDED:

1. FOR NON-RETAINING STEM WALLS LESS THAN TWENTY FOUR INCHES (610
MM) IN HEIGHT, A BOND BEAM COMPOSED OF ONE NO.4 HORIZONTAL BAR IS
REQUIRED AT THE TOP OF THE WALL AND ONE NO.4 VERTICAL BAR IS
PROVIDED AT FORTY-EIGHT INCHES (1219 MM) ON CENTER. THE VERTICAL
REINFORCEMENT SHALL EXTEND INTO THE FOOTING WITH A BENT HOOK
HAVING A MINIMUM OF SIX-INCH (152 MM) 90° BEND.

2. FOR STEM WALLS TWENTY-FOUR INCHES (610 MM) TO FORTY-EIGHT INCHES
(1219 MM) IN HEIGHT, A BOND BEAM COMPOSED OF TWO NO.4 HORIZONTAL
BAR, OR ONE NO.5 BAR IS REQUIRED AT THE TOP OF THE WALL AND ONE NO.
4 VERTICAL BAR IS PROVIDED AT FORTY-EIGHT INCHES (1219 MM) ON
CENTER. THE VERTICAL REINFORCEMENT SHALL EXTEND INTO THE FOOTING
WITH A BENT HOOK HAVING A MINIMUM OF SIX-INCH (152 MM) 90° BEND.

SECTION R404.1.1- MASONRY FOUNDATION WALLS IS HEREBY AMENDED BY
DELETION IN ITS ENTIRETY AND REVISED TO READ AS FOLLOWS:

R404.1.1 - MASONRY FO
WALLS SHALL BE CO
FOR THE MOST REST
VERTICAL REINFORC E
INCHES (1219 MM) ON .'- R 'ND S JA AMPLY H THE PROVISIONS OF
THIS SECTION AND THE APPLICABLE PROVISIONS OF SECTIONS R606, R607 AND
R608.IN SEISMIC DESIGN CATEGORY Do, D1 AND D2, CONCRETE MASONRY
FOUNDATION WALLS SHALL COMPLY WITH SECTION R404.1.4. RUBBLE STONE
MASONRY WALLS SHALL NOT BE USED IN SEISMIC DESIGN CATEGORY Do, D1 D2 0R
C.

TABLE R404.1.1 (5) - FOUNDATIONS, CONCRETE FOUNDATION WALLS IS HEREBY
AMENDED BY THE ADDITION OF NEW SUBSECTION "M" TO READ AS FOLLOWS:

R404.1.1 (5) - FOUNDATIONS, CONCRETE FOUNDATION WALLS.

M. WHERE TABLE R404.1.1 (5) PERMITS PLAIN CONCRETE WALLS, NOT LESS
THAN ONE NO.4 VERTICAL BAR AT A SPACING NOT TO EXCEED FORTY-EIGHT
INCHES (1219 MM) ON CENTER, SHALL BE PROVIDED.

SECTION R404.1.8 - RUBBLE STONE MASONRY IS HEREBY DELETED IN ITS ENTIRETY.

TABLE R404.4 (2) -7.5 INCH THICK FLAT ICF FOUNDATION WALLS, SUBSECTION "c"
IS HEREBY DELETED AND REPLACED WITH A NEW SUBSECTION "C" TO READ AS
FOLLOWS:

C. NIR DENOTES NOT LESS THAN. ONE NO.4 VERTICAL BAR AT A SPACING NOT
TO EXCEED FORTY-EIGHT INCHES (1219 MM) ON CENTER, SHALL BE
PROVIDED.

7



SECTION AG 102 - DE

RESOLUTION 2009 767
MAY 27, 2009

TABLE R404.4 (3) - 9.5 INCH THICK FLAT ICF FOUNDATION WALLS, SUBSECTION "C"
IS HEREBY DELETED AND REPLACED WITH A NEW SUBSECTION "C" TO READ AS
FOLLOWS:

C. N/R DENOTES NOT LESS THAN ONE NO.4 VERTICAL BAR AT A SPACING NOT
TO EXCEED FORTY-EIGHT INCHES (1219 MM) ON CENTER, SHALL BE
PROVIDED.

SECTION P2603.6 - FREEZING IS AMENDED BY THE REVISION OF THE LAST
SENTENCE TO READ AS FOLLOWS:

P2603.6 - FREEZING. WATER SERVICE PIPE SHALL BE INSTALLED NOT LESS THAN
EIGHTEEN INCHES (457 MM) DEEP AND NOT LESS THAN SIX INCHES (152 MM) BELOW
THE FROST LINE. ALL NONMETALLIC PIPING SHALL BE INSTALLED WITH A BLUE 18
AWG TRACER WIRE TERMINATING 12 INCHES (305 MM) ABOVE GRADE AT EACH END.

SECTION P2603.6.1 - SEWER DEPTH IS HEREBY AMENDED TO READ AS FOLLOWS:

P2603.6.1 - SEWER DEPTH. BUILDING SEWERS THAT CONNECT TO PRIVATE SEWAGE
DISPOSAL SYSTEMS SHALL BE A MINIMUM OF TWELVE INCHES (305 MM) BELOW·
FINISHED GRADE AT THE POINT OF SEPTIC TANK CONNECTION. BUILDING SEWERS
SHALL BE A MINIMUM L ES M'Wjld~lij.. E. ALL
NONMETALLIC BUILDI LL SltlLLED A GREEN 18 AWG
TRACER WIRE TERMI ()'Bil\tE G xDE AT EACH END.I I . .
SWIMMING POOL IS AMENDED TO READ AS FOLLOWS:

SWIMMING POOL. ANY STRUCTURE INTENDED FOR SWIMMING OR RECREATIONAL
BATHING THAT CONTAINS WATER OVER EIGHTEEN INCHES (457 MM) INCHES DEEP.
THIS INCLUDES IN-GROUND, ABOVEGROUND SWIMMING POOLS, HOT TUBS AND
SPAS.

SECTION AG103.2 - ABOVEGROUND AND ON-GROUND POOLS SECTION IS AMENDED
BY THE INSERTION OF EXCEPTION TO READ AS FOLLOWS:

AG1 03.2 - ABOVE GROUND AND ON-GROUND POOLS.

EXCEPTION: PREFABRICATED SWIMMING POOLS ACCESSORY TO
DETACHED ONE- AND TWO-FAMILY DWELLINGS AND MULTIPLE SINGLE­
FAMILY DWELLINGS (TOWNHOUSES) NOT MORE THAN THREE STORIES
ABOVE GRADE PLANE IN HEIGHT IN WHICH THE POOL WALLS ARE
ENTIRELY ABOVE THE ADJACENT GRADE AND IF THE CAPACITY DOES
NOT EXCEED 5,000 GALLONS.

SECTION AG 105.2 - OUTDOOR SWIMMING POOL IS HEREBY AMENDED TO READ AS
FOLLOWS:

#1 IS AMENDED BY THE DELETION OF FORTY-EIGHT INCHES (1219 MM) AND THE
INSERTION OF SIXTY INCHES (1524 MM).

8



DRAFT RESOLUTION 2009 767
JULY 22, 2009

#6 IS AMENDED BY THE DELETION OF 2-% INCHES (57 MM) SQUARE AND THE
INSERTION OF 1 % INCHES (44 MM) SQUARE.

#8 FIRST SENTENCE IS AMENDED TO READ AS FOLLOWS:

8. ACCESS GATES SHALL COMPLY WITH THE REQUIREMENTS OF SECTION AG105.2,
ITEMS 1 THROUGH 7, AND SHALL BE SELF-CLOSING AND SELF-LATCHING.

SUBSECTION 8.1 IS AMENDED TO READ AS FOLLOWS:

8.1 THE RELEASE MECHANISM SHALL BE LOCATED ON THE POOLSIDE OF THE GATE
AT LEAST FIVE INCHES (127 MM) BELOW THE TOP OF THE GATE.

#9 IS REVISED BY THE ADDITION OF A NEW SECTION 9.4 TO READ AS FOLLOWS:

9.4 EMERGENCY ESCAPE AND RESCUE WINDOWS FOR SLEEPING ROOMS WHICH
FACE WITHIN A SWIMMING POOL ENCLOSURE SHALL BE EQUIPPED WITH A
LATCHING DEVICE LOCATED FIFTY-FOUR INCHES (1372 MM) ABOVE THE FLOOR. ALL
OTHER OPERABLE DWELLING UNIT WINDOWS FACING WITHIN THE SWIMMING POOL
ENCLOSURE SHALL If S E~~etN!Pt E MESH SCREEN, A
KEYED LOCK THAT P VENllS N OR HAN FOUR INCHES
(102 MM), OR A LATC .If-JG DIl"1 S THA IFTY-FOUR INCHES
(1372 MM) ABOVE THali6@~R.

9



DRAFT ORD 2009 A361
JULY 22, 2009

ORDINANCE 2009-A361

AN ORDINANCE OF THE MAYOR AND COMMON COUNCIL OF THE TOWN OF CAMP
VERDE, YAVAPAI COUNTY, ARIZONA, ADOPTING BY REFERENCE THE TOWN OF

CAMP VERDE "ADMINISTRATIVE BUILDING CODE", AMENDING TOWN CODE
CHAPTER 7 - BUILDING, ARTICLE 7-2, ADDING SECTION 7-2-101 THROUGH

SECTION 7-2-111, ESTABLISHING FEE SCHEDULES, AND PROSCRIBING
PENALTIES FOR VIOLATIONS THEREOF.

Section 1: That certain document known as "Town of Camp Verde Administrative Building
Code, Chapter 7 - Building, Article 7-2, Number 18, Section 7-2-101 through Section 7-2­
111, of the Town of Camp Verde Code", three copies of which are on file in the office of the
town clerk, which do t ubli or q;;B&lJ!4~i2Jjl~O. 2009-769 of the
Town of Camp Verd r to opted a i1i made part hereof as if
fully set out in this 0 J
Section 2. All ordina nces a o· d by the "own of Camp Verde in
conflict with the provisions of this ordinance or any part of the code adopted herein by
reference are hereby repealed, effective as of the day this ordinance is effective.

Section 3. Where applicable, any person found guilty of violating any provision of this
ordinance shall be guilty of a Class 2 misdemeanor. Each day that a violation continues
shall be a s~parate offense punishable as a separate offense.

Section 4. Following completion of publication and any posting as required by law, the
provisions of this ordinance and the amendments to the administrative building code
adopted herein shall become effective on September 1, 2009.

PASSED AND APPROVED by a majority vote of the Town Council of Camp
Verde, Arizona, this __ day of 2009.

Date: _

Tony Gioia, Mayor
Approved as to Form:

Attest:

Deborah Barber, Town Clerk Attorney



Effective _

ORO 2009 A361
MAY 27, 2009

Publish ---_&_----

Posted by _ Date/Time: _

20F2



RESOLUTION NO. 2009-769

A RESOLUTION OF THE MAYOR AND COUNCIL OF THE TOWN OF CAMP VERDE,
ARIZONA, DECLARING AS A PUBLIC RECORD THAT CERTAIN DOCUMENT FILED WITH
THE TOWN CLERK AND ENTITLED "TOWN OF CAMP VERDE ADMINISTRATIVE
BUILDING CODE CHAPTER 7 - BUILDING, ARTICLE 7-2, SECTION 7-2-101 THROUGH
SECTION 7-2-111 OF THE TOWN OF CAMP VERDE CODE" OF THE TOWN OF CAMP
VERDE, ARIZONA.

THAT certain document entitled "TOWN OF CAMP VERDE ADMINISTRATIVE BUILDING
CODE CHAPTER 7 - BUILDING, ARTICLE 7-2, SECTION 7-2-101 THROUGH SECTION 7-2­
111 OF THE TOWN OF CAMP VERDE CODE" OF THE TOWN OF CAMP VERDE, ARIZONA,
three copies of which are on file in the office· of Community Development, is hereby declared to
be a pUblic record, and said copies are ordered to remain on file for distribution to the public.

PASSED AND ADOPTED BY THE Mayor and Council of the Town of Camp Verde,
Arizona, this day of , 2009.

Mayor

ATTEST:

Town Clerk

APPROVED AS TO FORM:

Town Attorney



CHAPTER 7
BUILDING
Article 7-1

ADOPTION OF THE 2006 INTERNATIONAL CODE COUNCIL CODES, (ICC)
AND RELATED PUBLIC CODES

18. TOWN OF CAMP VERDE ADMINISTRATIVE BUILDING CODE·

ARTICLE 7-2
ADMINISTRATIVE BUILDING CODE

ASOPTION OF THE UNIFOR~4 INTERNATIONAL BUILSING COSE
FOR THE ABATE~4ENT

OF SANGEROUS BUILSINGS
PURSUANT TO ARS §9 802 (AS A~4ENSES), THE TOWN HEREBY ASOPTS FOR APPLICATION
ANS ENFORCE~4ENT FOR ALL STRUCTURES V'IITHIN THE TOWN LI~4ITS THE UNIFOR~4

INTERNATIONAL BUILSING COSE FOR THE ABATB4ENT OF SANGEROUS BUILSINGS
(INTERNATIONAL CONFERENCE OF BUILSING OFFICIALS, 199'1 COSE COUNCIL

,
SB40UTION OF THE STRUCTURES SECLARES TO BE A SANGEROUS BUILSING ANS
RECOVER THE COSTS BY LIENS ANS PERSONAL ASSESS~4ENTS ON THE PROPERTY OWNERS,
WHICH SHALL BE TO THE BOARS OF APPEALS. THE SIRECTOR OF CO~4~4UNITY

SEVELOP~4ENT SHALL BE THE Am4INISTRATIVE AUTHORITY SULY APPOINTES TO ENFORCE
THESE COSES.

SECTION 7-2-1 01 ADMINISTRATIVE BUILDING CODE

7-2-101 GENERAL

7-2-102 APPLICABILITY

7-2-103 DUTIES AND POWERS OF BUILDING OFFICIAL

7-2-104 PERMITS

7-2-105 CONSTRUCTION DOCUMENTS

7-2-106 INSPECTIONS

7-2-107 CERTIFICATE OF OCCUPANCY AND FINAL APPROVALS

7-2-108 UNSAFE STRUCTURES AND EQUIPMENT

7-2-109 VIOLATIONS



DRAFT RESOLUTION 2009-769
JULY 22, 2009

7-2-110 BOARD OF APPEALS

7-2-111 FEES

7-2-101 GENERAL

7-2-101.1 TITLE. THESE PROVISIONS SHALL BE KNOWN AS THE "TOWN OF
CAMP VERDE ADMINISTRATIVE BUILDING CODE," MAY BE CITED AS SUCH,
AND WILL BE REFERRED TO HEREIN, AS "THIS CHAPTER."

7-2-101.2 SCOPE. THE PROVISIONS OF THIS CHAPTER SHALL SERVE AS THE
ADMINISTRATIVE, ORGANIZATIONAL AND ENFORCEMENT RULES AND
REGULATIONS FOR THE TECHNICAL CODES WHICH REGULATE SITE
PREPARATION AND CONSTRUCTION, ALTERATION, MOVEMENT,
ENLARGEMENT, REPLACEMENT, DEMOLITION, REPAIR, MAINTENANCE, USE
AND OCCUPANCY OF BUILDINGS, STRUCTURES AND BUILDING SERVICE
EQUIPMENT OR APPURTENANCES ATTACHED THERETO WITHIN THE TOWN OF
CAMP VERDE, ARIZONA.

EXCEPTIONS:
CODES SHAL

&.W~~;HETECHNICAL

I
1. AMUSEMENT 'ill IJ "l ,INCLUGING MERRY-GO-

ROUNDS, FERft E , llJiATIN crONVEYAN\:ES, SLIDES, SIMILAR
DEVICES AND ACCESSORY STRUCTURES WHOSE USE IS· NECESSARY
FOR THE OPERATION OF SUCH AMUSEMENT DEVICES AND
STRUCTURES; ANY ACCESSORY STRUCTURE INCLUDED IN THE
PROVISIONS OF THIS SUB-SECTION SHALL BE LIMITED TO A COVER OR
ROOF OVER EACH DEVICE; BUT SHALL NOT INCLUDE ANY STORAGE
BUILDING OR DETACHED STRUCTURE WHICH IS NOT AN INTEGRAL
PART OF THE DEVICE.

2. TANKS OR BASINS, WITHOUT A BUILDING ABOVE, BUILT BELOW
GRADE, WHICH IS A PART OF THE TOWN WATER OR SEWAGE
TREATMENT PROCESS. STORAGE TANKS RESTING IN OR UPON THE
GROUND AND INSTALLED IN ACCORDANCE WITH THE REQUIREMENTS
OF THE INTERNATIONAL BUILDING CODE.

3. WORKS OF ART NOT OVER 6 FEET (1829 MM) IN HEIGHT AND THEIR
FOUNDATION AND SUPPORTING STRUCTURE, PROVIDED THAT NO PART
OF WHICH IS INTENDED TO BE OCCUPIED OR USED AS SHELTER.

4. PORTABLE LP-GAS EQUIPMENT OF ALL TYPES NOT CONNECTED TO A
FIXED FUEL PIPING SYSTEM.

3



DRAFT RESOLUTION 2009-769
JULY 22, 2009

5. EXCEPT AS PROVIDED IN SECTION 401.1.1 INTERNATIONAL FUEL GAS
CODE (IFGC), GAS PIPING, METERS, GAS PRESSURE REGULATORS AND
OTHER APPURTENANCES USED BY THE SERVING GAS UTILITY
SUPPLIER IN THE DISTRIBUTION OF GAS, OTHER THAN LP-GAS.

6. FEDERAL DEVELOPMENT ON FEDERAL LAND.

7-2-101.3 INTENT. THE PURPOSE OF THE TECHNICAL CODES IS TO ESTABLISH
THE MINIMUM REQUIREMENTS TO SAFEGUARD THE PUBLIC HEALTH, SAFETY
'AND GENERAL WELFARE THROUGH STRUCTURAL STRENGTH, MEANS OF
EGRESS FACILITIES, STABILITY, SANITATION, ADEQUATE LIGHT AND
VENTILATION, AND SAFETY TO LIFE AND PROPERTY FROM FIRE AND OTHER
HAZARDS ATTRIBUTED TO THE BUILT ENVIRONMENT AND TO PROVIDE
SAFETY TO FIRE FIGHTERS AND EMERGENCY RESPONDERS DURING
EMERGENCY OPERATIONS.

7-2-101.4 TECHNICAL CODES. THE TECHNICAL CODES SHALL INCLUDE ALL OF
THE FOLLOWING CODES APPLIED AS INDICATED, PLUS THE CODES AND
STANDARDS REFERENCED IN THE TECHNICAL CODES SHALL BE
CONSIDERED PART E IREM TS ICAL CODES TO
THE PRESCRIBED E '10 S RE~~

7-2-101.4.1 BUILDIN 0'. " ERNATIONAL
BUILDING CODE AN - D ENT9-f"HER' HALL ~ PLY TO THE
CONSTRUCTION, ALTERATION, MOVEMENT, ENLARGEMENT, REPLACEMENT,
REPAIR, EQUIPMENT, USE AND OCCUPANCY, LOCATION, REMOVAL AND
DEMOLITION OF EVERY BUILDING OR STRUCTURE OR ANY APPURTENANCES
CONNECTED OR ATTACHED TO SUCH BUILDINGS OR STRUCTURES.

EXCEPTIONS:

A. DETACHED ONE- AND TWO-FAMILY DWELLINGS AND
MULTIPLE SINGLE-FAMILY DWELLINGS (TOWNHOUSES) NOT
MORE THAN THREE STORIES ABOVE GRADE PLANE IN HEIGHT
WITH SEPARATE MEANS OF EGRESS AND THEIR ACCESSORY
STRUCTURES SHALL COMPLY WITH THE INTERNATIONAL
RESIDENTIAL CODE.

B. EXISTING BUILDINGS UNDERGOING REPAIR, ALTERATION
OR ADDITIONS AND CHANGE OF OCCUPANCY SHALL BE
PERMITTED TO COMPLY WITH THE INTERNATIONAL EXISTING
BUILDING CODE.

7-2-101.4.2 RESIDENTIAL CODE.'THE PROVISIONS OF THE INTERNATIONAL
RESIDENTIAL CODE SHALL APPLY TO THE CONSTRUCTION, ALTERATION,
MOVEMENT, ENLARGEMENT, REPLACEMENT, REPAIR, EQUIPMENT, USE AND

4



DRAFT RESOLUTION 2009-769
JULY 22, 2009

OCCUPANCY, LOCATION, REMOVAL AND DEMOLITION OF DETACHED ONE­
AND TWO-FAMILY DWELLINGS AND MULTIPLE SINGLE-FAMILY DWELLINGS
(TOWNHOUSES) NOT MORE THAN THREE STORIES ABOVE GRADE PLANE IN
HEIGHT WITH SEPARATE MEANS OF EGRESS AND THEIR ACCESSORY
STRUCTURES.

EXCEPTIONS: EXISTING BUILDINGS UNDERGOING REPAIR,
ALTERATION OR ADDITIONS AND CHANGE OF OCCUPANCY
SHALL BE PERMITTED TO COMPLY WITH THE INTERNATIONAL
EXISTING BUILDING CODE.

7-2-101.4.3 ELECTRICAL CODE. THE PROVISIONS OF THE NATIONAL
ELECTRICAL CODE SHALL APPLY TO THE INSTALLATION OF ELECTRICAL
SYSTEMS, INCLUDING ALTERATIONS, REPAIRS, REPLACEMENT, EQUIPMENT,
APPLIANCES, FIXTURES, FITTINGS AND APPURTENANCES THERETO.

EXCEPTION: ELECTRICAL WORK FOR DETACHED ONE- AND TWO­
FAMILY DWELLINGS AND MULTIPLE SINGLE-FAMILY DWELLINGS
(TOWNHOUSES) NOT MORE THAN THREE STORIES ABOVE GRADE
PLANE I GH ITH SEP RATE GRESS AND
THEIR .. 0 :ili; C ELYWITH THE
INTERN B:E- . ".EWiiiJ

7-2-101.4.4 PLUMBI E.'0rrHE I I ' IOF THE TERNATIONAL
PLUMBING CODE SHALL APPLY TO THE INSTALLATION, ALTERATION,
REPAIR, REPLACEMENT AND MAINTENANCE OF PLUMBING SYSTEMS,
INCLUDING EQUIPMENT, APPLIANCES, FIXTURES, FITTINGS AND
APPURTENANCES, AND WHERE CONNECTED TO A WATER OR SEWAGE
SYSTEM AND ALL ASPECTS OF A MEDICAL GAS SYSTEM.

EXCEPTIONS:

A. PLUMBING WORK FOR DETACHED ONE- AND TWO-FAMILY
DWELLINGS AND MULTIPLE SINGLE-FAMILY DWELLINGS
(TOWNHOUSES) NOT MORE THAN THREE STORIES ABOVE
GRADE PLANE IN HEIGHT WITH SEPARATE MEANS OF EGRESS
AND THEIR ACCESSORY STRUCTURES SHALL COMPLY WITH
THE INTERNATIONAL RESIDENTIAL CODE.

B. PLUMBING SYSTEMS IN EXISTING BUILDINGS UNDERGOING
REPAIR, ALTERATION OR ADDITIONS AND CHANGE OF
OCCUPANCY SHALL BE PERMITTED TO COMPLY WITH THE
INTERNATIONAL EXISTING BUILDING CODE.

5



DRAFT RESOLUTION 2009-769
JULY 22, 2009

7-2-101.4.5 MECHANICAL CODE. THE PROVISIONS OF THE INTERNATIONAL
MECHANICAL CODE SHALL APPLY TO THE INSTALLATION, ALTERATIONS,
REPAIRS AND REPLACEMENT OF MECHANICAL SYSTEMS, INCLUDING
EQUIPMENT, APPLIANCES, FIXTURES, FITTINGS AND/OR APPURTENANCES,
INCLUDING VENTILATING, HEATING, COOLING, AIR-CONDITIONING AND
REFRIGERATION SYSTEMS, INCINERATORS AND OTHER ENERGY-RELATED
SYSTEMS.

EXCEPTIONS:

A. MECHANICAL WORK FOR DETACHED ONE- AND TWO-
FAMILY DWELLINGS AND MULTIPLE SINGLE-FAMILY
DWELLINGS (TOWNHOUSES) NOT MORE THAN THREE STORIES
ABOVE GRADE PLANE IN HEIGHT WITH SEPARATE MEANS OF
EGRESS AND THEIR ACCESSORY STRUCTURES SHALL
COMPLY WITH THE INTERNATIONAL RESIDENTIAL CODE.

B. MECHANICAL SYSTEMS IN EXISTING BUILDINGS
UNDERGOING REPAIR, ALTERATION OR ADDITIONS AND
CHA ANC HA P TED TO COMPLY
WIT 0 I G CODE.

I
7-2-101.4.6 FUEL GA. , '. a~. F THE I :~TERNATIONAL FUEL
GAS CODE SHALLAP.~O " ~AL ,I" N OF GA:' PIPING FROM THE
POINT OF DELIVERY, GAS APPLIANCES AND RELATED ACCESSORIES. THESE
REQUIREMENTS APPLY TO GAS PIPING SYSTEMS EXTENDING FROM THE
POINT OF DELIVERY TO THE INLET CONNECTIONS OF APPLIANCES AND THE
INSTALLATION AND OPERATION OF RESIDENTIAL AND COMMERCIAL GAS
APPLIANCES AND RELATED ACCESSORIES.

EXCEPTIONS:

1. FUEL GAS WORK FOR DETACHED ONE- AND TWO-FAMILY
DWELLINGS AND MULTIPLE SINGLE-FAMILY DWELLINGS
(TOWNHOUSES) NOT MORE THAN THREE STORIES ABOVE
GRADE PLANE IN HEIGHT WITH SEPARATE MEANS OF EGRESS
AND THEIR ACCESSORY STRUCTURES SHALL COMPLY WITH
THE INTERNATIONAL RESIDENTIAL CODE.

2. FUEL-GAS PIPING SYSTEMS, FUEL-GAS UTILIZATION
EQUIPMENT AND RELATED ACCESSORIES ON EXISTING
BUILDINGS UNDERGOING REPAIR, ALTERATION OR ADDITIONS
AND CHANGE OF OCCUPANCY SHALL BE PERMITTED TO
COMPLY WITH THE INTERNATIONAL EXISTING BUILDING.
CODE.

6



DRAFT RESOLUTION 2009-769
JULY 22, 2009

3. THE INTERNATIONAL MECHANICAL CODE SHALL REGULATE
THE DESIGN, INSTALLATION, MAINTENANCE, ALTERATION
AND INSPECTION OF MECHANICAL SYSTEMS OPERATING
WITH FUELS OTHER THAN FUEL GAS.

7-2-101.4.7 EXISTING BUILDING CODE. THE PROVISIONS OF THE
INTERNATIONAL EXISTING BUILDING CODE SHALL BE PERMITTED TO APPLY
TO EXISTING BUILDINGS UNDERGOING REPAIR, ALTERATION, ADDITION,
RELOCATION, AND CHANGE OF OCCUPANCY.

EXCEPTION: A BUILDING OR PORTION OF A BUILDING NOT
PREVIOUSLY OCCUPIED, USED FOR ITS INTENDED PURPOSE, OR
FOR WHICH A CERTIFICATE OF OCCUPANCY HAS NOT BEEN
ISSUED SHALL COMPLY WITH THE TECHNICAL CODES FOR NEW
CONSTRUCTION.

7-2-101.4.8 ENERGY CONSERVATION CODE. THE PROVISIONS OF THE
INTERNATIONAL ENERGY CONSERVATION CODE SHALL APPLY TO THE
CONSTRUCTION, ALT TION OVEMENT, E NT, REPLACEMENT,
REPAIR, EQUIPMENt!'" UP Y, k MOVAL AND
DEMOLITION OF EV iIlL;~1 R C R fNY APPURTENANCES
CONNECTED OR AT "d~ ~O S OR StUCTURES.

7-2-101.5 APPENDICES. PROVISIONS IN THE APPENDICES OF THE TECHNICAL
CODES SHALL NOT APPLY UNLESS SPECIFICALLY ADOPTED.

7-2-101.6 DEFINITIONS. UNLESS OTHERWISE EXPRESSLY STATED, THE
FOLLOWING WORDS AND TERMS SHALL HAVE THE MEANINGS AS SHOWN IN
THIS CHAPTER. DEFINITIONS LOCATED IN THE TECHNICAL CODES ARE
HEREBY INCORPORATED INTO THIS CHAPTER.

BUILDING - ANY STRUCTURE USED OR INTENDED FOR SUPPORTING OR
SHELTERING ANY USE OR OCCUPANCY.

BUILDING, EXISTING - A BUILDING ERECTED PRIOR TO THE ADOPTION
OF THIS CHAPTER OR ONE FOR WHICH A LEGAL CERTIFICATE OF
OCCUPANCY HAS BEEN ISSUED FOR AT LEAST ONE YEAR.

BUILDING OFFICIAL - THE OFFICER OR OTHER DESIGNATED AUTHORITY
CHARGED WITH THE ADMINISTRATION AND ENFORCEMENT OF THIS
CHAPTER AND THE TECHNICAL CODES, OR A REGULARLY AUTHORIZED
DEPUTY OR OTHER DESIGNEE. WHEN THE TERM OR TITLE
ADMINISTRATIVE AUTHORITY, BUILDING OFFICIAL, BUILDING
INSPECTOR, CODE OFFICIAL, GAS INSPECTOR, PLUMBING INSPECTOR,

7



DRAFT RESOLUTION 2009-769
JULY 22, 2009

MECHANICAL INSPECTOR OR OTHER SIMILAR DESIGNATION IS USED IN
THIS CHAPTER OR IN·ANY OF THE TECHNiCAL CODES, IT SHALL BE
CONSTRUED TO MEAN THE BUILDING OFFICIAL.

BUILDING SERVICE EQUIPMENT - THE PLUMBING, MECHANICAL,
ELECTRICAL AND ELEVATOR EQUIPMENT INCLUDING PIPING, WIRING,
FIXTURES AND OTHER ACCESSORIES WHICH PROVIDE SANITATION,
LIGHTING, HEATING, VENTILATION, COOLING, REFRIGERATION, FIRE­
FIGHTING AND TRANSPORTATION FACILITIES ESSENTIAL TO THE
OCCUPANCY OF THE BUILDING OR STRUCTURE FOR ITS DESIGNATED
USE.

JURISDICTION - THE TOWN OF CAMP VERDE, ARIZONA.

OWNER - THE PERSON, AGENT, FIRM OR CORPORATION WITH LEGAL
OR EQUITABLE INTEREST IN A PROPERTY.

PERMIT - THE OFFICIAL DOCUMENT ISSUED BY THE BUILDING OFFICIAL
AUTHORIZING PERFORMANCE OF A SPECIFIED, LEGAL ACTIVITY.

SHALL - AS USEDT' T fEaFrN'iCAL CODES IS

:::~::07~:~02AJ IU' I
7-2-102.1 GENERAL. THIS CHAPTER AND THE TECHNICAL CODES SHALL
APPLY TO, AND SHALL GOVERN, PERMIT APPLICATIONS RECEIVED ON OR
AFTER THE EFFECTIVE DATE OF THE ORDINANCE, EXCEPT THE PROJECT
OWNER, AT THEIR DISCRETION AND PRIOR TO JULY 1, 2009, MAY REQUEST
SUCH PROJECT BE DESIGNED AND CONSTRUCTED UNDER THE
REQUIREMENTS OF THE ADMINISTRATIVE BUILDING CODE AND BUILDING
CODES OF THE TOWN OF CAMP VERDE IN EFFECT ON MARCH 3, 2004.

7-2-102.2 CONFLICTING PROVISIONS. WHEN CONFLICTING PROVISIONS OR
REQUIREMENTS OCCUR BETWEEN THIS CHAPTER, THE TECHNICAL CODES
AND OTHER CODES OR LAWS, THE MOST RESTRICTIVE PROVISIONS SHALL
GOVERN. WHEN CONFLICTS OCCUR BETWEEN THE TECHNICAL CODES,
THOSE PROVISIONS PROVIDING THE GREATER SAFETY TO LIFE AS
DETERMINED BY THE BUILDING OFFICIAL SHALL GOVERN.

IN OTHER CONFLICTS WHERE SANITATION, LIFE SAFETY OR FIRE SAFETY
ARE NOT INVOLVED, THE MOST RESTRICTIVE PROVISIONS SHALL GOVERN.
WHERE IN A SPECIFIC CASE DIFFERENT SECTIONS OF THE TECHNICAL
CODES SPECIFY DIFFERENT MATERIALS, METHODS OF CONSTRUCTION OR
OTHER REQUIREMENTS, THE MOST RESTRICTIVE SHALL GOVERN. WHEN

8



DRAFT RESOLUTION 2009-769
JULY 22, 2009

THERE IS A CONFLICT BETWEEN A GENERAL REQUIREMENT AND A SPECIFIC
REQUIREMENT, THE SPECIFIC REQUIREMENT SHALL BE APPLICABLE.

7-2-102.3 OTHER LAWS. THE PROVISIONS OF THIS CHAPTER AND THE
TECHNICAL CODES SHALL NOT BE DEEMED TO NULLIFY ANY PROVISIONS OF
THE TOWN OF CAMP VERDE CODE, STATE OR FEDERAL LAWS.

7-2-102.4 APPLICATION OF REFERENCES. REFERENCES TO CHAPTER OR
SECTION NUMBERS, OR TO PROVISIONS NOT SPECIFICALLY IDENTIFIED BY
NUMBER, SHALL BE CONSTRUED TO REFER TO SUCH CHAPTER, SECTION OR
PROVISION OF THIS CHAPTER OR THE TECHNICAL CODES.

7-2-102.5 REFERENCED CODES AND STANDARDS. THE CODES AND
STANDARDS REFERENCED IN THIS CHAPTER OR THE TECHNICAL CODES
SHALL BE CONSIDERED PART OF THE REQUIREMENTS OF THIS CHAPTER
AND THE TECHNICAL CODES TO THE PRESCRIBED EXTENT OF EACH
REFERENCE. WHERE· DIFFERENCES OCCUR BETWEEN PROVISIONS OF THIS
CHAPTER OR THE TECHNICAL CODES AND THE REFERENCED CODES AND
STANDARDS, THE PROVISIONS OF THIS CHAPTER AND THE TECHNICAL
CODES SHALL APPLY

Ff"~~'DE OVISION WOULD
D EQUIP ENT OR APPLIANCE,

A "1I""'iliu'li:
INUFACT RER'S INSTRUCTIONS

7-2-102.6 INTERNATIONAL CODES REFERENCES. WITHIN THE TECHNICAL
CODES AND THE REFERENCED CODES AND STANDARDS THEREIN, SPECIFIC
REFERENCES TO THE FOLLOWING INTERNATIONAL CODES SHALL BE
DEEMED AND INTERPRETED TO MEAN THE SPECIFIC TOWN OF CAMP VERDE
CODES AS LISTED HEREIN:

1. INTERNATIONAL BUILDING CODE
2. INTERNATIONAL RESIDENTIAL CODE
3. NATIONAL ELECTRICAL CODE
4. INTERNATIONAL PLUMBING CODE
5. INTERNATIONAL MECHANICAL CODE
6. INTERNATIONAL FUEL GAS CODE
7. INTERNATIONAL EXISTING BUILDING CODE
8. INTERNATIONAL ENERGY CONSERVATION CODE

7-2-102.7 PARTIAL INVALIDITY. IN THE EVENT ANY PART OR PROVISION OF
THIS CHAPTER OR THE TECHNICAL CODES IS HELD TO BE INVALID, ILLEGAL,
UNCONSTITUTIONAL OR VOID, SUCH RULING SHALL NOT AFFECT THE

9



DRAFT RESOLUTION 2009-769
JULY 22, 2009

VALIDITY OF THE REMAINING PORTIONS OF THIS CHAPTER OR THE
TECHNICAL CODES.

7-2-102.8 ADDITIONS, ALTERATIONS AND REPAIRS. ADDITIONS, ALTERATIONS
OR REPAIRS MAY BE MADE TO A BUILDING OR ITS BUILDING SERVICE
EQUIPMENT WITHOUT REQUIRING THE EXISTING BUILDING OR ITS BUILDING
SERVICE EQUIPMENT TO COMPLY WITH ALL THE REQUIREMENTS OF THIS
CHAPTER AND THE TECHNICAL CODES, PROVIDED THE ADDITION,
ALTERATION OR REPAIR CONFORMS TO THE REQUIREMENTS FOR A NEW
BUILDING OR BUILDING SERVICE EQUIPMENT. REFER TO SECTION 7-2-101.4.7,
FOR ADDITIONAL OPTIONS GOVERNING ADDITIONS, ALTERATIONS AND
REPAIRS.

7-2-102.9 EXISTING BUILDINGS OR STRUCTURES. THE LEGAL OCCUPANCY OF
ANY BUILDING OR STRUCTURE EXISTING ON THE DATE OF THE ADOPTION OF
THIS CHAPTER SHALL BE PERMITTED TO CONTINUE WITHOUT CHANGE,
PROVIDED SUCH CONTINUED USE IS NOT DANGEROUS TO LIFE, HEALTH AND
SAFETY AS DETERMINED BY THE BUILDING OFFICIAL.

7-2-102.10 MAINTEN . BUIl..PINGS, S,.RUC UILDING SERVICE

~~~~~~I~~~ ~X~~I E'A·~~r"?~ .Ii \ T~ DE E~~RBE
SAFEGUARDS, REQ ~\ t'~ ODES';ti ALL BE MAINTAINED
IN CONFORMANCE EJ!!' •A C UNDERiWHICH INSTALLED.
THE OWNER OR THE OWNER'S DESIGNATED AGENT SHALL BE RESPONSIBLE
FOR THE MAINTENANCE OF BUILDING STRUCTURES AND THEIR BUILDING
SERVICE EQUIPMENT. TO DETERMINE COMPLIANCE WITH THIS SECTION, THE
BUILDING OFFICIAL MAY CAUSE A STRUCTURE TO BE RE-INSPECTED.

7-2-102.11 MOVED BUILDINGS. BUILDINGS, STRUCTURES AND THEIR BUILDING
SERVICE EQUIPMENT MOVED INTO OR WITHIN THIS JURISDICTION SHALL

.COMPLY WITH THE PROVISIONS OF THE TECHNICAL CODES FOR NEW
BUILDINGS OR STRUCTURES AND THEIR BUILDING SERVICE EQUIPMENT.

7-2-102.12 HISTORIC BUILDINGS. REPAIRS, ALTERATIONS AND ADDITIONS
NECESSARY FOR THE PRESERVATION, RESTORATION, REHABILITATION OR
CONTINUED USE OF A BUILDING, STRUCTURE, OR ITS BUILDING SERVICE
EQUIPMENT MAY BE MADE WITHOUT CONFORMING TO THE REQUIREMENTS
OF THE TECHNICAL CODES WHEN AUTHORIZED BY THE BUILDING OFFICIAL
PROVIDED:

1. THE BUILDING OR STRUCTURE HAS BEEN DESIGNATED BY OFFICIAL
ACTION OF THE LEGALLY CONSTITUTED AUTHORITY AS HAVING
SPECIAL HISTORICAL OR ARCHITECTURAL SIGNIFICANCE, AND

10



DRAFT RESOLUTION 2009-769
JULY 22, 2009

2. UNSAFE CONDITIONS AS DESCRIBED IN THIS CHAPTER ARE
CORRECTED, AND

3. THE RESTORED BUILDING OR STRUCTURE AND ITS BUILDING SERVICE
EQUIPMENT WILL BE NO MORE HAZARDOUS BASED ON LIFE SAFETY,
FIRE-SAFETY AND SANITATION THAN THE EXISTING BUILDING AS
DETERMINED BY THE BUILDING OFFICIAL.

EXCEPTION: REPAIRS, ALTERATIONS AND ADDITIONS NECESSARY FOR
THE PRESERVATION, RESTORATION, REHABILITATION OR CONTINUED
USE OF A BUILDING, STRUCTURE, OR ITS BUILDING SERVICE
E;QUIPMENT SHALL BE PERMITTED TO COMPLY WITH THE PROVISIONS
OF THE INTERNATIONAL EXISTING BUILDING CODE.

SECTION 7-2-103 DUTIES AND POWERS OF BUILDING OFFICIAL

7-2-103.1 GENERAL. THERE IS HEREBY ESTABLISHED A CODE ENFORCEMENT
AGENCY OF THE COMMUNITY DEVELOPMENT DEPARTMENT OF THE TOWN OF
CAMP VERDE KNOWN AS THE BUILDING DIVISION UNDER THE
ADMINISTRATIVE A PE AL C G ILDING OFFICIAL.

7-2-103.2 DUTIES AN
AUTHORIZED AND D . PROVISibNS OF THIS
CHAPTER AND TEC C "DE . . DING OFFI(;IAL SHALL HAVE THE
AUTHORITY TO RENDER INTERPRETATIONS OF THIS CHAPTER AND THE
TECHNICAL CODES AND TO ADOPT POLICIES AND PROCEDURES IN ORDER
TO CLARIFY THE APPLICATION OF THEIR PROVISIONS~ SUCH
INTERPRETATIONS, POLICIES AND PROCEDURES SHALL BE IN COMPLIANCE
WITH THE INTENT AND PURPOSE OF THIS CHAPTER AND THE TECHNICAL
CODES. SUCH POLICIES AND PROCEDURES SHALL NOT HAVE THE EFFECT OF
WAIVING REQUIREMENTS SPECIFICALLY PROVIDED FOR IN THIS CHAPTER OR
THE TECHNICAL CODES.

7-2-103.3 DEPUTIES. IN ACCORDANCE WITH ANY APPLICABLE TOWN
PROCEDURES, AND WITH THE CONCURRENCE OF THE COMMUNITY
DEVELOPMENT DIRECTOR, THE BUILDING OFFICIAL SHALL HAVE THE
AUTHORITY TO APPOINT TECHNICAL OFFICERS, INSPECTORS, PLAN
EXAMINERS AND OTHER EMPLOYEES. SUCH EMPLOYEES SHALL HAVE
POWERS AS DELEGATED BY THE BUILDING OFFICIAL.

7-2-103.4 APPLICATIONS AND PERMITS. THE BUILDING OFFICIAL SHALL
RECEIVE APPLICATIONS, REVIEW CONSTRUCTION DOCUMENTS AND 'ISSUE
PERMITS FOR THE ERECTION, AND ALTERATION, DEMOLITION AND MOVING
OF BUILDINGS, STRUCTURES, AND BUILDING SERVICE EQUIPMENT, INSPECT
THE PREMISES WHERE SUCH PERMITS HAVE BEEN ISSUED AND ENFORCE

11



DRAFT RESOLUTION 2009-769
JULY 22, 2009

COMPLIANCE WITH THE PROVISIONS OF THIS CHAPTER AND THE TECHNICAL
CODES.

7-2-103.5 NOTICES AND ORDERS. THE BUILDING OFFICIAL SHALL ISSUE ALL
NECESSARY NOTICES OR ORDERS TO ENSURE COMPLIANCE WITH THIS
CHAPTER AND THE TECHNICAL CODES.

7-2-103.6 INSPECTIONS. THE BUILDING OFFICIAL SHALL MAKE ALL OF THE
REQUIRED INSPECTIONS, OR THE BUILDING OFFICIAL SHALL HAVE THE
AUTHORITY TO ACCEPT REPORTS OF INSPECTION BY APPROVED AGENCIES
OR INDIVIDUALS. REPORTS OF SUCH INSPECTIONS SHALL BE IN WRITING
AND BE CERTIFIED BY A RESPONSIBLE OFFICER OF SUCH APPROVED
AGENCY OR BY THE RESPONSIBLE INDIVIDUAL. THE BUILDING OFFICIAL IS
AUTHORIZED TO ENGAGE SUCH EXPERT OPINION AS DEEMED NECESSARY
TO REPORT UPON UNUSUAL TECHNICAL ISSUES THAT ARISE.

7-2-103.7 IDENTIFICATION. THE BUILDING OFFICIAL AND AUTHORIZED
DEPUTIES SHALL CARRY PROPER IDENTIFICATION WHEN INSPECTING
STRUCTURES OR PREMISES OR OTHERWISE IN THE PERFORMANCE OF
DUTIES UNDER THIS T THE H

7-2-103.8 RIGHT OF T C .. !:SABY T MAKE AN
INSPECTION TO EN '.~ Iv;. v'. eft THIS C PTER OR THE
TECHNICAL CODES, TE-SUILD '~c;1OFFICIA HAS REASONABLE
CAUSE TO BELIEVE THERE EXISTS IN A STRUCTURE OR UPON A PREMISES A
CONDITION CONTRARY TO OR IN VIOLATION OF THIS CHAPTER OR THE
TECHNICAL CODES MAKING THE STRUCTURE OR PREMISES UNSAFE,
DANGEROUS OR HAZARDOUS, THE BUILDING OFFICIAL IS AUTHORIZED TO
ENTER THE STRUCTURE OR PREMISES AT REASONABLE TIMES TO INSPECT
OR TO PERFORM THE DUTIES IMPOSED BY THIS CHAPTER OR THE
TECHNICAL CODES, PROVIDED THAT IF SUCH STRUCTURE OR PREMISES BE
OCCUPIED THAT CREDENTIALS BE PRESENTED TO THE OCCUPANT AND
ENTRY REQUESTED. IF SUCH STRUCTURE OR PREMISES IS UNOCCUPIED, THE
BUILDING OFFICIAL SHALL FIRST MAKE A REASONABLE EFFORT TO LOCATE
THE OWNER OR OTHER PERSON HAVING CHARGE OR CONTROL OF THE
STRUCTURE OR PREMISES AND REQUEST ENTRY. IF ENTRY IS REFUSED, THE
BUILDING OFFICfAL SHALL HAVE RECOURSE TO THE REMEDIES PROVIDED BY
LAW TO SECURE ENTRY.

7-2-103.9 DEPARTMENT RECORDS. THE BUILDING OFFICIAL SHALL KEEP
OFFICIAL RECORDS OF APPLICATIONS RECEIVED, APPROVED PLANS,
PERMITS AND CERTIFICATES ISSUED, FEES COLLECTED, REPORTS OF
INSPECTIONS, AND NOTICES AND ORDERS ISSUED..SUCH RECORDS SHALL
BE RETAINED IN THE OFFICIAL RECORDS FOR THE PERIOD REQUIRED FOR
RETENTION BY STATE OR LOCAL LAW OR ORDINANCES.

12



DRAFT RESOLUTION 2009-769
JULY 22, 2009

7-2-103.10 LIABILITY. THE BUILDING OFFICIAL, MEMBERS OF THE BOARD OF
APPEALS OR ANY EMPLOYEE CHARGED WITH THE ENFORCEMENT OF THIS
CHAPTER OR TECHNICAL CODES, WHILE ACTING FOR THE JURISDICTION IN
GOOD FAITH AND WITHOUT MALICE IN THE DISCHARGE OF THE DUTIES
REQUIRED BY THIS CHAPTER, TECHNICAL CODES OR OTHER PERTINENT LAW
OR ORDINANCE, SHALL NOT THEREBY BE RENDERED LIABLE PERSONALLY
AND IS HEREBY RELIEVED FROM PERSONAL LIABILITY FOR ANY DAMAGE
ACCRUING TO PERSONS OR PROPERTY AS A RESULT OF ANY ACT OR BY
REASON OF AN ACT OR OMISSION IN THE DISCHARGE OF OFFICIAL DUTIES.
ANY SUIT INSTITUTED AGAINST AN OFFICER OR EMPLOYEE IN THE LAWFUL
DISCHARGE OF DUTIES AND UNDER THE PROVISIONS OF THIS LEGAL
REPRESENTATIVE OF THE JURISDICTION SHALL DEFEND CHAPTER OR
TECHNICAL CODES UNTIL THE FINAL TERMINATION OF THE PROCEEDINGS.
THE BUILDING OFFICIAL OR ANY SUBORDINATE SHALL NOT BE LIABLE FOR
COST IN ANY ACTION; SUIT OR PRECEDING THAT IS INSTITUTED IN
PURSUANCE OF THE PROVISIONS OF THIS CHAPTER OR TECHNICAL CODES.

7-2-103.11 APPROVED MATERIALS AND EQUIPMENT. MATERIALS, EQUIPMENT
AND DEVICES APPROVE BY THE BUILDING OFFICI L BE

~_,W€;m

CONSTRUCTED AN C A' CEW H APPROVAL.

7-2-103.11.1 USED M
MATERIALS MEETIN R I UENTS" HIS CH~PTER OR THE
TECHNICAL CODES FOR NEW MATERIALS IS PERMITTED. USED EQUIPMENT
AND DEVICES SHALL NOT BE REUSED UNLESS APPROVED BY THE BUILDING
OFFICIAL.

7-2-103.12 MODIFICATIONS. WHEREVER THERE ARE PRACTICAL DIFFICULTIES
INVOLVED IN CARRYING OUT THE PROVISIONS OF THIS CHAPTER OR THE
TECHNICAL CODES, THE BUILDING OFFICIAL SHALL HAVE THE AUTHORITY TO
GRANT,MODIFICATIONS FOR INDIVIDUAL CASES, UPON APPLICATION OF THE
OWNER OR OWNER'S REPRESENTATIVE, PROVIDED THE BUILDING OFFICIAL
SHALL FIRST FIND THAT SPECIAL INDIVIDUAL REASON MAKES THE STRICT
LETTER OF THE CODES IMPRACTICAL AND THE MODIFICATION IS IN
COMPLIANCE WITH THE INTENT AND PURPOSE OF THIS CHAPTER AND THE
TECHNICAL CODES AND THAT SUCH MODIFICATION DOES NOT LESSEN
HEALTH, ACCESSIBILITY, LIFE AND FIRE SAFETY, OR STRUCTURAL
REQUIREMENTS. THE DETAILS OF ACTION GRANTING MODIFICATIONS SHALL
BE RECORDED AND ENTERED IN THE FILES OF BUILDING DIVISION.

7-2-1 03.13 ALTERNATIVE MATERIALS, DESIGN AND METHODS OF
CONSTRUCTION AND EQUIPMENT. TI-lE PROVISIONS OF THIS CHAPTER AND
THE TECHNICAL CODES ARE NOT INTENDED TO PREVENT THE INSTALLATION
OF ANY MATERIAL OR TO PROHIBIT ANY DESIGN OR METHOD OF

13



DRAFT RESOLUTION 2009-769
JULY 22, 2009

CONSTRUCTION NOT SPECIFICALLY PRESCRIBED BY THIS CHAPTER OR THE
TECHNICAL CODES, PROVIDED ANY SUCH ALTERNATIVE IS APPROVED BY
THE BUILDING OFFICIAL. AN ALTERNATIVE MATERIAL, DESIGN OR METHOD
OF CONSTRUCTION MAY BE APPROVED WHERE THE BUILDING OFFICIAL
FINDS THE PROPOSED DESIGN IS SATISFACTORY AND COMPLIES WITH THE
INTENT OF THE PROVISIONS OF THIS CHAPTER AND THE TECHNICAL CODES,
AND THE MATERIAL, METHOD OR WORK OFFERED IS, FOR THE PURPOSE
INTENDED, AT LEAST THE EQUIVALENT OF THAT PRESCRIBED IN THIS
CHAPTER AND THE TECHNICAL CODES IN QUALITY, STRENGTH,
EFFECTIVENESS, FIRE RESISTANCE, DURABILITY AND SAFETY. RECORDS OF
ALTERNATIVE MATERIALS, DESIGN AND METHODS OF CONSTRUCTION
APPROVALS SHALL BE RECORDED AND ENTERED IN THE FILES OF THE
BUILDING DIVISION.

7-2-103.13.1 RESEARCH REPORTS. SUPPORTING DATA, WHERE DEEMED
NECESSARY TO ASSIST IN THE APPROVAL OF MATERIALS OR ASSEMBLIES
NOT SPECIFICALLY PROVIDED FOR IN THIS CHAPTER OR THE TECHNICAL
CODES SHALL BE PROVIDED AND SHALL CONSIST OF VALID RESEARCH
REPORTS FROM APPROVED SOURCES.

DENCE OF
IS ' TE R THE TECHNICAL

t, DOES .... T CONFORM TO THE
REQUIREMENTS OF HAPT" . T ECHNICAtJ'CODES, OR IN ORDER
TO SUBSTANTIATE CLAIMS FOR ALTERNATIVE MATERIALS OR METHODS, THE
BUILDING OFFICIAL SHALL HAVE THE AUTHORITY TO REQUIRE TESTS AS
EVIDENCE OF COMPLIANCE TO BE MADE AT NO EXPENSE TO THE TOWN.
TEST METHODS SHALL BE AS SPECIFIED IN THIS CHAPTER OR THE
TECHNICAL CODES OR BY OTHER RECOGNIZED TEST STANDARDS. IN THE
ABSENCE OF RECOGNIZED AND ACCEPTED TEST METHODS, THE BUILDING
OFFICIAL MAY APPROVE THE TESTING PROCEDURES. TESTS SHALL BE
PERFORMED BY AN APPROVED AGENCY. THE BUILDING OFFICIAL FOR THE
PERIOD REQUIRED IN SECTION 7-2-103.9 OF THIS CHAPTER SHALL RETAIN
REPORTS OF SUCH TESTS.

7-2-103.14 STOP WORK ORDERS. WHENEVER THE BUILDING OFFICIAL FINDS
ANY WORK REGULATED BY THIS CHAPTER OR THE TECHNICAL CODES BEING
PERFORMED IN A MANNER EITHER CONTRARY TO THE PROVISIONS OF THIS
CHAPTER OR THE TECHNICAL CODES OR DANGEROUS OR UNSAFE, THE
BUILDING OFFICIAL IS AUTHORIZED TO ISSUE A STOP WORK ORDER.

7-2-103.14.1 ISSUANCE. THE STOP WORK ORDER SHALL BE IN WRITING AND
SHALL BE GIVEN TO THE OWNER OF THE PROPERTY INVOLVED, OR TO THE
OWNER'S AGENT, OR TO THE PERSON DOING THE WORK. UPON ISSUANCE OF
A STOP WORK ORDER, THE CITED WORK SHALL IMMEDIATELY CEASE. THE

14



DRAFT RESOLUTION 2009-769
JULY 22, 2009

STOP WORK ORDER SHALL STATE THE REASON FOR THE ORDER, AND THE
CONDITIONS UNDER WHICH THE CITED WORK WILL BE PERMITTED TO
RESUME.

7-2-103.14.2 UNLAWFUL CONTINUANCE. ANY PERSON WHO SHALL CONTINUE
ANY WORK AFTER HAVING BEEN SERVED WITH A STOP WORK ORDER,
EXCEPT SUCH WORK AS THAT PERSON IS DIRECTED TO PERFORM TO
REMOVE A VIOLATION OR UNSAFE CONDITION, SHALL BE SUBJECT TO
PENALTIES AS PRESCRIBED BY THIS CHAPTER AND THE LAW.

7-2-103.14.3 APPEALS. ANY PERSON AGGRIEVED BY A STOP WORK ORDER
ISSUED BY THE BUILDING OFFICIAL MAY APPEAL SUCH STOP WORK ORDER
TO THE APPROPRIATE TECHNICAL CODES BOARD OF APPEALS IN
ACCORDANCE WITH THE REQUIREMENTS OF THIS CHAPTER.

7-2-103.15 OCCUPANCY VIOLATIONS. WHEN A BUILDING OR STRUCTURE OR
BUILDING SERVICE EQUIPMENT THEREIN REGULATED BY THIS CHAPTER AND
THE TECHNICAL CODES IS BEING USED CONTRARY TO THE PROVISIONS OF
SUCH CODES, THE BUILDING OFFICIAL MAY ORDER SUCH USE DISCONTINUI;D
BY WRITTEN NOTICIi"!iB~~,RVED N ANY PERSO I CH USE TO BE
CONTINUED. SUCH 'ifR' ttl'! A R ICE,
DISCONTINUE THE W" TI ED Y THE BUILDING
OFFICIAL AND MAK U~!~~ , "lt1j E, OR P RTION THEREOF,
COMPLY WITH THE E ENTS'\0F SUGH 'eODES.

7-2-103.16 AUTHORITY TO DISCONNECT UTILITIES. THE BUILDING OFFICIAL
SHALL HAVE THE AUTHORITY TO DISCONNECT A UTILITY SERVICE OR
ENERGY SUPPLIED TO THE BUILDING, STRUCTURE OR BUILDING SERVICE
EQUIPMENT THEREIN REGULATED BY THIS CHAPTER OR THE TECHNICAL
CODES IN CASE OF EMERGENCY WHERE NECESSARY TO ELIMINATE AN
IMMEDIATE HAZARD TO LIFE OR PROPERTY. THE BUILDING OFFICIAL SHALL
WHENEVER POSSIBLE NOTIFY THE SERVING UTILITY, THE OWNER AND
OCCUPANT OF THE BUILDING, STRUCTURE OR BUILDING SERVICE
EQUIPMENT OF THE DECISION TO DISCONNECT PRIOR TO TAKING SUCH
ACTION, AND SHALL NOTIFY SUCH SERVING UTILITY, OWNER AND OCCUPANT
OF THE BUILDING, STRUCTURE OR BUILDING SERVICE EQUIPMENT, IN
WRITING, OF SUCH DISCONNECTION IMMEDIATELY THEREAFTER.

7-2-103.17 AUTHORITY TO CONDEMN BUILDING SERVICE EQUIPMENT. WHEN
THE BUILDING OFFICIAL DETERMINES THAT BUILDING SERVICE EQUIPMENT
REGULATED IN THE TECHNICAL CODES HAS BECOME HAZARDOUS TO LIFE,
HEALTH OR PROPERTY, OR HAS BECOME UNSANITARY, THE BUILDING
OFFICIAL SHALL ORDER IN WRITING THAT SUCH EQUIPMENT EITHER BE
REMOVED OR RESTORED TO A SAFE OR SANITARY CONDITION, AS
APPROPRIATE. THE WRITTEN NOTICE SHALL FIX A TIME LIMIT FOR

15



DRAFT RESOLUTION 2009-769
JULY 22, 2009

COMPLIANCE WITH SUCH ORDER. DEFECTIVE BUILDING SERVICE EQUIPMENT
SHALL NOT BE USED, OPERATED OR MAINTAINED AFTER RECEIVING SUCH
NOTICE.

7-2-103.17.1. WHEN SUCH EQUIPMENT OR INSTALLATION IS TO BE
DISCONNECTED, A WRITTEN NOTICE OF SUCH DISCONNECTION AND CAUSES
THEREFORE SHALL BE GIVEN WITHIN 24 HOURS TO THE SERVING UTILITY,
THE OWNER AND OCCUPANT OF SUCH BUILDING, STRUCTURE OR PREMISES,
UNLESS AN EMERGENCY EXIST UNDER SECTION 7-2-103.16 OF THIS CHAPTER.

7-2-103.17.2. WHEN ANY BUILDING SERVICE EQUIPMENT IS USED, OPERATED
OR MAINTAINED IN VIOLATION OF THE TECHNICAL CODES AND IN VIOLATION
OF A NOTICE ISSUED PURSUANT TO THE PROVISIONS OF THIS SECTION, THE
INDIVIDUAL OR INDIVIDUALS RESPONSIBLE FOR CONTINUED USE,
OPERATION OR MAINTENANCE SHALL BE SUBJECT TO THE PENALTIES
DESCRIBED IN THIS CHAPTER AND THE BUILDING OFFICIAL SHALL INSTITUTE
APPROPRIATE ACTION TO PREVENT, RESTRAIN, CORRECT OR ABATE THE
VIOLATION.

7-2-103.18 CONNEC RSONS SHALL
NOT MAKE CONNEC ER SUPPLY NOR
SUPPLY ENERGY 0 QUI4~MENT THAT HAS
BEEN DISCONNECT CONNEOiifED OR THE USE HAS
BEEN ORDERED TO CaNTIN' BUILDING OFFICIAL UNTIL THE
BUILDING OFFICIAL AUTHORIZES THE RECONNECTION AND USE OF SUCH
EQUIPMENT.

SECTION 7-2-104 PERMITS

7-2-104.1 REQUIRED. ANY OWNER OR AUTHORIZED AGENT WHO INTENDS TO
CONSTRUCT, ENLARGE, ALTER, REPAIR, MOVE, DEMOLISH, OR CHANGE THE
OCCUPANCY OF A BUILDING OR STRUCTURE, OR TO ERECT, INSTALL,
ENLARGE, ALTER, REPAIR, REMOVE, CONVERT OR REPLACE ANY
ELECTRICAL, GAS, MECHANICAL OR PLUMBING SYSTEM, THE INSTALLATION
OF WHICH IS REGULATED BY THIS CHAPTER OR THE TECHNICAL CODES, OR
TO CAUSE SUCH WORK TO BE DONE, SHALL FIRST MAKE APPLICATION TO
THE BUILDING OFFICIAL AND OBTAIN THE REQUIRED PERMIT OR PERMITS.

EXCEPTIONS:

1. FEDERAL DEVELOPMENTS ON FEDERAL OWN LAND.

2. ANNUAL PERMIT HOLDER.

3. CONSTRUCTION OR OPERATION INCIDENTAL TO CONSTRUCTION
AND REPAIR TO IRRIGATION AND DRAINAGE DITCHES OR

16



DRAFT RESOLUTION 2009-769
JULY 22, 2009

APPURTENANCES THERETO, OF REGULARLY CONSTITUTED
DISTRICTS OR RECLAMATION DISTRICTS OR CLEARING OR OTHER
WORK UPON LAND IN RURAL AREAS FOR FIRE PREVENTION
PURPOSES.

4. DEVICES USED IN MANUFACTURING, PROCESSING OR FABRICATING
NORMALLY CONSIDERED AS INVOLVED IN INDUSTRY AND
CONSTRUCTION OF NON-MANNED STRUCTURES FOR THE
OPERATION AND MAINTENANCE OF ELECTRIC, GAS OR OTHER
PUBLIC UTILITY SYSTEMS OPERATED BY PUBLIC SERVICE
CORPORATIONS OPERATING UNDER A FRANCHISE OR CERTIFICATE
OF CONVENIENCE AND NECESSITY.

7-2-104.2 WORK EXEMPT FROM PERMIT. EXEMPTIONS FROM PERMIT
REQUIREMENTS OF THIS CHAPTER SHALL NOT BE DEEMED TO GRANT
AUTHORIZATION FOR ANY WORK TO BE DONE IN ANY MANNER IN VIOLATION
OF THE PROVISIONS OF THIS CHAPTER OR THE TECHNICAL CODES OR ANY
OTHER LAWS OR ORDINANCES OF THE TOWN. PERMITS SHALL NOT BE
REQUIRED FOR THE FOLLOWING:

~g~~~~g~~~~~ P "IViIT'TOT BE REQUIRED

A. ONE-5T·· T E ' Y STRUITURES ANCILLARY
TO DETACHED ONE AND TWO FAMILY DWELLINGS USED AS TOOL
AND STORAGE SHEDS, PLAYHOUSES AND SIMILAR USES,
PROVIDED THE FLOOR AREA DOES NOT EXCEED 420 200 SQUARE
FEET (~ 18.5 M2 SQUARED).

B. FENCES NOT MORE THAN 6 FEET (1829 MM) HIGH.

C. OIL DERRICKS.

D. RETAINING WALLS WHICH ARE NOT OVER 4 FEET (914 MM) IN
HEIGHT MEASURED FROM THE BOTTOM OF THE FOOTING TO THE
TOP OF THE WALL, PROVIDED THE RETAINING WALL IS NOT
SUPPORTING A SURCHARGE, IS NOT IMPOUNDING CLASS I, II OR
III-A LIQUIDS.

E. WATER TANKS SUPPORTED DIRECTLY ON GRADE IF THE
CAPACITY DOES NOT EXCEED 5,000 GALLONS (18925 L) AND THE
RATIO OF HEIGHT TO DIAMETER OR WIDTH DOES NOT EXCEED 2
TO 1.

17



DRAFT RESOLUTION 2009-769
JULY 22, 2009

F~ SIDEWALKS AND DRIVEWAYS NOT MORE THAN 30 INCHES (762
MM) ABOVE GRADE AND NOT OVER ANY BASEMENT OR STORY
BELOW AND NOT PART OF AN ACCESSIBLE ROUTE.

G. PAINTING, PAPERING, TILING, CARPETING, CABINETS, COUNTER
TOPS AND SIMILAR FINISH WORK.

H. TEMPORARY MOTION PICTURE, TELEVISION AND THEATER
STAGE SETS AND SCENERY.

I. PREFABRICATED SWIMMING POOLS ACCESSORY TO DETACHED
ONE- AND TWO-FAMILY DWELLINGS, WHICH ARE LESS THAN 24
INCHES (610 MM) DEEP, DO NOT EXCEED 5,000 GALLONS (18925 L)
AND ARE INSTALLED ENTIRELY ABOVE GROUND (A PERMIT IS
REQUIRED FOR THE REQUIRED POOL BARRIERS).

J. SWINGS AND OTHER PLAYGROUND EQUIPMENT.

K. WINDOW AWNINGS SUPPORTED BY AN EXTERIOR WALL
PROJECTING NO
EXTERI~'
LINE, AMp N
ONE-AND

WJ,l

OCCUP~

L. MOVABLE CASES, COUNTERS AND PARTITIONS NOT OVER 5 FEET
9 INCHES (1753 MM) IN HEIGHT.

M. REPLACEMENT ROOF COVERING PROVIDED THE REPLACEMENT
ROOF COVERING CLASSIFICATION IS EQUAL TO OR GREATER
THAN THE EXISTING ROOFING CLASSIFICATION AND DOES NOT
INCREASE THE LOADS IMPOSED UPON THE ROOF STRUCTURAL
FRAME.

7-2-104.2.2 ELECTRICAL PERMITS. AN ELECTRICAL PERMIT SHALL NOT BE
REQUIRED FOR THE FOLLOWING:

A. MINOR REPAIR WORK, INCLUDING THE REPLACEMENT OF LAMPS
OR THE CONNECTION OF APPROVED PORTABLE ELECTRICAL
EQUIPMENT TO APPROVE PERMANENTLY INSTALLED
RECEPTACLES.

B. THE PROVISIONS OF THIS CODE SHALL NOT APPLY TO
ELECTRICAL EQUIPMENT USED FOR RADIO AND TELEVISION
TRANSMISSIONS, BUT DO APPLY TO EQUIPMENT AND WIRING

18



DRAFT RESOLUTION 2009-769
JULY 22, 2009

FOR A POWER SUPPLY AND THE INSTALLATIONS OF TOWERS
AND ANTENNAS.

C. TEMPORARY DECORATIVE LIGHTING.

D. A PERMIT SHALL NOT BE REQUIRED FOR THE INSTALLATION OF
ANY TEMPORARY SYSTEM REQUIRED FOR THE TESTING OR
SERVICING OF ELECTRICAL EQUIPMENT OR APPARATUS.

E. LOW-ENERGY POWER, CONTROL AND SIGNAL CIRCUITS OF
CLASS II AND CLASS III AS DEFINED IN THE ELECTRICAL CODE
NOT INSTALL IN HAZARDOUS LOCATIONS, AS DEFINED IN
ARTICLE SOO.INSTALLATION, ALTERATION OR REPAIR OF
ELECTRICAL WIRING, APPARATUS OR EQUIPMENT OR THE
GENERATION, TRANSMISSION, DISTRIBUTION OR METERING OF
ELECTRICAL ENERGY OR IN THE OPERATION OF SIGNALS OR THE
TRANSMISSION OF INTELLIGENCE BY A PUBLIC OR PRIVATE
UTILITY IN tHE EXERCISE OF ITS FUNCTION AS A SERVING
UTILITY.

" 01t(RTMETERED POWER

A Irf~.rs,.:,11 D INI'.,.;TALLED BY AN
I ~l. ,,~

I 'li_~,

(FPN :) A TEMPORARY METERED POWER OUTLET IS A DEVICE,
DESIGNED TO BE INSTALLED IN THE ELECTRIC UTILITY METER
SOCKET THAT PROVIDES METERED ELECTRICAL POWER TO
RECEPTACLES MOUNTED ON OR IN THE DEVICE, FOR THE
PURPOSE OF PROVIDING TEMPORARY CONSTRUCTION POWER
TO A RESIDENTIAL BUILDING. SUCH DEVICES MAY NOT ENERGIZE
THE METER SOCKET, LUGS OR EQUIPMENT ON THE CUSTOMER'S
SIDE OF THE METER SOCKET. THE TEMPORARY METERED POWER
OUTLET SHALL BE AN APPROVED DEVICE WITH AN AIC RATING
HIGHER THAN THE AVAILABLE FAULT CURRENT PROVIDED AT
THE METER.

F. INSTAL
OUTLE
ELECT

SUCH DEVICES MAY BE INSTALLED ON RESIDENTIAL BUILDINGS
WHEN A VALID BUILDING PERMIT HAS BEEN, ISSUED, PROVIDED
THAT THE STRUCTURAL INTEGRITY AND WEATHER RESISTIVE
BARRIER IS MAINTAINED AT THE PANEL LOCATION, OR THE
INSTALLATION IS DETAILED ON THE APPROVED BUILDING PLANS.
THIS EXEMPTION FROM PERMITTING DOES NOT PROHIBIT OR
LIMIT THE AUTHORITY HAVING JURISDICTION FROM DIRECTING
THE ELECTRIC UTILITY TO DISCONNECT THE TEMpORARY

19



DRAFT RESOLUTION 2009-769
JULY 22, 2009

7-2-104.2.3 FUEL GAS PERMITS. A FUEL GAS PERMIT SHALL NOT BE
REQUIRED FOR THE FOLLOWING:

A. PORTABLE HEATING APPLIANCE.

B. REPLACEMENT OF ANY MINOR PART THAT DOES NOT ALTER
APPROVAL OF EQUIPMENT OR MAKE SUCH EQUIPMENT UNSAFE.

7-2-104.2.4 MECHANICAL PERMITS. A MECHANICAL PERMIT SHALL NOT BE
REQUIRED FOR THE FOLLOWING:

A. PORTABLE HEATING APPLIANCE.

B. PORTABLE VENTILATION EQUIPMENT.

C.. PORTABLE COOLING UNIT.

D. STEAM, HOT OR CHILLED WATER PIPING WITHIN ANY HEATING OR
COOLING EQUIPMENT REGULATED BY INTERNATIONAL
MECHANI CO

ITS APPROVAL OR

F. PORTABLE EVAPORATIVE COOLER.

G. SELF-CONTAINED REFRIGERATION SYSTEM CONTAINING 10
POUNDS (4.54 KG) OR LESS OF REFRIGERANT AND ACTUATED BY
MOTORS OF 1 HORSEPOWER (746 W) OR LESS.

7-2-104.2.5 PLUMBING PERMITS. A PLUMBING PERMIT S.HALL NOT BE
REQUIRED FOR THE FOLLOWING:

A. STOPPING OF LEAKS IN DRAINS, WATER, SOIL, WASTE OR VENT
PIPE, EXCEPT, NOT INCLUDING DEFECTIVE CONCEALED TRAP,
DRAINPIPE, WATER, SOIL, WASTE OR VENT PIPE REQUIRING
REMOVAL AND REPLACEMENT.

B. THE CLEARING OF STOPPAGES OR THE REPAIRING OF LEAKS IN
PIPES, VALVES OR FIXTURES AND THE REMOVAL AND
REINSTALLATION OF WATER CLOSETS, PROVIDED SUCH REPAIRS
DO NOT INVOLVE OR REQUIRE THE REPLACEMENT OR
REARRANGEMENT OF VALVES, PIPES OR FIXTURES.

20



DRAFT RESOLUTION 2009-769
JULY 22, 2009

7-2-104.3 EMERGENCY REPAIRS. WHERE EQUIPMENT REPLACEMENTS AND
REPAIRS REQUIRING A PERMIT MUST BE PERFORMEDIN AN EMERGENCY
SITUATION, THE PERMIT APPLICATION SHALL BE SUBMITTED WITHIN THE
NEXT WORKING BUSINESS DAY. .

7-2-104.4 ORDINARY REPAIRS. APPLICATION OR NOTICE TO THE BUILDING
OFFICIAL IS NOT REQUIRED FOR ORDINARY REPAIRS TO STRUCTURES;
REPLACEMENT OF LAMPS OR THE CONNECTION OF APPROVED PORTABLE
ELECTRICAL EQUIPMENT TO APPROVE PERMANENTLY INSTALLED
RECEPTACLES. SUCH REPAIRS SHALL NOT INCLUDE THE CUTTING AWAY OF
ANY WALL, PARTITION OR PORTION THEREOF, THE REMOVAL OR CUTTING OF
ANY STRUCTURAL BEAM OR LOAD-BEARING SUPPORT, OR THE REMOVAL OR
CHANGE OF ANY REQUIRED MEANS OF EGRESS, OR REARRANGEMENT OF
PARTS OF A STRUCTURE AFFECTING THE EGRESS REQUIREMENTS; NOR
SHALL ORDINARY REPAIRS INCLUDE ADDITION TO, ALTERATION OF,
REPLACEMENT OR RELOCATION OF ANY STANDPIPE, WATER SUPPLY,
SEWER, DRAINAGE, DRAIN LEADER, GAS, SOIL, WASTE, VENT OR SIMILAR
PIPING, ELECTRICAL WIRING OR MECHANICAL OR OTHER WORK AFFECTING
PUBLIC HEALTH OR GENERAL SAFETY.

BE REQUIRED
Ellj~DF G"NERATION,

R OTH~i RELATED
TROL O~PUBLIC SERVICE

NOTHING IN THIS SECTION SHALL BE CONSTRUED TO EXEMPT ANY
ELECTRICAL INSTALLATION USED FO.R LIGHTING, POWER, HEATING,
VENTILATION, ELEVATORS PUMPING OR FOR OTHER BUILDING OR PREMISE
OPERATIONS, NOR EXEMPT ANY SERVICE EQUIPMENT FOR ELECTRICAL
SERVICE TO A BUILDING OR PREMISE

7-2-104.6 ANNUAL PERMITS.

7-2-104.6.1 SCOPE. IN LIEU OF AN INDIVIDUAL PERMIT FOR EACH ALTERATION
TO AN ALREADY APPROVED ELECTRICAL, GAS, MECHANICAL OR PLUMBING
INSTALLATION, THE BUILDING OFFICIAL IS AUTHORIZED TO ISSUE AN
ANNUAL PERMIT UPON APPLICATION THEREFORE TO ANY PERSON, FIRM OR
CORPORATION REGULARLY EMPLOYING ONE OR MORE QUALIFIED
TRADESPERSONS IN THE BUILDING, STRUCTURE OR ON THE PREMISES
OWNED OR OPERATED BY THE APPLICANT FOR PERMIT.

7-2-104.6.2 QUALIFIED TRADESPERSON. A IS AN INDIVIDUAL THAT HOLDS ONE
OR MORE LICENSES FROM A NATIONALLY RECOGNIZED AGENCY IN THE
TRADE THAT WORK IS TO BE PERFORMED.

21



DRAFT RESOLUTION 2009-769
JULY 22, 2009

7-2-104.6.3 ANNUAL PERMIT RECORDS. THE PERSON TO WHOM AN ANNUAL
PERMIT IS ISSUED SHALL KEEP A DETAILED RECORD OF ALTERATIONS MADE
UNDER SUCH ANNUAL PERMIT. THE BUILDING OFFICIAL SHALL HAVE
ACCESS TO SUCH RECORDS AT ALL TIMES OR SUCH RECORDS SHALL BE
FILED WITH THE BUILDING OFFICIAL AS DESIGNATED.

7-2-104.7 TEMPORARY STRUCTURES AND USES. THE BUILDING OFFICIAL IS
AUTHORIZED TO GIVE PERMISSION TO TEMPORARILY SUPPLY AND USE
POWER IN PART OF AN ELECTRIC INSTALLATION BEFORE SUCH
INSTALLATION HAS BEEN FULLY COMPLETED AND THE FINAL CERTIFICATE
OF COMPLETION HAS BEEN ISSUED. THE PART COVERED BY THE
TEMPORARY CERTIFICATE SHALL COMPLY WITH THE REQUIREMENTS
SPECIFIED FOR TEMPORARY LIGHTING, HEAT OR POWER IN THE TECHNICAL
CODES.

7-2-104.8 APPLICATION FOR PERMIT.

1.

A. IDENTIF
PERMIT.

OVERED BY THE

B. DESCRIPTION OF THE LAND WHERE THE PROPOSED WORK IS TO
BE DONE BY LEGAL DESCRIPTION, STREET ADDRESS OR SIMILAR
DESCRIPTION THAT WILL READILY IDENTIFY AND DEFINITELY
LOCATE THE PROPOSED BUILDING OR WORK.

C. INDICATE THE USE AND OCCUPANCY OF THE PROPOSED WORK.

D. CONSTRUCTION DOCUMENTS AND OTHER INFORMATION AS
REQUIRED IN THIS SECTION.

E. THE VALUATION OF THE PROPOSED WORK.

F. THE SIGNATURE OF THE APPLICANT OR THE APPLICANT'S
AUTHORIZED AGENT.

G. OTHER DATA AND INFORMATION AS REQUIRED BY THE BUILDING
OFFICIAL.

22



DRAFT RESOLUTION 2009-769
JULY 22, 2009

7-2-104.9 ACTION ON APPLICATION. THE BUILDING OFFICIAL SHALL EXAMINE
OR CAUSE TO BE EXAMINED APPLICATIONS FOR PERMITS AND RELATED
DOCUMENTS WITHIN A REASONABLE TIME AFTER FILING. IF THE
APPLICATION OR THE CONSTRUCTION DOCUMENTS DO NOT CONFORM TO
THE REQUIREMENTS OF PERTINENT LAWS, THE BUILDING OFFICIAL SHALL
REJECT SUCH APPLICATION IN WRITING, IDENTIFYING THE REASONS FOR
REJECTION.

IF THE BUILDING OFFICIAL IS SATISFIED THAT THE PROPOSED WORK
CONFORMS TO THE REQUIREMENTS OF THIS CHAPTER, THE TECHNICAL
CODES AND APPLICABLE LAWS AND ORDINANCES THERETO, THE BUILDING
OFFICIAL SHALL ISSUE A PERMIT AS SOON AS PRACTICABLE, SUBJECT ONLY
TO THE PAYMENT OF APPROPRIATE FEES.

7-2-104.10 TIME LIMITATION OF APPLICATION. AN APPLICATION FOR A PERMIT
FOR ANY PROPOSED WORK SHALL BE DEEMED TO HAVE BEEN ABANDONED
AND EXPIRES 180 DAYS AFTER THE DATE OF FILING, UNLESS SUCH
APPLICATION HAS BEEN PURSUED IN GOOD FAITH OR A PERMIT HAS BEEN
ISSUED. THE BUILDING OFFICIAL IS AUTHORIZED TO GRANT ONE EXTENSION
OF TIME FOR AN ADWl!£>NA 10D NqT E DAYS. SUCH
EXTENSION SHALL SE"R U I - T FIABLE CAUSE
DEMONSTRATED. I

EXCEPTION: ,."jmf.emil,' 9 DA TE OF A LlCATION
EXPIRATION AND FOR THOSE APPLICATIONS WITH A READY TO ISSUE
STATUS PRIOR TO THE 360-DAY EXPIRATION DATE, THE APPLICANT
SHALL RESUBMIT PLANS AND PAY 50% OF THE CURRENT PERMIT FEES.

7-2-104.11 VALIDITY OF PERMIT. THE ISSUANCE OR GRANTING OF A PERMIT
SHALL NOT BE CONSTRUED TO BE A PERMIT FOR, OR AN APPROVAL OF, ANY
VIOLATION OF ANY OF THE PROVISIONS OF THIS CHAPTER, THE TECHNICAL
CODES OR OF ANY OTHER ORDINANCE OF THE JURISDICTION. PERMITS
PRESUMING TO GIVE AUTHORITY TO VIOLATE OR CANCEL THE PROVISIONS
OF THIS CHAPTER, THE TECHNICAL CODES OR OTHER ORDINANCES OF THE
JURISDICTION SHALL NOT BE VALID.

THE ISSUANCE OF A PERMIT BASED ON CONSTRUCTION DOCUMENTS AND
OTHER DATA SHALL NOT PREVENT THE BUILDING OFFICIAL FROM REQUIRING
THE CORRECTION OF ERRORS IN THE CONSTRUCTION DOCUMENTS OR IN
THE CONSTRUCTION.

THE BUILDING OFFICIAL IS ALSO AUTHORIZED TO PREVENT OCCUPANCY OR
USE OF A STRUCTURE WHERE IN VIOLATION OF THIS CHAPTER, THE
TECHNICAL CODES OR OF ANY OTHER ORDINANCES OF THIS JURISDICTION.
WORK SHALL BE INSTALLED IN ACCORDANCE WITH THE APPROVED

23



DRAFT RESOLUTION 2009-769
JULY 22, 2009

CONSTRUCTION DOCUMENTS, AND ANY CHANGES MADE DURING
CONSTRUCTION THAT ARE NOT IN COMPLIANCE WITH THE APPROVED
CONSTRUCTION DOCUMENTS SHALL BE RESUBMITTED FOR APPROVAL AS
AN AMENDED SET OF CONSTRUCTION DOCUMENTS.

7-2-104.12 EXPIRATION OF PERMIT. EVERY PERMIT ISSUED SHALL BECOME
INVALID UNLESS THE WORK ON THE SITE AUTHORIZED BY SUCH PERMIT IS
COMMENCED WITHIN 180 DAYS AFTER ITS ISSUANCE, OR IF THE WORK
AUTHORIZED ON THE SITE BY SUCH PERMIT IS SUSPENDED OR DECLARED
ABANDONED BYTHE OWNER FOR A PERIOD OF 180 DAYS AFTER THE DATE
THE WORK IS COMMENCED, OR IF THE BUILDING OFFICIAL DECLARES THE
PERMIT SUSPENDED OR ABANDONED AFTER THE EXPIRATION OF 180 DAYS
FROM THE DATE OF PERMIT ISSUANCE. THE BUILDING OFFICIAL IS
AUTHORIZED TO GRANT A ONE-TIME EXTENSION OF 180 DAYS IN
ACCORDANCE WITH SECTIONS 7-2-104.13.1 AND 7-2-104.13.2.

7-2-104.13.1 WORK NOT COMMENCED. EVERY PERMIT ISSUED UNDER THE
PROVISION OF THIS CHAPTER AND THE TECHNICAL CODE SHALL BE VALID
FOR A PERIOD OF ONE YEAR FROM THE DATE OF ISSUANCE PROVIDED,

~~:'~~~;'N~:6~ I LL E>S~IRg\~'iS ~~~~I~~~UCH
WITHIN 180 DAYS F lloM... . F. . ;Jb.··.~.~dN AI:?;.. ROVED INSPECTION
SHALL BE AN INSP . ,,' ;~~; .;:1(b AND A ;fROVED PURSUANT
TO SECTION 7-2-106. . 0 E W:>HK CA ie~ COMME . CED ON A
STRUCTURE FOR WHICH THE PERMIT HAS EXPIRED, A NEW PERMIT SHALL BE
OBTAINED AND THE FEE THEREFORE SHALL BE BASED ON THE TOTAL
VALUATION OF THE STRUCTURE.

EXCEPTION: WHERE NO WORK HAS COMMENCED WITHIN 180
DAYS FROM THE DATE OF ISSUANCE, THE PERMIT MAY BE
REINSTATED, .WITHOUT A FEE UPON A WRITTEN OR VERBAL
REQUEST FROM THE OWNER OR OWNER'S AGENT, PROVIDED
WORK COMMENCES AND AN APPROVED INSPECTION IS
OBTAINED WITHIN ONE YEAR OF THE ORIGINAL DATE OF
ISSUANCE.

7-2-104.13.2 WORK COMMENCED. EVERY PERMIT ISSUED UNDER THE
PROVISIONS OF THIS CODE SHALL BE VALID FOR A PERIOD OF ONE YEAR
FROM THE DATE OF ISSUANCE, PROVIDED, HOWEVER, THAT ANY PERMIT
SHALL EXPIRE 180 DAYS AFTER THE LAST APPROVED INSPECTION. AN
APPROVED INSPECTION SHALL BE AN INSPECTION THAT IS REQUESTED AND
APPROVED PURSUANT TO SECTION 7-2-106.5.

BEFORE WORK CAN BE CONTINUED OR RESUMED ON A STRUCTURE FOR
WHICH THE PERMIT HAS EXPIRED, A NEW PERMIT SHALL BE OBTAINED AND

24



DRAFT RESOLUTION 2009-769
JULY 22, 2009

THE FEE THEREOF SHALL BE DETERMINED BY THE BUILDING OFFICIAL ON
THE BASIS OF THE VALUATION OF THE UNCOMPLETED PORTION OF THE
WORK FROM THE LAST APPROVED INSPECTION.

EXCEPTIONS:

1. A PERMIT SHALL NOT EXPIRE IF THE TIME BETWEEN
APPROVED INSPECTIONS DOES NOT EXCEED 180 DAYS.

2. IF AN APPROVED INSPECTION IS NOT OBTAINED WITHIN 180
DAYS OF THE LAST APPROVED INSPECTION, THE PERMIT
MAY BE REINSTATED ONCE, WITHOUT A FEE UPON
WRITTEN OR VERBAL REQUEST FROM THE OWNER OR
OWNER'S AGENT PROVIDED THAT NO SUBSTANTIAL
CHANGES HAVE BEEN MADE IN THE ORIGINAL PLANS AND
SPECIFICATIONS FOR SUCH WORK AND PROVIDED
FURTHER THAT AN APPROVED INSPECTION IS OBTAINED
WITHIN ONE YEAR OF THE LAST APPROVED INSPECTION
AND THE TECHNICAL CODES HAVE NOT BEEN UPDATED.

7-2-104.14 UNFINISHI}5
J1Bi JL UC :ilt:"'ENEVERWORK HAS

~~~:~~~i~,OA~~ .~:LD ~ 'k. ~E PUR,:I~~b~~~~~~S7_2.
104.8, THE OWNER 0 P PERt PO", HICH STNuCTURE IS LOCATED,
OR OTHER PERSON OR AGENT IN CONTROL OF SAID PROPERTY, UPON
RECEIPT OF NOTICE IN WRITING FROM THE DEPARTMENT, SHALL WITHIN 30
DAYS FROM THE DATE OF SUCH WRITTEN NOTICE, OBTAIN A NEW PERMIT TO
COMPLETE THE WORK AND DILIGENTLY PURSUE THE WORK TO COMPLETION,
OR WITHIN SAID 30 DAYS, OBTAIN A DEMOLITION PERMIT AND SHALL
REMOVE OR DEMOLISH THE BUILDING OR STRUCTURE WITHIN 120 DAYS
FROM THE DATE OF WRITTEN NOTICE. NOTWITHSTANDING THE PROVISIONS
OF SECTION 7-2-104.8 AND THIS SECTION, WHENEVER WORK ON ANY
BUILDING, STRUCTURE, ADDITION, ALTERATION, APPENDAGE OR REPAIR
HAS COMMENCED, THE EXTERIOR WALLS AND ROOF SHALL BE COMPLETED
IN ACCORDANCE WITH THE APPROVED PLANS INCLUDING BUT NOT LIMITED
TO ROOFING, FENESTRATION AND FINISH MATERIALS INCLUDING PAINT,
WITHIN TWO YEARS OF COMMENCING CONSTRUCTION. IN THE ABSENCE OF
EVIDENCE TO THE CONTRARY, THE DATE OF THE FIRST INSPECTION
REQUEST SHALL ESTABLISH THE DATE THAT CONSTRUCTION COMMENCED.

THE PROVISIONS OF THIS SECTION SHALL APPLY TO ALL PERMITS ~SSUED

ON AND AFTER THE EFFECTIVE DATE OF THIS ORDINANCE AND PERMITS
ISSUED OR REINSTATED PURSUANT TO SECTION 7-2-104.8

25



DRAFT RESOLUTION 2009-769
JULY 22, 2009

SUCH BUILDING, STRUCTURE, ADDITION, ALTERATION, APPENDAGE OR
REPAIR NOT IN COMPLIANCE WITH THIS SECTION IS SUBJECT TO THE
ENFORCEMENT AND ABATEMENT PROCEDURES OF SECTION 7-2-109.

7-2-104.15 SUSPENSION OR REVOCATION. THE BUILDING OFFICIAL IS
AUTHORIZED TO SUSPEND OR REVOKE A PERMIT ISSUED UNDER THE
PROVISIONS OF THIS CHAPTER WHEREVER THE PERMIT IS ISSUED IN ERROR
OR ON THE BASIS OF INCORRECT, INACCURATE OR INCOMPLETE
INFORMATION, OR IN VIOLATION OF ANY ORDINANCE, REGULATION OR ANY
OF THE PROVISIONS OF THIS CHAPTER, THE TECHNICAL CODES OR OF
OTHER ORDINANCES OF THIS JURISDICTION.

7-2-104.16 PLACEMENT OF PERMIT. THE BUILDING PERMIT OR COpy THEREOF
SHALL BE KEPT ON THE SITE OF THE WORK UNTIL THE COMPLETION OF THE
PROJECT. THE ISSUED PREMISE IDENTIFICATION PLACARD (YELLOW CARD)
SHALL BE CONSPICUOUSLY POSTED ON SITE.

SECTION 7-2-105 CONSTRUCTION DOCUMENTS

7-2-105.1 SUBMITTA CUMENTS. PLA SP CATIONS, ENGINEERING
CALCULATIONS, DI;~ ~,ii<,~w;;~tlIVE EP1[lfTS, SPECIAL
INSPECTION AND S~RUC :'/ SE 0 ' G~~MS AND OTHER
DATA, AS REQUIREQ,),ay 1 EJN. ~iC L, SHAL tV BE SUBMITTED WITH
EACHAPPLICATION~Ap MI~"ECdN RUCTIO":{ DOCUMENTS SHALL
BE PREPARED BY A REGISTERED DESIGN PROFESSIONAL AS REQUIRED BY
ARIZONA STATE LAW AND SECTION 7-2-105.3. WHERE SPECIAL CONDITIONS
EXIST, THE BUILDING OFFICIAL IS AUTHORIZED TO REQUIRE ADDITIONAL
CONSTRUCTION DOCUMENTS TO BE PREPARED BY A REGISTERED DESIGN
PROFESSIONAL.

EXCEPTION: THE BUILDING OFFICIAL IS AUTHORIZED TO WAIVE THE
SUBMISSION OF CONSTRUCTION DOCUMENTS AND OTHER DATA NOT
REQUIRED TO BE PREPARED BY A DESIGN PROFESSIONAL IF IT IS
FOUND THAT THE NATURE OF THE WORK APPLIED FOR IS SUCH THAT
REVIEW OF CONSTRUCTION DOCUMENTS IS NOT NECESSARY TO
OBTAIN COMPLIANCE WITH THIS CHAPTER, THE TECHNICAL CODES
AND OTHER ORDINANCES OF THE TOWN.

7-2-105.1.1 INFORMATION ON CONSTRUCTION DOCUMENTS. CONSTRUCTION
DOCUMENTS SHALL BE DIMENSIONED AND DRAWN UPON SUITABLE
MATERIAL. ELECTRONIC MEDIA DOCUMENTS ARE PERMITTED TO BE
SUBMITTED WHEN APPROVED BY THE BUILDING OFFICIAL. CONSTRUCTION
DOCUMENTS SHALL BE OF SUFFICIENT CLARITY TO INDICATE THE LOCATION,
NATURE AND EXTENT OF THE WORK PROPOSED AND SHOW IN DETAIL THAT
IT WILL CONFORM TO THE PROVISIONS OF THIS CHAPTER, THE TECHNICAL

26



DRAFT RESOLUTION 2009-769
JULY 22, 2009

CODES AND RELEVANT LAWS, ORDINANCES AS DETERMINED BY THE
BUILDING OFFICIAL.

7-2-105.1.2 SCREENING. SUBMITTAL DOCUMENTS MAY BE SUBJECT TO
SCREENING BY THE BUILDING OFFICIAL FOR COMPLETENESS AND CODE
COMPLIANCE PRIOR TO BEING ACCEPTED FOR PERMIT REVIEW. INCOMPLETE
SUBMITTALS OR SUBMITTALS CONTAINING READILY APPARENT CODE
VIOLATIONS SHALL BE RETURNED TO THE APPLICANT WITHOUT BEING
ACCEPTED UNLESS OTHERWISE DIRECTED BY THE BUILDING OFFICIAL.

7-2-105.1.3 TITLE SHEET INFORMATION. THE CONSTRUCTION DOCUMENTS
SHALL CONTAIN A TITLE SHEET OR TITLE SHEETS INDICATING THE NAME,
ADDRESS AND PHONE NUMBERS OF DESIGN PROFESSIONALS. THE TITLE
SHEET SHALL ALSO CONTAIN INFORMATION REGARDING THE CODE REVIEW·
AS PERFORMED BY THE DESIGN PROFESSIONAL, INCLUDING THE SIZE OF
THE BUILDING, TYPE OF CONSTRUCTION, OCCUPANCY CLASSIFICATION(S),
AREA AND HEIGHT MODIFICATIONS (IF ANY), FIRE SPRINKLERS (IF ANY),
REQUIRED SPECIAL INSPECTION (IF ANY), DEFERRED SUBMITTALS (IF ANY)
AND ANY OTHER INFORMATION AS DIRECTED BY THE BUILDING OFFICIAL.
THE BUILDING OFFI AUT ORIZED TO DIFY THE
REQUIREMENT FOR ,~. TH FOR PERMIT IS
FOR ALTERATION 0 E W RANTED.

7-2-105.1.4 SITE PLA C S·· J TIO ,ICUMEN '" SUBMITTED WITH
THE APPLICATION FOR PERMIT SHALL BE ACCOMPANIED BY A SITE PLAN
SHOWING TO SCALE THE SIZE AND LOCATION OF NEW CONSTRUCTION AND
EXISTING STRUCTURES ON THE SITE, DISTANCES FROM LOT LINES AND IT
SHALL BE DRAWN IN ACCORDANCE WITH AN ACCURATE BOUNDARY LINE
SURVEY. IN THE CASE OF DEMOLITION, THE SITE PLAN SHALL SHOW
CONSTRUCTION TO BE DEMOLISHED AND THE LOCATION AND SIZE OF
EXISTING STRUCTURES AND CONSTRUCTION THAT ARE TO REMAIN ON THE
SITE OR PLOT. THE BUILDING OFFICIAL IS AUTHORIZED TO WAIVE OR MODIFY
THE REQUIREMENT FOR A SITE PLAN WHEN THE APPLICATION FOR PERMIT IS
FOR ALTERATION OR REPAIR OR WHEN OTHERWISE WARRANTED.

7-2-105.1.5 MEANS OF EGRESS. THE CONSTRUCTION DOCUMENTS SHALL
SHOW IN SUFFICIENT DETAIL THE LOCATION, CONSTRUCTION, SIZE AND
CHARACTER OF ALL PORTIONS OF THE MEANS OF EGRESS IN COMPLIANCE
WITH THE PROVISIONS OF THE TECHNICAL CODES. IN OTHER THAN
DETACHED ONE- AND TWO-FAMILY DWELLINGS AND MULTIPLE SINGLE­
FAMILY DWELLINGS (TOWNHOUSES) NOT MORE THAN THREE STORIES
ABOVE GRADE PLANE IN HEIGHT AS APPLICABLE IN SECTION 7-2-101.4.2, THE
CONSTRUCTION DOCUMENTS SHALL DESIGNATE THE NUMBER OF
OCCUPANTS TO BE ACCOMMODATED ON EVERY FLOOR, AND IN ALL ROOMS
AND SPACES. THE BUILDING OFFICIAL IS AUTHORIZED TO WAIVE OR MODIFY

27



DRAFT RESOLUTION 2009-769
JULY 22, 2009

THE REQUIREMENT FOR A MEANS OF EGRESS PLAN WHEN THE APPLICATION
FOR PERMIT IS FOR ALTERATION OR REPAIR OR WHEN OTHERWISE
WARRANTED.

7-2-105.1.6 EXTERIOR WALL ENVELOPE. CONSTRUCTION DOCUMENTS FOR
ALL BUILDINGS SHALL DESCRIBE THE EXTERIOR WALL ENVELOPE IN
SUFFICIENT DETAIL TO DETERMINE COMPLIANCE WITH THE TECHNICAL
CODES. THE CONSTRUCTION DOCUMENTS SHALL PROVIDE DETAILS OF THE
EXTERIOR WALL ENVELOPE AS REQUIRED, INCLUDING FLASHING,
INTERSECTIONS WITH DISSIMILAR MATERIALS, CORNERS, END DETAILS,
CONTROL JOINTS, INTERSECTIONS AT ROOFS, EAVES OR PARAPETS, MEANS
OF DRAINAGE, WATER-RESISTIVE MEMBRANE AND DETAILS AROUND
OPENINGS.

THE CONSTRUCTION DOCUMENTS SHALL INCLUDE MANUFACTURER'S
INSTALLATION INSTRUCTIONS THAT PROVIDE SUPPORTING DOCUMENTATION
THAT THE PROPOSED PENETRATION AND OPENING DETAILS DESCRIBED IN
THE CONSTRUCTION DOCUMENTS MAINTAIN THE WEATHER RESISTANCE OF
THE EXTERIOR WALL ENVELOPE. THE SUPPORTING DOCUMENTATION SHALL
FULLY DESCRIBE Ttt.).~~~T..EIl!-a~ALL YST HI .... WAS TESTED, WHERE
APPLICABLE, AS WBJ1:... 'If. ,I;:T P E &\r

II :~ ~
THE BUILDING OFFI~IAL I.sA.'I) l)~ IVE OR ~ODIFY THE
REQUIREMENT FOR~ .£leXT IRIOR .RLL E '\tEi-OPE P~NWHEN THE
APPLICATION FOR PERMIT IS FOR ALTERATION OR REPAIR OR WHEN
OTHERWISE WARRANTED.

7-2-105.2 EXAMINATION OF DOCUMENTS. THE BUILDING OFFICIAL SHALL
EXAMINE OR CAUSE TO BE EXAMINED THE PERMIT APPLICATION AND
ACCOMPANYING CONSTRUCTION DOCUMENTS AND SHALL ASCERTAIN BY
SUCH EXAMINATIONS WHETHER THE CONSTRUCTION INDICATED AND
DESCRIBED IS IN ACCORDANCE WITH THE REQUIREMENTS OF THIS CHAPTER,
THE TECHNICAL CODES AND OTHER PERTINENT LAWS OR ORDINANCES.

7-2-105.2.1 APPROVAL OF CONSTRUCTION DOCUMENTS. WHEN THE BUILDING
OFFICIAL ISSUES A PERMIT, THE CONSTRUCTION DOCUMENTS SHALL BE
APPROVED, IN WRITING OR BY STAMP, AS "REVIEWED FOR CODE
COMPLIANCE." THE BUILDING OFFICIAL AS REQUIRED BY THE APPROVED
BUILDING DIVISION RETENTION SCHEDULE SHALL RETAIN ONE SET OF
CONSTRUCTION DOCUMENTS SO REVIEWED. THE OTHER SET SHALL BE
RETURNED TO THE APPLICANT, SHALL BE KEPT AT THE SITE OF WORK AND
SHALL BE OPEN TO INSPECTION BY THE BUILDING OFFICIAL. WHEN THE
SUBMITTAL DOCUMENTS ARE PRODUCED ELECTRONICALLY, THE APPLICANT
SHALL PROVIDE AN ELECTRONIC COpy OF ALL DRAWINGS ON COMPACT
DISK OR OTHER MEDIA APPROVED BY THE BUILDING OFFICIAL.

28



DRAFT RESOLUTION 2009-769 .
JULY 22, 2009

7-2-105.2.2 PREVIOUS APPROVALS. THIS CHAPTER AND THE TECHNICAL
CODES SHALL NOT REQUIRE CHANGES IN THE CONSTRUCTION DOCUMENTS,
CONSTRUCTION OR DESIGNATED OCCUPANCY OF A STRUCTURE FOR WHICH
A LAWFUL PERMIT HAS BEEN HERETOFORE ISSUED OR OTHERWISE
LAWFULLY AUTHORIZED, AND THE CONSTRUCTION OF WHICH HAS BEEN
PURSUED IN GOOD FAITH AND HAS NOT BEEN ABANDONED PURSUANT TO
SECTION 7-2-104.8.

7-2-105.2.3 PHASED APPROVAL. THE BUILDING OFFICIAL IS AUTHORIZED TO
ISSUE A PERMIT FOR THE CONSTRUCTION OF FOUNDATIONS, OR OTHER
PARTS OF A BUILDING OR STRUCTURE BEFORE THE CONSTRUCTION
DOCUMENTS FOR THE WHOLE BUILDING OR STRUCTURE HAVE BEEN
SUBMITTED, PROVIDED ADEQUATE INFORMATION AND DETAILED
STATEMENTS HAVE BEEN FILED COMPLYING WITH PERTINENT
REQUIREMENTS OF THIS CHAPTER AND THE TECHNICAL CODES. THE
HOLDER OF SUCH PERMIT FOR THE FOUNDATION OR OTHER PARTS OF A
BUILDING OR STRUCTURE SHALL PROCEED AT THE HOLDER'S OWN RISK
WITH THE CONSTRUCTION OPERATION AND WITHOUT ASSURANCE THAT A
PERMIT FOR THE EN T CTURE L B NTE .

EXCEP ")! N UC ll' PP VALS ARE NOT

~~~i~~r L -':~~~~1)iu .~~:LtN~;U::~;~~T~:~
SINGLE-FAMILY DWELLINGS (TOWNHOUSES) NOT MORE THAN
THREE STORIES ABOVE GRADE PLANE IN HEIGHT.

7-2-105.3 DESIGN PROFESSIONAL IN RESPONSIBLE CHARGE. WHEN IT IS
REQUIRED THAT PERMIT SUBMITTAL DOCUMENTS BE PREPARED BY A
REGISTERED DESIGN PROFESSIONAL, THE BUILDING OFFICIAL SHALL BE
AUTHORIZED TO REQUIRE THE OWNER TO ENGAGE AND DESIGNATE ON THE
BUILDING PERMIT APPLICATION A REGISTERED DESIGN PROFESSIONAL WHO
SHALL ACT AS THE REGISTERED DESIGN PROFESSIONAL IN RESPONSIBLE
CHARGE.

IF THE CIRCUMSTANCES REQUIRE, THE OWNER SHALL DESIGNATE A
SUBSTITUTE REGISTERED DESIGN PROFESSIONAL IN RESPONSIBLE CHARGE
WHO SHALL PERFORM THE DUTIES REQUIRED OF THE ORIGINAL
REGISTERED DESIGN PROFESSIONAL IN RESPONSIBLE CHARGE. THE OWNER
SHALL NOTIFY THE BUILDING OFFICIAL IN WRITING IF THE REGISTERED
DESIGN PROFESSIONAL IN RESPONSIBLE CHARGE IS CHANGED OR IS
UNABLE TO CONTINUE TO PERFORM THE DUTIES.

THE REGISTERED DESIGN PROFESSIONAL IN RESPONSIBLE CHARGE SHALL
BE RESPONSIBLE FOR REVIEWING AND COORDINATING SUBMITTAL

29



DRAFT RESOLUTION 2009-769
JULY 22, 2009

DOCUMENTS PREPARED BY OTHERS, INCLUDING PHASED AND DEFERRED
SUBMITTAL ITEMS, FOR COMPATIBILITY WITH THE DESIGN OF THE BUILDING.

WHERE STRUCTURAL OBSERVATION IS REQUIRED BY SECTION 1704 OF THE
BUILDING CODE, THE INSPECTION PROGRAM SHALL NAME THE INDIVIDUAL
OR FIRMS WHO ARE TO PERFORM STRUCTURAL OBSERVATION AND
DESCRIBE THE STAGES OF CONSTRUCTION WHERE THE STRUCTURAL
OBSERVATION IS TO OCCUR.

7-2-105.3.1 DEFERRED SUBMITTALS. FOR THE PURPOSES OF THIS SECTION,
DEFERRED SUBMITTALS ARE DEFINED AS THOSE PORTIONS OF THE DESIGN
NOT SUBMITTED AT THE TIME OF THE APPLICATION BUT ARE TO BE
SUBMITTED TO THE BUILDING OFFICIAL BEFORE COMPLETION OF THE
PROJECT AND BEFORE A CERTIFICATE OF OCCUPANCY IS ISSUED.

DEFERRAL OF SUBMITTAL ITEMS SHALL HAVE THE PRIOR APPROVAL OF THE
BUILDING OFFICIAL. THE REGISTERED DESIGN PROFESSIONAL IN
RESPONSIBLE CHARGE SHALL LIST THE DEFERRED SUBMITTALS ON THE
TITLE SHEET OF THE CONSTRUCTION DOCUMENTS FOR REVIEW BY THE
BUILDING OFFICIAL.J2'!C~ UBMITT 1~,~~1F.l. WN ON THE
CONSTRUCTION DO ,,,PMD~T L Ei;,Rcr-N 8 S "FOR
REFERENCE ONLY" .~.~.·.D.EF ., S ..:.m...,.·.•.•.•..:.:~OT ..•·.,:.:.D..1..... ' NSTITUTE PHASED
APPROVAL OF THE ,,1 .!~,

~ ~
DOCUMENTS FOR DEFERRED SUBMITTAL ITEMS SHALL BE SUBMITTED TO
THE REGISTERED DESIGN PROFESSIONAL IN RESPONSIBLE CHARGE, WHICH
SHALL REVIEW THEM AND FORWARD THEM TO THE BUILDING OFFICIAL WITH
A NOTATION INDICATING THE DEFERRED SUBMITTAL DOCUMENTS HAVE
BEEN REVIEWED AND BEEN FOUND TO BE IN GENERAL CONFORMANCE TO
THE DESIGN OF THE BUILDING. THE DEFERRED SUBMITTAL ITEMS SHALL NOT
BE INSTALLED UNTIL THE DESIGN PROFESSIONAL AND THE BUILDING
OFFICIAL HAS APPROVED THE SUBMITTAL DOCUMENTS.

7-2-105.4 AMENDED CONSTRUCTION DOCUMENTS (REVISIONS). WORK SHALL
BE INSTALLED IN ACCORDANCE WITH THE APPROVED CONSTRUCTION
DOCUMENTS, AND ANY CHANGES MADE DURING CONSTRUCTION THAT ARE
NOT IN COMPLIANCE WITH THE APPROVED CONSTRUCTION DOCUMENTS
SHALL BE RESUBMITTED FOR APPROVAL AS AN AMENDED SET OF
CONSTRUCTION DOCUMENTS.

7-2-105.5 RESPONSIBILITY. IT SHALL BE THE DUTY OF EVERY PERSON WHO
. PERFORMS WORK FOR THE INSTALLATION OR REPAIR OF BUILDING,

STRUCTURE, ELECTRICAL, GAS, MECHANICAL, PLUMBING, OR FIRE­
SUPPRESSION SYSTEMS, FOR WHICH THIS CHAPTER OR THE TECHNICAL

30



DRAFT RESOLUTION 2009-769
JULY 22, 2009

CODES ARE APPLICABLE, TO COMPLY WITH THIS CHAPTER AND THE
TECHNICAL CODES.

7-2-105.6 RETENTION OF CONSTRUCTION DOCUMENTS. ONE SET OF
APPROVED CONSTRUCTION DOCUMENTS SHALL BE RETAINED BY THE
BUILDING OFFICIAL FOR A PERIOD OF TIME AS PRESCRIBED BY STATE OR
LOCAL LAWS AND ONE SET OF APPROVED CONSTRUCTION DOCUMENTS
SHALL BE RETURNED TO THE APPLICANT, AND SAID SET SHALL BE KEPT ON
THE SITE OF THE BUILDING OR WORK AT ALL TIMES DURING WHICH THE
WORK AUTHORIZED THEREBY IS IN PROGRESS.

SECTION 7-2-106 INSPECTIONS

7-2-106.1 GENERAL. CONSTRUCTION OR WORK FOR WHICH A PERMIT IS
REQUIRED SHALL BE SUBJECT TO INSPECTION BY THE BUILDING OFFICIAL
AND SUCH CONSTRUCTION OR WORK SHALL REMAIN ACCESSIBLE AND
EXPOSED FOR INSPECTION PURPOSES UNTIL APPROVED. APPROVAL AS A
RESULT OF AN INSPECTION SHALL NOT BE CONSTRUED TO BE AN APPROVAL
OF A VIOLATION OF THE PROVISIONS OF THIS CHAPTER, THE TECHNICAL
CODES OR OF OTH IN S OF E J INSPECTIONS
PRESUMING TO GIV 0 ' ,V T HE PROVISIONS
OF THIS CHAPTER rcyif. TH ' A F q~JHER ORDINANCES OF
THE JURISDICTION ~,tiA ~,y ALL BE littE DUTY OF THE
PERMIT APPLICANT ff0li T'ORK ' 'EMAIN NCCESSIBLE AND
EXPOSED FOR INSPECTION PURPOSES. NEITHER THE BUILDING OFFICIAL
NOR THE JURISDICTION SHALL BE LIABLE FOR EXPENSE ENTAILED IN THE
REMOVAL OR REPLACEMENT OF ANY MATERIAL REQUIRED TO ALLOW
INSPECTION.

IT SHALL BE THE DUTY OF THE PERMIT HOLDER TO PROVIDE AN APPROVED
PROPERTY ADDRESS, INCLUDING NUMBER AND STREET NAME, AT ALL
CONSTRUCTION SITES. SUCH TEMPORARY PREMISES IDENTIFICATION SHALL
BE CLEARLY VISIBLE FROM THE STREET OR ROADWAY FRONTING THE
PROPERTY, SHALL BE INSTALLED PRIOR TO THE FIRST INSPECTION, AND
SHALL BE MAINTAINED UNTIL THE PERMANENT PREMISES IDENTIFICATION IS
INSTALLED AND APPROVED.

7-2-106.2 INSPECTION RECORD CARD. WORK REQUIRING A PERMIT SHALL
NOT COMMENCE UNTIL THE PERMIT HOLDER OR AN AGENT OF THE PERMIT
HOLDER HAS POSTED OR OTHERWISE MADE AVAILABLE THE INSPECTION
RECORD CARD TO ALLOW THE BUILDING OFFICIAL OR AUTHORIZED AGENT
TO CONVENIENTLY MAKE THE REQUIRED ENTRIES THEREON REGARDING
INSPECTIONS OF THE WORK. THE PERMIT HOLDER SHALL MAINTAIN THE
CARD AVAILABLE UNTIL FINAL APPROVAL, BY THE BUILDING OFFICIAL, HAS
BEEN GRANTED.

31



DRAFT RESOLUTION 2009-769
JULY 22, 2009

7-2-106.3 PRELIMINARY INSPECTIONS. BEFORE ISSUING A PERMIT, THE
BUILDING OFFICIAL IS AUTHORIZED TO EXAMINE OR CAUSE TO BE EXAMINED
BUILDINGS, STRUCTURES OR SITES FOR WHICH AN APPLICATION HAS BEEN
FILED.

7-2-106.4 INSPECTION AND OBSERVATION PROGRAM. WHEN SPECIAL
INSPECTION IS REQUIRED BY SECTION 1704 OF THE BUILDING CODE OR AS
DETERMINED BY THE BUILDING OFFICIAL, THE OWNER, AN AGENT OF THE
OWNER, OR THE ENGINEER OR REGISTERED DESIGN PROFESSIONAL IN
RESPONSIBLE CHARGE, BUT NOT THE CONTRACTOR OR ANY OTHER PERSON
RESPONSIBLE FOR THE WORK, SHALL EMPLOY ONE OR MORE SPECIAL
INSPECTOR(S) WHO SHALL PROVIDE INSPECTIONS DURING CONSTRUCTION
ON THE TYPE OF WORK LISTED UNDER SECTION 1704.1 OF THE BUILDING
CODE OR AS DETERMINED BY THE BUILDING OFFICIAL.

WHEN SPECIAL INSPECTIONS ARE REQUIRED, THE SPECIAL INSPECTIONS
ARE TO BE PERFORMED IN ADDITION TO, NOT IN LIEU OF, THE INSPECTIONS
CONDUCTED BY THE BUILDING OFFICIAL, AND SHALL NOT BE CONSTRUED TO
RELIEVE THE OWNE IS ~$)YJ.I;iORIZIiP AG QUESTING THE
PERIODIC AND CALCTIt::) '.. S R' I APTER AND THE
TECHNICAL CODES.

7-2-106.4.1 SPECIAL R. CE WIT SECTIONS 1704.1
AND 7-2-106.4 "SPECIAL INSPECTOR(S)" OF THE BUILDING CODE SHALL BE
PROVIDED BY, OR UNDER THE SUPERVISION OF AN ENGINEER OR
REGISTERED DESIGN PROFESSIONAL IN RESPONSIBLE CHARGE OF THE
STRUCTURAL INSPECTION FOR WHICH "SPECIAL INSPECTION" IS REQUIRED,
SUBJECT TO THE FOLLOWING CONDITIONS:

, 7-2-106.4.2 NOTIFICATION: (PRIOR TO ISSUING PERMIT) THE OWNER OR HIS
AUTHORIZED AGENT SHALL NOTIFY THE COMMUNITY DEVELOPMENT
DEPARTMENT, BUILDING DIVISION IN WRITING ON THE FORM PROVIDED BY
THIS DIVISION, THE NAME OF THE ENGINEER OR REGISTERED DESIGN
PROFESSIONAL IN RESPONSIBLE CHARGE WHO WILL CARRY OUT THE
REQUIRED INSPECTION. THE RESPONSIBLE ENGINEER OR REGISTERED
DESIGN PROFESSIONAL OF RECORD SHALL NOTIFY THE DEPARTMENT OF
ANY CHANGES OF "SPECIAL INSPECTION(S)" PRIOR TO CONDUCTING THE
INSPECTIONS.

7-2-106.4.3 CERTIFICATE OF RESPONSIBILITY: THE ENGINEER OR
REGISTERED DESIGN PROFESSIONAL IN RESPONSIBLE CHARGE OF THE
"SPECIAL INSPECTION(S)" SHALL SO CERTIFY TO THE DIVISION IN WRITING
ON THE TOWN FORM PROVIDED PRIOR TO THE ISSUANCE OF THE BUILDING
PERMIT, AND SHALL NOTIFY THE DIVISION IMMEDIATELY IF TERMINATED

32



DRAFT RESOLUTION 2009-769
JULY 22, 2009

PRIOR TO COMPLETION OF THE WORK, FOR WHICH "SPECIALINSPECTION(S)"
IS REQUIRED.

7-2-106.4.4 QUALIFICATION: NO PERSON(S) SHALL BE ASSIGNED TO CARRY
OUT THE DUTIES OF THE "SPECIALINSPECTOR(S)" UNLESS THOROUGHLY
QUALIFIED BY KNOWLEDGE AND EXPERIENCE TO RENDER FULL, COMPLETE
AND COMPETENT INSPECTION.

IT SHALL BE THE RESPONSIBILITY OF THE ENGINEER OR REGISTERED
DESIGN PROFESSIONAL IN RESPONSIBLE CHARGE OF THE SPECIAL
INSPECTION TO SATISFY THE DUTIES AND RESPONSIBILITIES AS STATED IN
SECTION 1704.1 OF THE BUILDING CODE.

7-2-106.4.5 INSPECTION AND REPORTS: THE ENGINEER OR REGISTERED
DESIGN PROFESSIONAL IN RESPONSIBLE CHARGE OF THE "SPECIAL
INSPECTION(S)" OR THE DESIGNATED "SPECIALINSPECTOR(S)" SHALL
PROVIDE CONTINUOUS, COMPETENT AND COMPLETE INSPECTION ON THE
WORK FOR WHICH "SPECIALINSPECTION(S)" IS REQUIRED IN ACCORDANCE
WITH SECTION 1704.1 OF THE BUILDING CODE AND SHALL SUBMIT REPORTS
TO THE BUILDING D S NG AP ROVAL OF THE WORK AS IT
PROGRESSES BUT . . S "".51rrr'CTiVEEltr

, ~ It ~
THE "SPECIALINSP(pTO/is i0~ f;Y HE DIVI~ION IMMEDIATELY
UPON DETECTIONd~e DleR CIES tN LVED IN THE "SPECIAL
INSPECTIONS" THAT HAVE NOT BEEN CORRECTED IN ACCORDANCE WITH
THE APPROVED PLANS AND SPECIFICATIONS PRIOR TO PROCEEDING WITH
THE WORK.

7-2-106.5 REQUIRED INSPECTIONS. THE BUILDING OFFICIAL, UPON
NOTIFICATION, SHALL MAKE THE INSPECTIONS SET FORTH IN THIS SECTION.

7-2-106.5.1 FOOTING AND FOUNDATION INSPECTION. FOOTING AND
FOUNDATION INSPECTIONS SHALL BE MADE AFTER EXCAVATIONS FOR
FOOTINGS ARE COMPLETE AND ANY REQUIRED REINFORCING STEEL IS IN
PLACE. FOR CONCRETE FOUNDATIONS, THE REQUIRED FORMS SHALL BE IN
PLACE PRIOR TO.INSPECTION. AN INSPECTION SHALL BE MADE PRIOR TO
THE PLACEMENT OF CONCRETE. MATERIALS FOR THE FOUNDATION SHALL
BE ON THE SITE, EXCEPT WHERE CONCRETE IS READY MIXED IN
ACCORDANCE WITH ASTM C 94; THE CONCRETE NEED NOT BE ON THE SITE.

7-2-106.5.2 UNDERGROUND BUILDING SERVICE EQUIPMENT. UNDERGROUND
PLUMBING, GAS, MECHANICAL, OR ELECTRICAL SYSTEMS SHALL BE .
INSPECTED FOR APPROVED MATERIALS, PROPER BURIAL DEPTH AND SLOPE
BUT PRIOR TO THE BACKFILLING OF TRENCHES. THE PIPING SHALL BE
BEDDED-IN FOR ITS ENTIRE LENGTH, AND IF APPLICABLE, THE SYSTEMS

33



DRAFT RESOLUTION 2009·769
JULY 22, 2009

SHALL BE UNDER THE PRESCRIBED TESTS REQUIRED BY THE TECHNICAL
CODES.

7-2-106.5.3 CONCRETE SLAB AND UNDER-FLOOR INSPECTION. CONCRETE
SLAB AND UNDER-FLOOR INSPECTIONS SHALL BE MADE AFTER IN-SLAB OR
UNDER-FLOOR REINFORCING STEEL AND IF APPLICABLE, BUILDING SERVICE
EQUIPMENT, CONDUIT, PIPING ACCESSORIES, INSULATION AND OTHER
ANCILLARY EQUIPMENT ITEMS ARE IN PLACE AND APPROVED, BUT BEFORE
ANY CONCRETE IS PLACED OR FLOOR SHEATHING INSTALLED, INCLUDING
THE SUB-FLOOR.

7-2-106.5.4 SEWER OR WATER SERVICE (BUILDING OR PRIVATE). SEWER OR
WATER SERVICE LINES, THAT PROVIDES SERVICE TO A BUILDING OR
MULTIPLE BUILDINGS ON ONE SITE AND NOT INSTALLED IN A PUBLIC RIGHT­
OF-WAY OR PUBLIC UTILITY EASEMENT (PUE), SHALL BE INSPECTED FOR
APPROVED MATERIALS AND PROPER SLOPE PRIOR TO BACKFILLING OF THE
TRENCHES.

7-2-106.5.5 CONCRETE OR MASONRY WALLS OR COLUMNS INSPECTION.
WALLS AND COLUM ALL BE INSPE ED INFORCING
STEEL, AND IF APP llE, ;J!il1jf;f"~_,, \ IT ARE IN PLACE

'i'\

BUT PRIOR TO THE ,>!,M C GR, T. FOR CONCRETE
WALLS OR COLUMNI, RE.ttJU .,.... .... L BE IN ~LACE PRIOR TO
INSPECTION. MASO~WAL LUM'~ S1CONSTRt'YCTED IN LIFTS SHALL
REQUIRE AN INSPECTION PRIOR TO THE GROUTING OF EACH LIFT.

7-2-106.5.6 EXTERIOR STRAP AND SHEAR INSPECTION. EXTERIOR WALLS
SHALL BE INSPECTED AFTER THE SHEATHING (USED FOR BRACING/SHEAR);
WALL BRACING, METAL STRAPS OR ANCHORING DEVICES ARE IN PLACE BUT
PRIOR TO THE INSTALLATION OF THE WEATHER-RESISTIVE BARRIER OR
WALL COVERING.

7-2-106.5.7 ROUGH BUILDING SERVICE EQUIPMENT. ROUGH PLUMBING, GAS,
MECHANICAL, OR ELECTRICAL SYSTEMS SHALL BE INSPECTED FOR
APPROVED MATERIALS OR PROPER SLOPE BUT PRIOR TO CONCEALING BY
THE BUILDING FINISH MATERIALS. WHEN APPLICABLE, THE SYSTEMS SHALL
BE UNDER THE PRESCRIBED TESTS REQUIRED BY THE TECHNICAL CODES.
WHEN APPLICABLE, THESE INSPECTIONS MAY BE COMPLETED IN
CONJUNCTION WITH A FRAME INSPECTION.

7-2-106.5.8 FRAME INSPECTION. FRAMING INSPECTIONS SHALL BE MADE
AFTER THE ROOF DECK OR SHEATHING, ALL FRAMING, FIREBLOCKING,
DRAFTSTOPPING AND BRACING ARE IN PLACE, PIPES, CHIMNEYS AND VENTS
TO BE CONCEALED ARE COMPLETE, THE ROUGH BUILDING SERVICE

34



DRAFT RESOLUTION 2009-769
JULY 22, 2009

EQUIPMENT HAS BEEN APPROVED, AFTER THE ROOF IS LOADED WITH ROOF
COVERING MATERIAL AND THE BUILDING HAS BEEN DRIED-IN.

7-2-106.5.9 ENERGY EFFICIENCY INSPECTION. INSULATION INSPECTION
SHALL BE MADE AFTER FRAME AND EXTERIOR LATH INSPECTION AND ALL
ROUGH PLUMBING, MECHANICAL, GAS, AND ELECTRICAL SYSTEMS ARE
APPROVED AND PRIOR TO COVERING OR CONCEALMENT. BLOWN OR
SPRAYED ROOF/CEILING INSULATION MAY BE VERIFIED BEFORE FINAL
INSPECTION WITH MARKERS AFFIXED TO THE TRUSSES OR JOISTS AND
MARKED WITH THE INSULATION THICKNESS BY ONE INCH (25.5 MM) HIGH
NUMBERS. A MINIMUM OF ONE (1) MARKER PROVIDED FOR EACH 300 SQUARE
FEET OF AREA WITH NUMBERS TO FACE THE ATTIC ACCESS OPENING. IN
LIEU OF AN INSULATION INSPECTION, A CERTIFICATION FROM THE
INSULATION INSTALLER MAY BE SUBMITTED.

7-2-106.5.10 MOISTURE BARRIER. A MOISTURE BARRIER INSPECTION SHALL
BE PERFORMED AFTER ALL FLASHINGS, WINDOWS, AND MOISTURE BARRIER
IS INSTALLED PRIOR TO THE INSTALLATION OF ANY EXTERIOR WALL
COVERING.

7-2-106.5.11 LATH A 1"'i5""G~t'1S V"M1J~
BOARD INSPECTIO~~SH~iL\pE~~iD
INTERIOR AND, IF AltrLl~B~F' ~E,i'
PLASTERING IS APPI!1EB'lIOR t3YPS~ VBOA
TAPED AND FINISHED.

AND GYPSUM
ND GYPSUM BOARD,
UT BEFORE ANY

D FASTENERS ARE

EXCEPTION: GYPSUM BOARD THAT IS NOT PART OF A FIRE­
RESISTANCE-RATED ASSEMBLY OR A SHEAR ASSEMBLY.

7-2-106.5.12 FIRE-RESISTANT PENETRATIONS. PROTECTION OF JOINTS AND
PENETRATIONS IN FIRE-RESISTANCE-RATED ASSEMBLIES SHALL NOT BE
CONCEALED FROM VIEW UNTIL INSPECTED AND APPROVED. WHEN
APPLICABLE, THIS INSPECTION SHALL BE DONE IN CONJUNCTION WITH THE
GYPSUM BOARD INSPECTION PRIOR TO JOINTS AND FASTENERS BEING
TAPED AND FINISHED.

7-2-106.5.13 OTHER INSPECTIONS. IN ADDITION TO THE INSPECTIONS
SPECIFIED ABOVE, THE BUILDING OFFICIAL IS AUTHORIZED TO MAKE OR
REQUIRE OTHER INSPECTIONS OF ANY CONSTRUCTION WORK TO
ASCERTAIN COMPLIANCE WITH THE PROVISIONS OF THIS CHAPTER OR THE
TECHNICAL CODES AND OTHER LAWS ENFORCED BY THE BUILDING DIVISION.

7-2-106.5.14 SPECIAL INSPECTIONS. SPECIAL INSPECTIONS AND STRUCTURAL
OBSERVATIONS SHALL BE AS REQUIRED IN SECTION 1704 OF THE BUILDING
CODE IN ACCORDANCE WITH SECTION 7-2-106.4 OF THIS CHAPTER. SPECIAL

35



DRAFT RESOLUTION 2009-769
JULY 22, 2009

INSPECTIONS ARE IN ADDITION TO, NOT IN LIEU OF, THE INSPECTIONS
CONDUCTED BY THE BUILDING OFFICIAL.

7-2-106.5.15 FINAL INSPECTION. THE FINAL INSPECTION SHALL BE MADE
AFTER ALL WORK SHOWN ON THE CONSTRUCTION DOCUMENTS OR AS
REQUIRED BY THE PERMIT IS COMPLETED.

7-2-1 06~6 BUILDING SERVICE EQUIPMENT. BUILDING SERVICE EQUIPMENT
REGULATED BY THE TECHNICAL CODES SHALL NOT BE CONNECTED TO THE
FUEL OR POWER SUPPLY, OR WATER OR SEWER SYSTEMS UNTIL
AUTHORIZED BY THE BUILDING OFFICIAL. THE REQUIREMENTS OF THIS
CHAPTER SHALL NOT BE CONSIDERED AS PROHIBITING THE OPERATION OF
BUILDING SERVICE EQUIPMENT INSTALLED TO REPLACE EXISTING BUILDING
SERVICE EQUIPMENT SERVING AN OCCUPIED PORTION OF THE BUILDING
PROVIDED AN INSPECTION OF SUCH BUILDING SERVICE EQUIPMENT HAS
BEEN COMPLETED AND APPROVED FOR USE.

7-2-106.7 INSPECTION AGENCIES. THE BUILDING OFFICIAL IS AUTHORIZED TO
ACCEPT REPORTS OF APPROVED INSPECTION AGENCIES, PROVIDED SUCH
AGENCIES SATISFY RE MENT S T TIONS AND
RELIABILITY.

7-2-106.8 INSPECTIO OF THE HOLDER OF
THE PERMIT OR THefili1wJ"fROftlZE NT OTIFY T BUILDING OFFICIAL
WHEN WORK IS· READY FOR INSPECTION. IT SHALL BE THE DUTY OF THE
PERMIT HOLDER TO PROVIDE ACCESS TO AND MEANS FOR THE INSPECTION
OF SUCH WORK AS REQUIRED BY THIS CHAPTER. THE BUILDING OFFICIAL
MAY REQUIRE THAT EVERY REQUEST FOR INSPECTION BE FILED AT LEAST
ONE WORKING DAY BEFORE SUCH INSPECTION IS DESIRED.

7-2-106.9 APPROVAL REQUIRED. WORK SHALL NOT BE DONE BEYOND THE
POINT INDICATED IN EACH SUCCESSIVE INSPECTION WITHOUT FIRST
OBTAINING THE APPROVAL OF THE BUILDING OFFICIAL. THE BUILDING
OFFICIAL, UPON NOTIFICATION, SHALL MAKE THE REQUESTED INSPECTIONS
AND SHALL EITHER INDICATE THE PORTION OF THE CONSTRUCTION THAT IS
SATISFACTORY AS COMPLETED, OR NOTIFY THE PERMIT HOLDER OR
AUTHORIZED REPRESENTATIVE WHEREIN THE SAME FAILS TO COMPLY WITH
THIS CHAPTER OR THE TECHNICAL CODES. ANY PORTIONS THAT DO NOT
COMPLY SHALL BE CORRECTED AND SHALL NOT BE COVERED OR
CONCEALED UNTIL AUTHORIZED BY THE BUILDING OFFICIAL. THERE SHALL
BE A FINAL INSPECTION AND APPROVAL OF ALL CONSTRUCTION WHEN THE
WORK IS COMPLETED AND PRIOR TO ANY OCCUPANCY OR USE.

7-2-106.10 RE-INSPECTION. A RE-INSPECTION FEE MAY BE ASSESSED FOR
EACH INSPECTION OR RE-INSPECTION WHEN SUCH PORTION OF WORK FOR

36



DRAFT RESOLUTION 2009-769
. JULY 22, 2009

WHICH INSPECTION IS CALLED IS NOT COMPLETE OR WHEN CORRECTIONS
CALLED FOR ARE NOT MADE. THIS SECTION IS NOT TO BE INTERPRETED AS
REQUIRING RE-INSPECTION FEES THE FIRST TIME A JOB IS REJECTED FOR
FAILURE TO COMPLY WITH THE REQUIREMENTS OF THE TECHNICAL CODES,
BUT AS CONTROLLING THE PRACTICE OF CALLING FOR INSPECTIONS
BEFORE THE JOB IS READY FOR SUCH INSPECTION OR RE-INSPECTION. RE­
INSPECTION FEES MAY BE ASSESSED:

• WHEN THE INSPECTION RECORD CARD IS NOT POSTED OR OTHERWISE
AVAILABLE ON THE WORK SITE.

• WHEN THE APPROVED PLANS ARE NOT READILY AVAILABLE TO THE
INSPECTOR.

• FOR FAILURE TO PROVIDE ACCESS ON THE DATE FOR WHICH
INSPECTION IS REQUESTED.

• FOR DEVIATING FROM APPROVED PLANS THEREBY REQUIRING THE
APPROVAL OF THE BUILDING OFFICIAL.

• WHEN REQUESTED WORK IS NOT READY FOR INSPECTION.

TO OBTAIN A RE-INSPECTION, THE APPLICANT SHALL PAY THE RE­
INSPECTION FEE AS SET FORTH IN THE FEE SCHEDULE ADOPTED BY THIS
JURISDICTION. IN INSJ~~CE HERE RE-I SPE N FEE HAVE BEEN
ASSESSED, ADDITld,lt, S N E OT BE
PERFORMED UNTIL ~UH .I F ID.

. . 7-2-106.11 CONNEC,JJ IL lSON SH L MAKE
CONNECTIONS FROM A UTILITY, SOURCE OF ENERGY, FUEL OR POWER TO
ANY BUILDING OR BUILDING SERVICE EQUIPMENT, REGULATED BY THE
TECHNICAL CODES FOR WHICH A PERMIT IS REQUIRED BY THIS CHAPTER,
UNTIL APPROVED BY THE BUILDING OFFICIAL.

THE BUILDING OFFICIAL MAY AUTHORIZE THE TEMPORARY CONNECTION OF
THE BUILDING SERVICE EQUIPMENT TO THE UTILITY SOURCE OF ENERGY,
FUEL OR POWER FOR CONSTRUCTION POWER, TESTING OF BUILDING
SERVICE EQUIPMENT OR FOR USE UNDER A TEMPORARY CERTIFICATE OF
OCCUPANCY.

SECTION 7-2-107 CERTIFICATE OF OCCUPANCY AND FINAL APPROVALS

7-2-107.1 USE AND OCCUpANCY. NO BUILDING OR STRUCTURE SHALL BE
USED OR OCCUPIED, AND NO CHANGE IN THE EXISTING OCCUPANCY
CLASSIFICATION OF A BUILDING OR STRUCTURE OR PORTION THEREOF
SHALL BE MADE UNTIL THE BUILDING OFFICIAL HAS ISSUED A CERTIFICATE
OF OCCUPANCY THEREFORE AS PROVIDED HEREIN. ISSUANCE OF A
CERTIFICATE OF OCCUPANCY SHALL NOT BE CONSTRUED AS AN APPROVAL
OF A VIOLATION OF THE PROVISIONS OF THIS CHAPTER, THE TECHNICAL
CODES OR OTHER ORDINANCES OF THE JURISDICTION.

37



DRAFT RESOLUTION 2009-769
JULY 22, 2009

7-2-107.2 LETTER OF COMPLIANCE. THE BUILDING OFFICIAL IS AUTHORIZED
TO ISSUE A LETTER OF COMPLIANCE FOR A BUILDING OR STRUCTURE
PERMITTED AS A BASIC OR SHELL BUILDING, WHICH CANNOT BE OCCUPIED.
IF AFTER A FINAL INSPECTION OF THE BUILDING OR STRUCTURE, AND ANY
ELECTRICAL, FIRE PROTECTION, PLUMBING, MECHANICAL, GAS OR SIMILAR
SYSTEMS SHOWN ON THE APPROVED PLANS THERE ARE NO VIOLATIONS TO
THE PROVISIONS OF THIS CHAPTER, THE TECHNICAL CODES OR OTHER
LAWS AND ORDINANCES THAT ARE ENFORCED BY THE BUILDING DIVISION,
THE PERMIT HOLDER MAY REQUEST SUCH LETTER OF COMPLIANCE. THE
LETTER OF COMPLIANCE CERTIFIES THAT THE WORK PERFORMED UNDER
THE PERMIT HAS BEEN SATISFACTORILY COMPLETED, BUT DOES NOT
AUTHORIZE THE OCCUPANCY OF A BASIC OR SHELL BUILDING OR
STRUCTURE.

THE LETTER OF COMPLIANCE SHALL CONTAIN THE FOLLOWING:

1. THE BUILDING PERMIT NUMBER.

3. A DESCRIPTI
OCCUPANCY

N§illiRl:JCTI TYPE, PROPOSED

4. A STATEMENT THAT THE PERMITTED WORK HAS BEEN INSPECTED FOR
COMPLIANCE WITH THE REQUIREMENTS OF THIS CHAPTER AND THE
TECHNICAL CODES.

5. THE NAME AND SIGNATURE OF THE BUILDING OFFICIAL OR DESIGNEE.

7-2-107.3 CERTIFICATE OF OCCUPANCY. AFTER THE BUILDING OFFICIAL
INSPECTS THE BUILDING OR STRUCTURE AND FINDS NO VIOLATIONS OF THE
PROVISIONS OF THIS CHAPTER, THE TECHNICAL CODES OR OTHER LAWS
THAT ARE ENFORCED BY THE BUILDING DIVISION, THE BUILDING OFFICIAL IS
AUTHORIZED TO ISSUE A CERTIFICATE OF OCCUPANCY THAT CONTAINS THE
FOLLOWING:

1. THE BUILDING PERMIT NUMBER.

2. THE ADDRESS OF THE BUILDING OR STRUCTURE.

3. THE TYPE OF CONSTRUCTION AS DEFINED IN SECTION 602.1 OF THE
BUILDING CODE.

38



DRAFT RESOLUTION 2009-769
JULY 22, 2009

4. THE OCCUPANCY, IN ACCORDANCE WITH THE PROVISIONS OF SECTION
302.1 OF THE BUILDING CODE. .

5. THE AREA OF EACH OCCUPANCY WITHIN THE BUILDING FOR WHICH
THE PERMIT WAS ISSUED.

6. THE OCCUPANT LOAD OF EACH OCCUPANCY FOR WHICH THE PERMIT
WAS ISSUED.

7. INDICATE WHETHER AN AUTOMATIC SPRINKLER SYSTEM IS PROVIDED
IN THE BUILDING OR STRUCTURE.

8. A STATEMENT THAT THE DESCRIBED PORTION OF THE STRUCTURE
HAS BEEN INSPECTED FOR COMPLIANCE WITH THE REQUIREMENTS OF
THIS CHAPTER AND THE TECHNICAL CODES FOR THE OCCUPANCY AND
DIVISION OF OCCUPANCY AND THE USE FOR WHICH THE PROPOSED
OCCUPANCY IS CLASSIFIED.

9. THE NAME AND SIGNATURE OF THE BUILDING OFFICIAL OR DESIGNEE.

10. :~~:I~~CIALr"· E BUILDING

7-2-107.4 TEMPORAR" " I C ~, ANCY. T E BUILDING OFFICIAL
IS AUTHORIZED TO ISSUE A TEMPORARY CERTIFICATE OF OCCUPANCY
BEFORE THE COMPLETION OF THE ENTIRE WORK COVERED BY THE PERMIT,
PROVIDED THAT SUCH PORTION OR PORTIONS SHALL BE OCCUPIED SAFELY.
THE BUILDING OFFICIAL SHALL SET THE CONDITIONS, IF ANY, AND THE TIME
PERIOD DURING WHICH THE TEMPORARY CERTIFICATE OF OCCUPANCY IS
VALID.

7-2-107.5 REVOCATION. THE BUILDING OFFICIAL IS AUTHORIZED TO SUSPEND
OR REVOKE, IN WRITING, A CERTIFICATE OF OCCUPANCY, LETTER OF
COMPLIANCE OR TEMPORARY CERTIFICATE OF OCCUPANCY ISSUED UNDER
THE PROVISIONS OF THIS CHAPTER WHEREVER SUCH CERTIFICATE IS
ISSUED IN ERROR, OR ON THE BASIS OF INCORRECT INFORMATION
SUPPLIED, OR WHERE IT IS DETERMINED THE BUILDING OR STRUCTURE OR
PORTION THEREOF IS IN VIOLATION OF ANY ORDINANCE OR REGULATION OR
ANY OF THE PROVISIONS OF THIS CHAPTER OR THE TECHNICAL CODES.

7-2-107.6 POSTING. THE CERTIFICATE OF OCCUPANCY SHALL BE POSTED IN A
CONSPICUOUS PLACE WITHIN THE PREMISES.

SECTION 7-2-108 UNSAFE STRUCTURES AND EQUIPMENT

39



DRAFT RESOLUTION 2009-769
JULY 22, 2009

7-2-108.1 GENERAL. STRUCTURES OR BUILDING SERVICE EQUIPMENT THAT
ARE OR HEREAFTER BECOME STRUCTURALLY UNSAFE, UNSANITARY OR
DEFICIENT BECAUSE OF INADEQUATE MEANS OF EGRESS FACILITIES,
INADEQUATE LIGHT AND VENTILATION, OR THAT CONSTITUTE A FIRE
HAZARD, OR ARE OTHERWISE DANGEROUS TO HUMAN LIFE OR WHICH IN
RELATION TO EXISTING USE CONSTITUTES A HAZARD TO SAFETY OR
HEALTH, OR PUBLIC WELFARE, BY REASON OF INADEQUATE MAINTENANCE,
DILAPIDATION, OBSOLESCENCE, FIRE HAZARD, OR ABANDONMENT, AS
SPECIFIED IN THIS CHAPTER, TECHNICAL CODES OR ANY OTHER EFFECTIVE
ORDINANCE, ARE FOR THE PURPOSE OF THIS SECTION, UNSAFE BUILDINGS.
A VACANT STRUCTURE THAT IS NOT SECURED AGAINST ENTRY SHALL BE
DEEMED AN UNSAFE CONDITION. UNSAFE CONDITIONS AND STRUCTURES
SHALL BE TAKEN DOWN, REMOVED OR MADE SAFE, AS THE BUILDING
OFFICIAL DEEMS NECESSARY AND AS PROVIDED IN THIS CHAPTER. ALL
SUCH UNSAFE BUILDINGS ARE HEREBY DECLARED TO BE PUBLIC
NUISANCES AND SHALL BE ABATED BY REPAIR, REHABILITATION,
DEMOLITION OR REMOVAL IN ACCORDANCE WITH THE PROCEDURE
SPECIFIED IN SECTIONS 7-2-108.2, 7-2-108.3, 7-2-108.4 AND 7-2-108.5.

7-2-108.1.2 UNSAFE PENDAGES.P6BAP~EIWALLS, CORNICES,
SPIRES, TOWERS, T Y l!F OTmER1lpP"~fJD~GES OR
STRUCTURAL ME ,: ~~Y, ~TTACHED TO, OR A
PART OF A BUILDIN4A ~". ~!rERIORA1J1EDCONDITION OR
ARE OTHERWISE UM QJiSUS ' ESIGN LOAOS WHICH ARE
SPECIFIED IN THIS CODE, ARE HEREBY DESIGNATED AS UNSAFE BUILDING
APPENDAGES. ALL SUCH UNSAFE BUILDING APPENDAGES ARE PUBLIC
NUISANCES AND SHALL BE ABATED IN ACCORDANCE WITH SECTION 7-2-108.1
OF THIS CHAPTER.

7-2-108.2 NOTICE TO OWNER. THE BUILDING OFFICIAL SHALL EXAMINE OR
CAUSE TO BE EXAMINED EVERY BUILDING OR STRUCTURE OR PORTION
THEREOF REPORTED AS DANGEROUS OR DAMAGED AND, IF SUCH IS FOUND
TO BE AN UNSAFE BUILDING' AS DEFINED IN THIS SECTION, THE BUILDING
OFFICIAL SHALL GIVE TO THE OWNER OF SUCH BUILDING OR STRUCTURE
WRITTEN NOTICE STATING THE DEFECTS THEREOF. THIS NOTICE MAY
REQUIRE THE OWNER OR PERSON IN CHARGE OF THE BUILDING PREMISES,
WITHIN 48 HOURS, TO COMMENCE EITHER THE REQUIRED REPAIRS OR
IMPROVEMENTS OR DEMOLITION AND REMOVAL OF THE BUILDING OR
STRUCTURE OR PORTIONS THEREOF, AND ALL SUCH WORK SHALL BE
COMPLETED WITHIN 90 DAYS FROM THE DATE OF NOTICE, UNLESS
OTHERWISE STIPULATED BY THE BUILDING OFFICIAL. IF NECESSARY, SUCH
NOTICE ALSO SHALL REQUIRE THE BUILDING, STRUCTURE OR PORTION
THEREOF TO BE VACATED FORTHWITH AND NOT REOCCUPIED UNTIL THE
REQUIRED REPAIRS AND IMPROVEMENTS ARE COMPLETED, INSPECTED, AND
APPROVED BY THE BUILDING OFFICIAL.

40



DRAFT RESOLUTION 2009-769
JULY 22, 2009

7-2-108.2.1 PROPER,SERVICE. PROPER SERVICE OF SUCH NOTICE SHALL BE
BY ONE OF THE FOLLOWING METHODS; PERSONAL SERVICE UPON THE
OWNER OF RECORD, IF FOUND WITHIN THE TOWN LIMITS; IF NOT FOUND
WITHIN THE TOWN LIMITS, SUCH SERVICE MAY BE MADE UPON SAID OWNER
BY FIRST CLASS MAIL, POSTAGE PAID, ADDRESSED TO THE OWNER,
OCCUPANT, AGENT, MANAGER OR RESPONSIBLE PERSON AT THE LAST
KNOW ADDRESS; DELIVERED IN ANY MANNER PERMITTED BY THE ARIZONA
RULES OF CIVIL PROCEDURE FOR SERVICE OF PROCESS OR POSTED IN A
CONSPICUOUS PLACE ON OR ABOUT THE ENTRANCE OF THE STRUCTURE
AFFECTED BY SUCH NOTICE. SERVICE BY MAIL IS DEEMEO COMPLETE UPON
DEPOSIT IN THE U.S. MAIL. SERVICE OF SUCH NOTICE IN THE FOREGOING
MANNER UPON THE OWNER'S AGENT OR UPON THE PERSON RESPONSIBLE
FOR THE STRUCTURE SHALL CONSTITUTE SERVICE OF NOTICE UPON THE
OWNER. THE DESIGNATED PERIOD WITHIN WHICH SAID OWNER OR PERSON
IN CHARGE IS REQUIRED TO COMPLY WITH THE ORDER OF THE BUILDING
OFFICIAL SHALL BEGIN AS OF THE DATE SUCH NOTICE WAS MAILED,
RECEIVED OR POSTED.

7-2-108.3 POSTING 0 IGNS T L CAUSE TO BE
POSTED AT EACH E ,{iF TO READ: DO NOT
ENTER UNSAFE TO ,fiPCU'l lTV DEVELOPMENT
DEPARTMENT, OF TilE T..QpY" ""p A SUCH ': TICE SHALL REMAIN
POSTED UNTIL THE R~rJIR REpJRS, D SLiTION cJR REMOVAL ARE
COMPLETED. SUCH NOTICE SHALL NOT BE REMOVED WITHOUT WRITTEN
PERMISSION OF THE BUILDING OFFICIAL AND NO PERSON SHALL ENTER THE
BUILDING EXCEPT FOR THE PURPOSE OF MAKING THE REQUIRED REPAIRS
OR OF DEMOLISHING THE BUILDING.

7-2-108.4 RIGHT TO DEMOLISH. IN CASE THE OWNER SHALL FAIL, NEGLECT
OR REFUSE TO COMPLY WITH THE NOTICE TO REPAIR, REHABILITATE, OR TO
DEMOLISH AND REMOVE SAID BUILDING OR STRUCTURE OR PORTION
THEREOF, THE TOWN COUNCIL MAY ORDER THE OWNER OF THE BUILDING
PROSECUTED AS A VIOLATOR OF THE PROVISIONS OF THIS CODE AND MAY
ORDER THE BUILDING OFFICIAL TO PROCEED WITH THE WORK SPECIFIED IN
SUCH NOTICE.

7-2-108.5 COSTS. COSTS INCURRED UNDER SECTION 7-2-108.4 SHALL BE PAID
OUT OF THE TOWN TREASURY AND SHALL BE CHARGED TO THE OWNER AND
COLLECTED BY THE FINANCIAL DIRECTOR IN THE MANNER SPECIFIED IN THE
TOWN OF CAMP VERDE CODE.

7-2-108.6 RESTORATION. THE STRUCTURE OR BUILDING SERVICE EQUIPMENT
DETERMINED TO BE UNSAFE SHALL BE PERMITTED TO BE RESTORED TO A
SAFE CONDITION. TO THE EXTENT REPAIRS, ALTERATIONS OR ADDITIONS

41



DRAFT RESOLUTION 2009-769
JULY 22, 2009

ARE MADE OR ACHANGE OF OCCUPANCY OCCURS DURING THE
RESTORATION OF THE STRUCTURE, SUCH REPAIRS, ALTERATIONS,
ADDITIONS OR CHANGE OF OCCUPANCY SHALL COMPLY WITH THE
REQUIREMENTS OF THIS CHAPTER AND THE TECHNICAL CODES.

SECTION 7-2-109 VIOLATIONS

7-2-109.1 UNLAWFUL ACTS. IT SHALL BE UNLAWFUL FOR ANY PERSON, FIRM
OR CORPORATION TO ERECT, CONSTRUCT, ALTER, EXTEND, REPAIR, MOVE, .
REMOVE, DEMOLISH OR OCCUpy ANY BUILDING, STRUCTURE OR BUILDING
SERVICE EQUIPMENT REGULATED BY THIS CHAPTER AND THE TECHNICAL
CODES, OR CAUSE SAME TO BE DONE, IN CONFLICT WITH OR IN VIOLATION
OF ANY OF THE PROVISIONS· OF THIS CHAPTER AND THE TECHNICAL CODES.

7-2-109.2 ILLEGAL BUILDING. EVERY BUILDING OR PORTION THEREOF
CONSTRUCTED WITHOUT A BUILDING PERMIT WHERE REQUIRED BY THIS
CHAPTER, SHALL BE MADE TO CONFORM TO THE PROVISIONS OF THIS
CHAPTER AND THE TECHNICAL CODES OR SHALL BE DEMOLISHED.

7-2-109.3 NOTICE OF . THE BUILDING OFFICIAL IS AUTHORIZED TO

~~:iR~SN~~~~~~ g "'f0~=~lg~NER, THE
CONSTRUCTION, AL 0", E '" PAIR, M~VING, REMOVAL,
DEMOLITION OR OC c'fJ OF 11' ILDI ,TRUCT~RE OR BUILDING
SERVICE EQUIPMENT IN VIOLATION OF THE PROVISIONS OF THIS CHAPTER,
THE TECHNICAL CODES OR IN VIOLATION OF A PERMIT OR CERTIFICATE
ISSUED UNDER THE PROVISIONS OF THIS CHAPTER. SERVICE OF SUCH
NOTICE SHALL BE AS DESCRIBED IN SECTION 7-2-108.2.1 OF THIS CHAPTER.
SUCH ORDER SHALL DIRECT THE DISCONTINUANCE OF THE ILLEGAL ACTION

. OR CONDITION AND THE ABATEMENT OF THE VIOLATION.

7-2-109.4 PROSECUTION OF VIOLATION. IF THE NOTICE OF VIOLATION IS NOT
COMPLIED WITHIN THE TIME FRAME SPECIFIED IN THE NOTICE, THE TOWN
MAY INSTITUTE THE APPROPRIATE PROCEEDING AT LAW, OR IN EQUITY TO
RESTRAIN, CORRECT OR ABATE SUCH VIOLATION, OR TO REQUIRE THE
REMOVAL OR TERMINATION OF THE UNLAWFUL OCCUPANCY OF THE
BUILDING OR STRUCTURE IN VIOLATION OF THE PROVISIONS OF THIS
CHAPTER OR OF THE TECHNICAL CODES OR OF THE ORDER OR DIRECTION
MADE PURSUANT THERETO.

7-2-109.5 REMEDIES NOT EXCLUSIVE. VIOLATIONS OF THIS CHAPTER OR THE
TECHNICAL CODES ARE IN ADDITION TO ANY OTHER VIOLATION
ESTABLISHED BY LAW, AND THIS CHAPTER AND SHALL NOT BE
INTERPRETED AS LIMITING THE PENALTIES, ACTIONS, OR ABATEMENT

42



DRAFT RESOLUTION 2009-769
JULY 22, 2009

PROCEDURES THAT MAY BE TAKEN BY THE TOWN OR OTHER PERSONS
UNDER THE LAWS, ORDINANCES OR RULES.

7-2-109.6 VIOLATION PENALTIES. ANY PERSON, FIRM, OR CORPORATION WHO
SHALL VIOLATE ANY OF THE PROVISIONS OF THIS CHAPTER AND THE
TECHNICAL CODES MAY BE SUBJECT TO ONE OR MORE OF THE PENALTIES
AS PRESCRIBED IN THE TOWN OF CAMP VERDE CODE. CIVIL SANCTION: A
FINE OF NOT LESS THAN ONE HUNDRED DOLLARS ($100) NOR MORE THE ONE
THOUSAND DOLLARS ($1000) BUT TOTAL FINES SHALL NOT EXCEED TWO
THOUSAND DOLLARS ($2000) PER DAY FOR EACH PROPERTY.

CRIMINAL MISDEMEANOR: IF FOUND GUILTY OF A CLASS ONE MISDEMEANOR
AND UPON CONVICTION SHALL BE PUNISHED BY A FINE NOT TO EXCEED TWO
THOUSAND FIVE HUNDRED DOLLARS ($2,500) OR BY IMPRISONMENT IN THE
TOWN JAIL FOR A PERIOD NOT TO EXCEED SIX (6) MONTHS, OR BY BOTH
SUCH FINE AND IMPRISONMENT.

SEPARATE OFFENSE: EACH DAY ANY VIOLATION IS.CONTINUED OR THE
FAILURE TO PERFORM ANY ACT OR DUTY REQUIRED BY THIS SECTION SHALL
CONSTITUTE A SEP VI A ION 0 FFE

SECTION 7-2-110 B

7-2-110.1 GENERAL E . 0 RAN" , CIDE A EALS OF ORDERS,
DECISIONS OR DETERMINATIONS MADE BY THE BUILDING OFFICIAL RELATIVE
TO THE APPLICATION AND INTERPRETATION OF THIS CHAPTER AND THE
TECHNICAL CODES, THERE SHALL BE AND IS HEREBY CREATED ONE OR
MORE BOARD OF APPEALS CONSISTING OF MEMBERS WHO ARE QUALIFIED
BY EXPERIENCE AND TRAINING TO PASS ON MATTERS PERTAINING TO
BUILDING CONSTRUCTION AND WHO ARE NOT EMPLOYEES OF THE TOWN.
THE BUILDING OFFICIAL SHALL BE THE EX-OFFICIO MEMBER OF AND SHALL
ACT AS SECRETARY TO THE BOARD BUT SHALL HAVE NO VOTE ON ANY
MATTER BEFORE THE BOARD.

7-2-110.2 LIMITATIONS ON AUTHORITY. THE BOARD OF APPEALS SHALL HAVE
NO AUTHORITY RELATIVE TO INTERPRETATION OF THIS CHAPTER NOR SHALL
THE BOARD BE EMPOWERED TO WAIVE REQUIREMENTS OF THE TECHNICAL
CODES.

7-2-110.3 CREATED, COMPOSITION.

7-2-110.4 APPOINTMENT, TERMS AND VACANCIES. APPOINTMENTS AND
TERMS OF MEMBERS SHALL BE IN ACCORDANCE WITH THE TOWN CHARTER.
IN THE EVENT OF THE UNEXCUSED ABSENCE OF A MEMBER FROM THREE (3)
CONSECUTIVE MEETINGS, THE POSITION SHALL BE DEEMED VACANT.

43



DRAFT RESOLUTION 2009-769
JULY 22, 2009

VACANCIES SHALL BE FILLED IN ACCORDANCE WITH THE TOWN CHARTER
FOR THE UNEXPIRED TERM OF ANY MEMBER UNABLE OR INELIGIBLE TO
SERVE. A MEMBER WHOSE TERM EXPIRES MAY SERVE UNTIL A SUCCESSOR
HAS BEEN APPOINTED. THE TOWN COUNCIL MAY REMOVE ANY MEMBER FOR
CAUSE OR SERVE AS THE BOARD OF APPEALS.

7-2-110.5 OFFICERS. THE BOARD SHALL ELECT A CHAIRMAN AND VICE­
CHAIRMAN FROM AMONG ITS MEMBERS, NEITHER OF WHO SHALL BE AN EX
OFFICIO MEMBER. THE CHAIRMAN AND VICE-CHAIRMAN SHALL EACH SERVE
FOR A ONE-YEAR PERIOD OR UNTIL THEIR SUCCESSORS ARE ELECTED.

7-2-110.6 MEETINGS. THE BOARD SHALL HOLD ONE REGULAR MEETING
EVERY THREE (3) MONTHS OR WHEN THERE IS PENDING BUSINESS. SPECIAL
MEETINGS MAY BE CALLED BY THE COMMUNITY DEVELOPMENT DIRECTOR
OR AT THE REQUEST OF THE CHAIRMAN OR ANY THREE (3) MEMBERS. THE
AFFIRMATIVE VOTE OF THREE FOUR {3} (4) MEMBERS SHALL BE REQUIRED
FOR PASSAGE OF ANY MATTER BEFORE THE BOARD.

7-2-110.7 POWERS, DUTIES, RESPONSIBILITIES.

1. THE BOARD, ;;,1 TS , MAY INTERPRET
THE TECHNIO"L i,' H ILDI CODE IN SPECIAL

~~~ESQ~:iEN!T!io lI.,~~Y~~~'~~:SW;N~~~~ ~~~
RECOMMEND TO THE COUNCIL SUCH NEW LEGISLATION AS IS
CONSISTENT THEREWITH.

2. THE BOARD MAY GRANT A VARIANCE TO THE TECHNICAL PROVISIONS
OF THE BUILDING CODE WHEN IT CAN BE ESTABLISHED THAT A
MANIFEST INJUSTICE WOULD BE DONE. A VARIANCE SHALL NOT BE
GRANTED BY THE BOARD UNLESS IT IS FOUND THAT:

A. SPECIAL CIRCUMSTANCES OR CONDITIONS APPLY TO THE
REQUEST; AND

B. GRANTING THE VARIANCE IS NECESSARY FOR THE
PRESERVATION AND ENJOYMENT OF SUBSTANTIAL PROPERTY
RIGHTS; AND

C. GRANTING THE VARIANCE WILL NOT BE MATERIALLY
DETRIMENTAL TO PERSONS RESIDING OR WORKING IN THE
PREMISES, TO ADJACENT OR SURROUNDING PROPERTY OR TO
THE PUBLIC IN GENERAL; AND

D. GRANTING THE VARIANCE WILL BE IN HARMONY WITH THE

44



DRAFT RESOLUTION 2009-769
JULY 22, 2009

PURPOSES SOUGHT TO BE ATTAINED BY THE BUILDING CODE.

EACH CASE SHALL BE EVALUATED ON ITS INDIVIDUAL MERITS AND
SHALL NOT BE CONSTRUED TO SET A PRECEDENT FOR DEVIATING
FROM THE REQUIREMENTS OF THE BUILDING CODE. THE FINDINGS OF
THE BOARD SHALL BE BINDING UPON ALL PARTIES EXCEPT AS
PROVIDED UNDER SECTION 7-2-110.9.

3. THE BOARD MAY APPROVE THE USE OF THE ALTERNATE MATERIALS
OR METHODS OF CONSTRUCTION, PROVIDED THE ALTERNATE
MATERIALS OR METHOD IS, FOR THE PURPOSE INTENDED, AT LI;:AST
THE EQUIVALENT OF THAT PRESCRIBED BY THE BUILDING CODE IN
SUITABILITY, STRENGTH, EFFECTIVENESS, FIRE RESISTANCE,
DURABILITY, SAFETY AND SANITATION.

4. THE BOARD MAY ADOPT SUCH RULES AND REGULATIONS NECESSARY
FOR THE DISCHARGE OF ITS DUTIES, PROVIDED SAID RULES ARE NOT
IN CONFLICT WITH THE CHARTER OR THIS CODE.

5. THE BOARD I
OFFICE FOR
BOARD TO AI

7-2-110.8 APPEAL F -

1. ANY PERSON DISSATISFIED WITH A DECISION OF THE BUILDING
OFFICIAL APPLYING TO THE TECHNICAL PROVISIONS OF THE BUILDING
CODE OR TO AN ALTERNATE MATERIAL OR METHOD OF
CONSTRUCTION MAY REQUEST A HEARING BEFORE THE BOARD BY
FILING AN APPEAL WITH THE COMMUNITY DEVELOPMENT DIRECTOR
ON A FORM PROVIDED THEREFORE. SUCH APPEAL SHALL BE HEARD
AT THE NEXT REGULAR MEETING OF THE BOARD UNLESS SUCH
APPEAL IS FILED WITHIN TWENTY-ONE (21) DAYS PRECEDING THE NEXT
REGULAR BOARD MEETING, IN WHICH CASE SUCH APPEAL SHALL BE
HEARD AT THE NEXT SUCCEEDING REGULAR OR SPECIAL BOARD
MEETING.

2. ALL HEARINGS SHALL BE OPEN TO THE PUBLIC AND ANY PERSON
WHOSE INTEREST MAY BE AFFECTED BY THE DECISION SHALL BE
GIVEN AN OPPORTUNITY TO BE HEARD.

3. THE BOARD SHALL RENDER ALL ITS DECISIONS ON APPEALS IN
WRITING TO THE APPELLANT WITH A COPY TO THE COMMUNITY
DEVELOPMENT DIRECTOR AND BUILDING OFFICIAL.

45



DRAFT RESOLUTION 2009-769
JULY 22, 2009

7-2-110.9 DECISION OF THE BOARD.

1. THE APPEAL SHALL BE IN WRITING AND SHALL BE FILED WITH THE
TOWN CLERK.

2. THE BOARD DECISION ON THE MATTER SHALL BE PREDICATED ON THE
SAME FINDINGS AS SET FORTH IN SECTION 7-2-110.7 AND SHALL BE
FINAL.

7-2-110.10 APPEAL FILING, FEES.

1. APPEALS SHALL BE FILED IN THE OFFICE OF THE COMMUNITY
DEVELOPMENT DEPARTMENT ON A FORM PROVIDED THEREFORE. A
FEE SHALL BE PAID AT THE TIME OF FILING OF AN APPEAL, IN
ACCORDANCE WITH THE SCHEDULE ESTAB.L1SHED BY TOWN COUNCIL.

2. NO PART OF' THE FEES REQUIRED HEREIN SHALL BE REFUNDABLE
AFTER AN APPLICATION IS FILED AND THE FEE PAID.

7-2-111.1 PAYMENT '" BE SUED NOR
CONSIDERED VALlD(L ~" L~v ~ i,. ES EST be L1SHED AND
ADOPTED BY THE T " . F SlAM 'ERDE <0WN COUNf§IL IN ACCORDANCE
WITH THE TOWN OF CAMP VERDE CODE HAVE BEEN PAID, NOR SHALL AN
AMENDMENT TO A PERMIT BE RELEASED UNTIL THE ADDITIONAL FEE, IF ANY,
HAS BEEN PAID.

7-2-111.2 SCHEDULE OF PERMIT FEES. ON BUILDINGS, STRUCTURES,
ELECTRICAL, GAS, MECHANICAL, AND FIRE SYSTEMS OR ALTERATIONS
THERETO REQUIRING A PERMIT, A FEE FOR EACH PERMIT SHALL BE PAID AS
REQUIRED IN ACCORDANCE WITH THE SCHEDULE AS ESTABLISHED BY THE
TOWN OF CAMP VERDE.

7-2-111.3 BUILDING PERMIT VALUATION. THE APPLICANT FOR A PERMIT
SHALL PROVIDE AN ESTIMATED PERMIT VALUE AT THE TIME OF INITIAL
APPLICATION. PERMIT VALUATIONS SHALL INCLUDE TOTAL VALUE OF WORK,
INCLUDING MATERIALS AND LABOR, FOR WHICH THE PERMIT IS BEING
ISSUED, SUCH AS FINISH WORK, PAINTING, ROOFING, ELECTRICAL, GAS,
MECHANICAL, PLUMBING EQUIPMENT, HEATING, AIR-CONDITIONING,
ELEVATORS, FIRE EXTINGUISHING SYSTEMS, OTHER PERMANENT
SYSTEMS/EQUIPMENT, GRADING, LANDSCAPING, AND OTHER SITE RELATED
IMPROVEMENTS. THE FINAL BUILDING PERMIT VALUATION SHALL BE THE
GREATER OF THE APPLICANT'S STATED VALUATION OR THE VALUATION
CALCULATED BY USING THE ICC BUILDING VALUATION DATA, EXCEPT THE

46



DRAFT RESOLUTION 2009-769
JULY 22, 2009

BUILDING OFFICIAL OR DESIGNEE MAY SET THE FINAL BUILDING PERMIT
VALUATION WHEN DEEMED NI;CESSARY.

7-2-111.4 PLAN REVIEW FEES. WHEN SECTION 7-2-105.1 REQUIRES SUBMITTAL
DOCUMENTS, A PLAN REVIEW FEE SHALL BE PAID AT THE TIME OF
SUBMITTING THE SUBMITTAL DOCUMENTS FOR PLAN REVIEW. SAID PLAN
REVIEW FEE SHALL BE 65 PERCENT OF THE BUILDING PERMIT FEE AS
SHOWN IN SCHEDULE AS ESTABLISHED BY THE TOWN OF CAMP VERDE.

THE PLAN REVIEW FEES SPECIFIED IN THIS SUBSECTION ARE SEPARATE
FEES FROM THE PERMIT FEES SPECIFIED IN SECTION 7-2-110.1 AND ARE IN
ADDITION TO THE PERMIT FEES.

WHEN SUBMITTAL DOCUMENTS ARE INCOMPLETE OR CHANGED SO AS TO
REQUIRE ADDITIONAL PLAN REVIEW, AN ADDITIONAL PLAN REVIEW FEE
SHALL BE CHARGED AT THE RATE SHOWN IN SCHED'ULE AS ESTABLISHED
BY THE TOWN OF CAMP VERDE.

THE PLAN REVIEW FEES PAY FOR THE INITIAL PLAN REVIEW AND TWO (2)
SUBSEQUENT RE-S AL OR THE SAM ~~.u= MORE THAN
THREE PLAN REVIE ED IF ERpt1lrAPPLICATION
SHALL EXPIRE BY TEll) N;EVIEW FEES MAY BE
ASSESSED AS DET IN",;D ,'mY '~'il> .sf OFFICIA~!AT THE TIME' OF . ,
PERMIT ISSUANCE, ' IfIO~L P&Nf REV FEES FOR ANY INCREASE IN
VALUATION SHALL BE ASSESSED IN CONJUNCTION WITH, AND AS A
CONDITION OF, PERMIT ISSUANCE.

7-2-111.4.1 EXPEDITED PLAN REVIEW. EXPEDITED PLAN REVIEW FEES SHALL
BE EQUAL TO THE AMOUNT OF THE PLAN REVIEW FEES REQUIRED BY THIS
SECTION. EXPEDITED PLAN REVIEW FEES ARE SEPARATE FROM THE PLAN
REVIEW AND PERMIT FEES REQUIRED BY THIS SECTION AND ARE IN
ADDITION TO THOSE FEES.

7-2-111.5 INVESTIGATION FEES. ANY PERSON WHO COMMENCES WORK ON A
BUILDING, STRUCTURE, ELECTRICAL, GAS, MECHANICAL OR PLUMBING
SYSTEM BEFORE OBTAINING THE NECESSARY PERMITS SHALL BE SUBJECT
TO AN INVESTIGATION FEE ESTABLISHED BY THE BUILDING OFFICIAL THAT
SHALL BE IN ADDITION TO THE REQUIRED PERMIT FEES. THE INVESTIGATION
FEE SHALL BE EQUAL TO THE PERMIT FEE REQUIRED BY THIS CHAPTER. THE
PAYMENT OF SUCH INVESTIGATION FEE SHALL NOT EXEMPT AN APPLICANT
FROM COMPLIANCE WITH ALL OTHER PROVISIONS OF THIS CHAPTER AND
THE TECHNICAL CODES. AN INVESTIGATION FEE SHALL BE COLLECTED
WHETHER OR NOT A PERMIT IS THEN OR SUBSEQUENTLY ISSUED.

47



DRAFT RESOLUTION 2009-769
JULY 22, 2009

7-2-111.6 FEE REFUNDS. THE BUILDING OFFICIAL MAY AUTHORIZE THE
REFUNDING OF ANY FEE PAID HEREUNDER, WHICH WAS ERRONEOUSLY PAID
OR COLLECTED.

THE BUILDING OFFICIAL MAY AUTHORIZE THE REFUNDING OF THAT PORTION
OF THE PERMIT FEE IN EXCESS OF THE FEE FOR ISSUANCE WHEN NO
INSPECTION HAS BEEN DONE FOR WHICH A PERMIT HAS BEEN ISSUED IN
ACCORDANCE WITH THIS CODE.

THE BUILDING OFFICIAL MAY AUTHORIZE THE REFUNDING OF THAT PORTION
OF THE PLAN REVIEW FEE IN EXCESS OF THE FEE FOR ISSUANCE WHEN THE
APPLICATION FOR A PERMIT FOR WHICH A PLAN REVIEW FEE HAS BEEN PAID
IS WITHDRAWN OR CANCELED BEFORE ANY PLAN REVIEWING IS DONE.

THE BUILDING OFFICIAL SHALL NOT AUTHORIZE THE REFUNDING OF ANY FEE
PAID EXCEPT UPON WRITTEN APPLICATION FILED BY THE ORIGINAL
PERMITTEE NOT LATER THAN 180 DAYS AFTER THE DATE OF FEE PAYMENT.

ARTICLE 7-6 5
STREET NAMING AND ADDRESSING

ARTICLE 7-7 6
ENFORCEMENT PROCEDURES FOR VIOLATIONS

BUILDING CODES

SECTION 7-76-1 INSPECTION WARRANT

48



DRAFT RESOLUTION 2009-769
JULY 22, 2009

ARTICLE 7-87
PLACEMENT OF UTILmES UNDERGROUND AND ESTABLISHING A PERMIT

CHAPTER 7
BUILDING

ARTICLE 7-98
STORMWATER PROTECTION

ARTICLE 7-ffi 9
MUNICIPAL DEVELOPMENT FEES

49


	7-22-09 additional information
	07-22-09 Special - Work Session

