RESOLUTION 2009 767
AUGUST 19, 2009

RESOLUTION NO. 2009-767

A RESOLUTION OF THE MAYOR AND COUNCIL OF THE TOWN OF CAMP VERDE,
ARIZONA, DECLARING AS A PUBLIC RECORD A CERTAIN DOCUMENT FILED WITH THE
TOWN CLERK AND ENTITLED "TOWN OF CAMP VERDE TECHNICAL CODE
AMENDMENTS CHAPTER 7 — BUILDING, ARTICLE 7-1, SECTION 7-1-100 OF THE TOWN
OF CAMP VERDE CODE” OF THE TOWN OF CAMP VERDE, ARIZONA.

THAT certain document entitted "TOWN OF CAMP VERDE TECHNICAL CODE
AMENDMENTS CHAPTER 7 — BUILDING, ARTICLE 7-1, SECTION 7-1-100 OF THE TOWN
OF CAMP VERDE CODE” OF THE TOWN OF CAMP VERDE, ARIZONA, three copies of
- which are on file in the office of Community Development, is hereby declared to be a public
record, and said copies are ordered to remain on file for distribution to the public.

PASSED AND ADOPTED BY THE Mayor and Council of the Town of Camp Verde,
Arizona, this _/7 ___ day of (Zws , 2009.

Mayor

ATTEST:

Letag Bosir

Town Clerk

APPROVED AS TO FORM:

NN

ttorney




RESOLUTION 2009 767
AUGUST 19, 2009

CHAPTER 7
BUILDING
Article 7-1
ADOPTION OF THE 2006 INTERNATIONAL CODE COUNCIL CODES, (ICC)
AND RELATED PUBLIC CODES

SECTION 7-1-100 TOWN OF CAMP VERDE TECHNICAL CODE AMENDMENTS

THE ABOVE LISTED DOCUMENTS ARE HEREBY AMENDED FOR THE INCORPORATED
AREAS OF THE TOWN OF CAMP VERDE.

INTERNATIONAL BUILDING CODE, 2006 EDITION, ADOPTED BY REFERENCE

THE INTERNATIONAL BUILDING CODE, 2006 EDITION, INCLUDING APPENDIX J AND
HEREBY REFERRED TO, ADOPTED, AND MADE A PART HERE OF AS SET FORTH
HEREIN, EXCEPTING SUCH PORTIONS AS ARE HEREINAFTER DELETED, MODIFIED OR
AMENDED.

CHAPTER 1 ADMINISTRATION. IS DELETED IN IT’S ENTIRETY AND REPLACED WITH
THE REQUIREMENTS OF THE TOWN OF CAMP VERDE ADMINISTRATIVE BUILDING
CODE AS ADOPTED AND FROM TIME TO TIME AMENDED.

SECTION 3109.3 — PUBLIC SWIMMING POOLS IS AMENDED BY THE DELETION OF
FOUR FEET (1290 MM) AND THE INSERTION OF FIVE FEET (1613 MM).

SECTION 3109.4.1 —- BARRIERS HEIGHT AND CLEARANCES IS AMENDED BY THE
DELETION OF FORTY-EIGHT INCHES (1219 MM) AND THE INSERTION OF SIXTY INCHES
(1530 MM).

SECTION 3109.4.1.7 GATES IS AMENDED BY REVISION OF THE LAST SENTENCE TO
READ AS FOLLOWS:

3109.4.1.7 - GATES. WHERE THE RELEASE MECHANISM OF THE SELF-LATCHING
DEVICE IS LOCATED LESS THAN FIFTY-FOUR INCHES (1372 MM) FROM THE BOTTOM
OF THE GATE, THE RELEASE MECHANISM SHALL BE LOCATED ON THE POOL SIDE
OF THE GATE AT LEAST FIVE INCHES (127 MM) BELOW THE TOP OF THE GATE, AND
THE GATE AND BARRIER SHALL HAVE OPENINGS NOT GREATER THAN 0.5 INCH (12.7
MM) WITHIN EIGHTEEN INCHES (457 MM) OF THE RELEASE MECHANISM.

SECTION 3109.4.1.8 DWELLING WALL AS A BARRIER IS HEREBY AMENDED BY THE
ADDITION OF #4 TO READ AS FOLLOWS:

4. EMERGENCY ESCAPE AND RESCUE WINDOWS FOR SLEEPING ROOMS WHICH
FACE WITHIN A SWIMMING POOL ENCLOSURE SHALL BE EQUIPPED WITH A
LATCHING DEVICE LOCATED FIFTY-FOUR INCHES (1372 MM) ABOVE THE FLOOR. ALL
OTHER OPERABLE DWELLING UNIT WINDOWS FACING WITHIN THE SWIMMING POOL

2




RESOLUTION 2009 767
AUGUST 19, 2009

ENCLOSURE SHALL BE EQUIPPED WITH SCREWED-IN-PLACE WIRE MESH SCREEN, A
KEYED LOCK THAT PREVENTS OPENING THE WINDOW MORE THAN FOUR INCHES
(102 MM), OR A LATCHING DEVICE LOCATED NOT LESS THAN FIFTY-FOUR INCHES
(1372 MM) ABOVE THE FLOOR.

SECTION 3401.3 - COMPLIANCE WITH OTHER CODES IS AMENDED BY DELETION OF
INTERNATIONAL PRIVATE SEWAGE DISPOSAL CODE, AND ICC ELECTRIC CODE.

INTERNATIONAL FUEL GAS CODE, 2006 EDITION, ADOPTED BY REFERENCE

THE INTERNATIONAL FUEL GAS CODE, 2006 EDITION, INCLUDING APPENDIXES A, B, C
AND D, AND HEREBY REFERRED TO, ADOPTED, AND MADE A PART HERE OF AS SET
FORTH HEREIN, EXCEPTING SUCH PORTIONS AS ARE HEREINAFTER DELETED,
MODIFIED OR AMENDED.

CHAPTER 1 ADMINISTRATION. IS DELETED IN IT’S ENTIRETY AND REPLACED WITH
THE REQUIREMENTS OF THE TOWN OF CAMP VERDE ADMINISTRATIVE BUILDING
CODE AS ADOPTED AND FROM TIME TO TIME AMENDED.

SECTION 404.9 — MINIMUM BURIAL DEPTH IS AMENDED BY ADDING THE FOLLOWING
SENTENCE TO THE END OF THE SECTION TO READ AS FOLLOWS:

404.9 — MINIMUM BURIAL DEPTH. UNDERGROUND FERROUS GAS PIPING SHALL BE
ELECTRICALLY ISOLATED FROM THE REST OF THE GAS SYSTEM WITH LISTED OR
APPROVED ISOLATION FITTINGS (DIALECTIC UNION) INSTALLED A MINIMUM SIX
INCHES (152 MM) ABOVE GRADE. ALL NONMETALLIC PIPING SHALL BE INSTALLED
WITH A YELLOW 18 AWG TRACER WIRE TERMINATING 12 INCHES (305 MM) ABOVE
GRADE AT EACH END.

SECTION 409.1.3 — GAS PIPING INSTALLATIONS, SHUTOFF VALVES, ACCESS TO
SHUTOFF VALVES IS HEREBY AMENDED BY ADDING A SECOND SENTENCE TO READ
AS FOLLOWS:

409.1.3 — GAS PIPING INSTALLATIONS, SHUTOFF VALVES, ACCESS TO SHUTOFF
VALVES. ALL BUILDINGS SHALL BE PROVIDED WITH A SHUTOFF VALVE LOCATED AT
THE BUILDING ON THE DOWNSTREAM SIDE OF THE GAS METER.

INTERNATIONAL MECHANICAL CODE, 2006 EDITION, ADOPTED BY REFERENCE

THE INTERNATIONAL MECHANICAL CODE, 2006 EDITION, INCLUDING APPENDIX A
AND HEREBY REFERRED TO, ADOPTED, AND MADE A PART HERE OF AS SET FORTH
HEREIN, EXCEPTING SUCH PORTIONS AS ARE HEREINAFTER DELETED, MODIFIED OR
AMENDED.

CHAPTER 1 ADMINISTRATION. IS DELETED IN IT’S ENTIRETY AND REPLACED WITH
THE REQUIREMENTS OF THE TOWN OF CAMP VERDE ADMINISTRATIVE BUILDING
CODE AS ADOPTED AND FROM TIME TO TIME AMENDED.

INTERNATIONAL PLUMBING CODE, 2006 EDITION, ADOPTED BY REFERENCE
3




RESOLUTION 2009 767
AUGUST 19, 2009

THE INTERNATIONAL PLUMBING CODE, 2006 EDITION, INCLUDING APPENDIXES B, D,
F AND G, AND HEREBY REFERRED TO, ADOPTED, AND MADE A PART HERE OF AS
SET FORTH HEREIN, EXCEPTING SUCH PORTIONS AS ARE HEREINAFTER DELETED,
MODIFIED OR AMENDED.

CHAPTER 1 ADMINISTRATION. IS DELETED IN IT’S ENTIRETY AND REPLACED WITH
THE REQUIREMENTS OF THE TOWN OF CAMP VERDE ADMINISTRATIVE BUILDING
CODE AS ADOPTED AND FROM TIME TO TIME AMENDED.

SECTION 305.6.1 — SEWER DEPTH IS HEREBY AMENDED TO READ AS FOLLOWS:

305.6.1 — SEWER DEPTH. BUILDING SEWERS THAT CONNECT TO PRIVATE SEWAGE
DISPOSAL SYSTEMS SHALL BE A MINIMUM OF TWELVE INCHES (305 MM) BELOW
FINISHED GRADE AT THE POINT OF SEPTIC TANK CONNECTION. ALL. NONMETALLIC
BUILDING SEWERS SHALL BE INSTALLED WITH A GREEN 18 AWG TRACER WIRE
TERMINATING 12 INCHES (305 MM) ABOVE GRADE AT EACH END.

CHAPTER 4 FIXTURES, FAUCETS AND FIXTURE FITTINGS
SECTION 403 — MINIMUM PLUMBING FACILITIES

TABLE 403.1 — MINIMUM NUMBER OF REQUIRED PLUMBING FIXTURES IS HEREBY
AMENDED BY ADDITION OF NEW FOOTNOTE “E” TO READ AS FOLLOWS:

TABLE 403.1 — MINIMUM NUMBER OF FIXTURES.
E. WATER COOLERS OR BOTTLED WATER DISPENSERS MAY BE
SUBSTITUTED FOR DRINKING FOUNTAINS IN A, B AND M OCCUPANCIES
WITH TWENTY-FIVE (25) OR FEWER OCCUPANTS.

SECTION 504.6 — REQUIREMENTS FOR DISCHARGE PIPE, ITEM #5 IS AMENDED TO
READ AS FOLLOWS:

504.6 - REQUIREMENTS FOR DISCHARGE PIPE.

5. DISCHARGE TO THE FLOOR, TO AN INDIRECT WASTE RECEPTOR OR TO THE
OUTDOORS. WHERE DISCHARGING TO THE OUTDOORS, DISCHARGE PIPING SHALL
BE NO LESS THAN SIX INCHES (152 MM) AND NO GREATER THAN TWENTY-FOUR
INCHES (610 MM) FROM GRADE.

SECTION 603 — WATER SERVICE PIPE INSTALLATION IS HEREBY AMENDED AS A NEW
SECTION TO READ AS FOLLOWS:

603.1 — WATER SERVICE PIPE INSTALLATION. THE INSTALLATION OF THE WATER
SERVICE PIPE SHALL COMPLY WITH SECTION 603.1.1.

603.1.1 ~ BURIAL DEPTH. THE WATER SERVICE PIPE SHALL BE BURIED A MINIMUM OF
EIGHTEEN INCHES (457 MM) BELOW THE FINISH GRADE. ALL NONMETALLIC SERVICE
PIPING SHALL BE INSTALLED WITH A BLUE 18 AWG TRACER WIRE TERMINATING 12
INCHES (305 MM) ABOVE GRADE AT EACH END.

4




RESOLUTION 2009 767
AUGUST 19, 2009

.SECTION 715.1 — SANITARY DRAINAGE; BACKWATER VALVES; SEWAGE BACKFLOW
IS AMENDED TO READ AS FOLLOWS:

715.1 — SANITARY DRAINAGE; BACKWATER VALVES; SEWAGE BACKFLOW. AN
APPROVED BACKWATER VALVE SHALL PROTECT ALL STRUCTURES CONNECTED TO
A PUBLIC SEWER SYSTEM.

SECTION 904.1 — ROOF EXTENSION IS AMENDED BY THE INSERTION OF TWELVE
INCHES (12”).

NATIONAL ELECTRICAL CODE, 2005 EDITION, ADOPTED BY REFERENCE

THE NATIONAL ELECTRICAL CODE, 2005 EDITION, AND HEREBY REFERRED TO,
ADOPTED, AND MADE A PART HERE OF AS SET FORTH HEREIN, EXCEPTING SUCH
PORTIONS AS ARE HEREINAFTER DELETED, MODIFIED OR AMENDED.

ARTICLE 90-1 (E) — ADMINISTRATION AND ENFORCEMENT IS HEREBY ADDED AS A
SUB PARAGRAPH TO READ AS FOLLOWS:

ARTICLE 90-1 (E) ~ ADMINISTRATION AND ENFORCEMENT —- FOR THE PURPOSE OF
ADMINISTRATION AND ENFORCEMENT OF THE REQUIREMENTS OF THIS CODE AND
AMENDMENTS THERETO, THE PROVISIONS OF THE TOWN OF CAMP VERDE
ADMINISTRATIVE BUILDING CODE AS ADOPTED BY SEPARATE ORDINANCE, AND AS
MAY BE AMENDED FROM TIME TO TIME, SHALL APPLY.

ARTICLE 210.8 GROUND-FAULT CIRCUIT ~INTERRUPTER PROTECTION FOR
PERSONNEL IS HEREBY AMENDED TO READ AS FOLLOWS:

(7) CONVENIENCE RECEPTACLES LOCATED WITHIN SIX FEET (1.8 M) OF ANY SINK,
WASHBASIN, TUB OR SHOWER.

INTERNATIONAL RESIDENTIAL CODE; 2006 EDITION, ADOPTED BY REFERENCE
THE INTERNATIONAL RESIDENTIAL CODE, 2006 EDITION, INCLUDING APPENDIXES A,
B, C, G, H, J, AND Q, AND HEREBY REFERRED TO, ADOPTED, AND MADE A PART

HERE OF AS SET FORTH HEREIN, EXCEPTING SUCH PORTIONS AS ARE HEREINAFTER
DELETED, MODIFIED OR AMENDED.

CHAPTER 1 ADMINISTRATION. IS DELETED IN IT'S ENTIRETY AND REPLACED WITH
THE REQUIREMENTS OF THE TOWN OF CAMP VERDE ADMINISTRATIVE BUILDING
CODE AS ADOPTED AND FROM TIME TO TIME AMENDED.

SECTION R301 — DESIGN CRITERIA

TABLE R301.2 (1)

CLIMATIC AND GEOGRAPHIC DESIGN CRITERIA
5




RESOLUTION 2009 767
AUGUST 19, 2009

ROOF WIND SEISMIC SUBJECT TO DAMAGE FROM WINTER ICE BARRIER
SNOW SPEED DESIGN WEATHERING | FROST TERMITE DESIGN | UNDERLAYMENT
LOAD (MPH) CATEGORY LINE TEMP REQUIRED
DEPTH
12
20 90 MPH INCHES
EXPOSURE C MODERATE 305 MODERATE 20° NO
C MM) TO HEAVY
FLOOD HAZARDS AIR FREEZING INDEX MEAN ANNUAL TEMP
REFER TO FLOOD PLAIN 194 53°
UNIT

TABLE R301.5 1S AMENDED BY DELETION OF DESIGN LOAD 20 IN ATTICS WITH
STORAGE AND 30 IN SLEEPING ROOMS AND REPLACE WITH 40 IN BOTH AREAS.

USE LIVE LOAD
ATTICS WITH STORAGE %* 40
SLEEPING ROOMS 40

SECTION R309 -~ GARAGES AND CARPORTS

SECTION R309.1 - OPENING PROTECTION IS AMENDED BY THE ADDITION OF THE
SENTENCE TO READ AS FOLLOWS:

R309.1 — OPENING PROTECTION. DOORS PROVIDING PROTECTION SHALL BE
MAINTAINED SELF-CLOSING AND SELF-LATCHING.

SECTION R403.1.1 — MINIMUM SIZE IS HEREBY AMENDED BY ADDITION OF THE
FOLLOWING SECTION TO READ AS FOLLOWS:

R403.1.1 — MINIMUM SIZE. CONTINUOUS SPREAD CONCRETE FOOTINGS SHALL BE
REINFORCED WITH AT LEAST ONE NO. 4 HORIZONTAL REINFORCEMENT BAR
LOCATED THREE INCHES (76 MM) FROM THE BOTTOM OF THE FOOTING. MONOLITHIC
INTERIOR AND EXTERIOR CONCRETE FOOTINGS SHALL BE REINFORCED WITH AT
LEAST ONE NO. 4 HORIZONTAL BAR LOCATED THREE INCHES (76 MM) FROM THE
BOTTOM OF THE FOOTING AND ONE NO. 4 BAR LOCATED THREE INCHES (76 MM)
FROM THE TOP OF THE SLAB. PIER AND COLUMN FOOTINGS SHALL BE REINFORCED
WITH ONE NO. 4 HORIZONTAL BAR SPACED NO MORE THAN TWELVE INCHES (305
MM) IN EACH DIRECTION AND LOCATED THREE INCHES (76 MM) FROM THE BOTTOM
OF THE FOOTING.




RESOLUTION 2009 767
AUGUST 19, 2009

SECTION R403.1.3.1 - FOUNDATIONS AND STEM WALLS IS HEREBY DELETED IN ITS
ENTIRETY AND REVISED TO READ AS FOLLOWS:

R403.1.3.1 — FOUNDATIONS AND STEM WALLS. FOUNDATIONS AND STEM WALLS
SHALL BE PROVIDED WITH THE FOLLOWING STEEL REINFORCEMENT, UNLESS AN
ENGINEERED DESIGN IS PROVIDED:

1. FOR NON-RETAINING STEM WALLS LESS THAN TWENTY FOUR INCHES (610
MM) IN HEIGHT, A BOND BEAM COMPOSED OF ONE NO. 4 HORIZONTAL BAR IS
REQUIRED AT THE TOP OF THE WALL AND ONE NO. 4 VERTICAL BAR IS
PROVIDED AT FORTY-EIGHT INCHES (1219 MM) ON CENTER. THE VERTICAL
REINFORCEMENT SHALL EXTEND INTO THE FOOTING WITH A BENT HOOK
HAVING A MINIMUM OF SIX-INCH (152 MM) 90° BEND.

2. FOR STEM WALLS TWENTY-FOUR INCHES (610 MM) TO FORTY-EIGHT INCHES
(1219 MM) IN HEIGHT, A BOND BEAM COMPOSED OF TWO NO. 4 HORIZONTAL
BAR, OR ONE NO. 5 BAR IS REQUIRED AT THE TOP OF THE WALL AND ONE NO.
4 VERTICAL BAR IS PROVIDED AT FORTY-EIGHT INCHES (1219 MM) ON
CENTER. THE VERTICAL REINFORCEMENT SHALL EXTEND INTO THE FOOTING
WITH A BENT HOOK HAVING A MINIMUM OF SIX-INCH (152 MM) 90° BEND.

SECTION R404.1.1 — MASONRY FOUNDATION WALLS IS HEREBY AMENDED BY
DELETION IN ITS ENTIRETY AND REVISED TO READ AS FOLLOWS:

R404.1.1 —- MASONRY FOUNDATION WALLS. CONCRETE MASONRY FOUNDATION
WALLS SHALL BE CONSTRUCTED AS SET FORTH IN TABLES R404.1.1 (2), (3) AND (4)
FOR THE MOST RESTRICTIVE DESIGN SOIL CLASS PROVIDED THAT THE MINIMUM
VERTICAL REINFORCEMENT IS ONE NO. 4 SPACED NO MORE THAN FORTY-EIGHT
INCHES (1219 MM) ON CENTER AND SHALL ALSO COMPLY WITH THE PROVISIONS OF
THIS SECTION AND THE APPLICABLE PROVISIONS OF SECTIONS R606, R607 AND
R608. IN SEISMIC DESIGN CATEGORY Dy, D1 AND D,, CONCRETE MASONRY
FOUNDATION WALLS SHALL COMPLY WITH SECTION R404.1.4. RUBBLE STONE
MASONRY WALLS SHALL NOT BE USED IN SEISMIC DESIGN CATEGORY D,, D, D,OR
C.

TABLE R404.1.1 (5) - FOUNDATIONS, CONCRETE FOUNDATION WALLS IS HEREBY
AMENDED BY THE ADDITION OF NEW SUBSECTION “M” TO READ AS FOLLOWS:

R404.1.1 (5) - FOUNDATIONS, CONCRETE FOUNDATION WALLS.

M. WHERE TABLE R404.1.1 (5) PERMITS PLAIN CONCRETE WALLS, NOT LESS
THAN ONE NO. 4 VERTICAL BAR AT A SPACING NOT TO EXCEED FORTY-EIGHT
INCHES (1219 MM) ON CENTER, SHALL BE PROVIDED.

SECTION R404.1.8 ~ RUBBLE STONE MASONRY IS HEREBY DELETED IN ITS ENTIRETY.
TABLE R404.4 (2) — 7.5 INCH THICK FLAT ICF FOUNDATION WALLS, SUBSECTION “C”

IS HEREBY DELETED AND REPLACED WITH A NEW SUBSECTION “C” TO READ AS
FOLLOWS:




RESOLUTION 2009 767
AUGUST 19, 2009

C. N/R DENOTES NOT LESS THAN ONE NO. 4 VERTICAL BAR AT A SPACING NOT
TO EXCEED FORTY-EIGHT INCHES (1219 MM) ON CENTER, SHALL BE
PROVIDED.

TABLE R404.4 (3) — 9.5 INCH THICK FLAT ICF FOUNDATION WALLS, SUBSECTION “C”
IS HEREBY DELETED AND REPLACED WITH A NEW SUBSECTION “C” TO READ AS
FOLLOWS:

C. N/R DENOTES NOT LESS THAN ONE NO. 4 VERTICAL BAR AT A SPACING NOT
TO EXCEED FORTY-EIGHT INCHES (1219 MM) ON CENTER, SHALL BE
PROVIDED.

SECTION P2603.6 — FREEZING IS AMENDED BY THE REVISION OF THE LAST
SENTENCE TO READ AS FOLLOWS:

P2603.6 — FREEZING. WATER SERVICE PIPE SHALL BE INSTALLED NOT LESS THAN
EIGHTEEN INCHES (457 MM) DEEP AND NOT LESS THAN SIX INCHES (152 MM) BELOW
THE FROST LINE. ALL NONMETALLIC PIPING SHALL BE INSTALLED WITH A BLUE 18
AWG TRACER WIRE TERMINATING 12 INCHES (305 MM) ABOVE GRADE AT EACH END.

SECTION P2603.6.1 — SEWER DEPTH IS HEREBY AMENDED TO READ AS FOLLOWS:

P2603.6.1 - SEWER DEPTH. BUILDING SEWERS THAT CONNECT TO PRIVATE SEWAGE
DISPOSAL SYSTEMS SHALL BE A MINIMUM OF TWELVE INCHES (305 MM) BELOW
FINISHED GRADE AT THE POINT OF SEPTIC TANK CONNECTION. BUILDING SEWERS
SHALL BE A MINIMUM OF TWELVE INCHES (305 MM) BELOW GRADE. ALL
NONMETALLIC BUILDING SEWERS SHALL BE INSTALLED WITH A GREEN 18 AWG
TRACER WIRE TERMINATING 12 INCHES (305 MM) ABOVE GRADE AT EACH END.

SECTION AG 102 —- DEFINITIONS
SWIMMING POOL IS AMENDED TO READ AS FOLLOWS:

SWIMMING POOL. ANY STRUCTURE INTENDED FOR SWIMMING OR RECREATIONAL
BATHING THAT CONTAINS WATER OVER EIGHTEEN INCHES (457 MM) INCHES DEEP.
THIS INCLUDES IN-GROUND, ABOVEGROUND SWIMMING POOLS, HOT TUBS AND
SPAS.

SECTION AG103.2 - ABOVEGROUND AND ON-GROUND POOLS SECTION IS AMENDED
BY THE INSERTION OF EXCEPTION TO READ AS FOLLOWS:

AG103.2 - ABOVE GROUND AND ON-GROUND POOLS.

EXCEPTION: PREFABRICATED SWIMMING POOLS ACCESSORY TO
DETACHED ONE- AND TWO-FAMILY DWELLINGS AND MULTIPLE SINGLE-
FAMILY DWELLINGS (TOWNHOUSES) NOT MORE THAN THREE STORIES
ABOVE GRADE PLANE IN HEIGHT IN WHICH THE POOL WALLS ARE
ENTIRELY ABOVE THE ADJACENT GRADE AND IF THE CAPACITY DOES
NOT EXCEED 5,000 GALLONS.

8




RESOLUTION 2009 767
AUGUST 19, 2009

SECTION AG 105.2 - OUTDOOR SWIMMING POOL. IS HEREBY AMENDED TO READ AS
FOLLOWS:

#1 1S AMENDED BY THE DELETION OF FORTY-EIGHT INCHES (1219 MM) AND THE
INSERTION OF SIXTY INCHES (1524 MM).

#6 IS AMENDED BY THE DELETION OF 2-%: INCHES (57 MM) SQUARE AND THE
INSERTION OF 1 % INCHES (44 MM) SQUARE.

#8 FIRST SENTENCE IS AMENDED TO READ AS FOLLOWS:

8. ACCESS GATES SHALL COMPLY WITH THE REQUIREMENTS OF SECTION AG105.2,
ITEMS 1 THROUGH 7, AND SHALL BE SELF-CLOSING AND SELF-LATCHING.

SUBSECTION 8.1 IS AMENDED TO READ AS FOLLOWS:

8.1 THE RELEASE MECHANISM SHALL BE LOCATED ON THE POOLSIDE OF THE GATE
AT LEAST FIVE INCHES (127 MM) BELOW THE TOP OF THE GATE.

#9 1S REVISED BY THE ADDITION OF A NEW SECTION 9.4 TO READ AS FOLLOWS:

9.4 EMERGENCY ESCAPE AND RESCUE WINDOWS FOR SLEEPING ROOMS WHICH
FACE WITHIN A SWIMMING POOL ENCLOSURE SHALL BE EQUIPPED WITH A
LATCHING DEVICE LOCATED FIFTY-FOUR INCHES (1372 MM) ABOVE THE FLOOR. ALL
OTHER OPERABLE DWELLING UNIT WINDOWS FACING WITHIN THE SWIMMING POOL
ENCLOSURE SHALL BE EQUIPPED WITH SCREWED-IN-PLACE WIRE MESH SCREEN, A
KEYED LOCK THAT PREVENTS OPENING THE WINDOW MORE THAN FOUR INCHES
(102 MM), OR A LATCHING DEVICE LOCATED NOT LESS THAN FIFTY-FOUR INCHES
(1372 MM) ABOVE THE FLOOR.




